

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT  
EASTERN DISTRICT OF MICHIGAN  
NORTHERN DIVISION – BAY CITY

In re:

BOYCE HYDRO, LLC, *et al.*

Debtors.<sup>1</sup>

Chapter 11

Case No. 20-21214

Hon. Daniel S. Opperman

/

**LIQUIDATING TRUSTEE'S MOTION FOR ENTRY OF AN ORDER  
APPROVING FEES AND EXPENSES OF LIQUIDATING TRUSTEE AND  
PROFESSIONALS RETAINED BY LIQUIDATING TRUSTEE FOR THE  
PERIOD DECEMBER 1, 2022 THROUGH FEBRUARY 28, 2023**

The Liquidating Trustee of the Boyce Hydro Liquidating Trust, Scott A. Wolfson (“Liquidating Trustee”), through counsel, brings this *Motion For Entry Of An Order Approving Fees And Expenses Of Liquidating Trustee And Professionals Retained By Liquidating Trustee For The Period December 1, 2022 Through February, 2023* (“Approval Motion”).<sup>2</sup>

---

<sup>1</sup> The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, along with the last four digits of each Debtor's federal taxpayer-identification number, are: (i) Boyce Hydro, LLC (6694), Case No. 20-21214 and (ii) Boyce Hydro Power, LLC (3034), Case No. 20-21215.

<sup>2</sup> This Motion is filed pursuant to the procedures set forth in the *Order Establishing Procedures For Seeking Approval Of Fees And Expenses Of Liquidating Trustee And Professionals And Non-Professionals Retained By Liquidating Trustee* [Docket No. 531].

## **JURISDICTION AND VENUE**

1. The Bankruptcy Court has jurisdiction over this matter pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 157 and 1334 and Article XII of the *Fourth Modified Joint Consolidated Chapter 11 Plan of Liquidation* [Docket No. 481].
2. This is a core proceeding under 28 U.S.C. § 157(b).
3. Venue is proper in this district under 28 U.S.C. §§ 1408 and 1409.

## **BACKGROUND**

### **A. Case Background**

4. Debtors commenced voluntary cases under Chapter 11 of Title 11 of the United States Code on July 31, 2020.
5. On February 23, 2021, Debtors filed their *Fourth Modified Joint Consolidated Chapter 11 Plan of Liquidation* ("Plan").<sup>3</sup> [Docket No. 481].
6. On February 25, 2021, the Bankruptcy Court entered the *Non-Consensual Order Confirming Debtors' Fourth Modified Joint Consolidated Chapter 11 Plan of Liquidation* ("Confirmation Order"). [Docket No. 489].
7. The Confirmation Order approved the establishment of the Boyce Hydro Liquidating Trust ("Liquidating Trust") and Scott A. Wolfson's

---

<sup>3</sup> Capitalized terms used but not defined have the meanings given to them in the Plan or the Liquidating Trust Agreement, as applicable.

appointment as the Liquidating Trustee of the Liquidating Trust as of the Effective Date.

8. The Boyce Hydro Liquidating Trust Agreement [Docket No. 492-2] ("Liquidating Trust Agreement" or "LTA"), along with the Plan, governs the Liquidating Trust. [Plan Article VII.G].

9. The Effective Date of the Plan is March 3, 2021. [Docket No. 493].

**B. Retention of Professionals**

10. Under the Plan and the Liquidating Trust Agreement, the Liquidating Trustee is authorized to retain professionals and non-professionals to assist him and or the Liquidating Trust. See Plan Article VII.G; LTA Article 7.1. Since the Effective Date, the Liquidating Trustee has retained, with Court authorization, the following Professionals (as such term is defined in the Liquidating Trust Agreement) to assist him and/or the Liquidating Trust:

Name of Professional	Professional Services	Order Authorizing Employment
Wolfson Bolton PLLC	Legal Counsel	Docket No. 500
Stretto	Claims and Noticing Agent	Docket No. 515
Honigman LLP	Special Legal Counsel	Docket No. 523
Plante & Moran, PLLC	Tax Consulting, Tax Preparation, Accounting, and Real Estate Consulting	Docket No. 529
Steinhardt Pesick & Cohen, P.C.	Special Legal Counsel	Docket No. 593
Vanas Enterprises L.L.C.	Real Estate Broker	Docket No. 612
O'Keefe & Associates Consulting, LLC	Litigation Support	Docket No. 798 [Application Pending]

11. Under Article 3.1(a) of the Liquidating Trust Agreement, the Liquidating Trustee is to be compensated for “reasonable time spent subject to review and approval of such compensation by the Bankruptcy Court after notice and an opportunity to object.” [LTA Article 3.1(a)] (emphasis added).

12. Article 7.2 of the Liquidating Trust Agreement states:

Each Professional and Non-Professional retained by the Liquidating Trustee may be compensated by the Liquidating Trustee in accordance with the terms of their respective retention subject, in the case of all Professionals and for Non-Professionals

who will be paid more than \$15,000, to review and approval of the Bankruptcy Court. The Liquidating Trustee may object to fees and expenses of any Professional or Non-Professional with such objection to be resolved by the Bankruptcy Court if the parties are unable to reach a consensual resolution after good faith negotiations.

[LTA Article 7.2.] (emphasis added); see also LTA Article 2.5(8) (stating that the fees and expenses of professionals retained by the Liquidating Trustee be treated as Liquidating Trust Expenses to be paid “subject to review and approval of the Bankruptcy Court after notice and an opportunity to object”).

### **C. Fee Approval Motion**

13. On April 7, 2021, the Liquidating Trustee, through counsel, filed the *Liquidating Trustee’s Motion For Entry Of Order Establishing Procedures For Seeking Approval Of Fees And Expenses Of Liquidating Trustee And Professionals And Non-Professionals Retained By Liquidating Trustee*. [Docket No. 510].

14. On April 27, 2021, the Court entered the *Order Establishing Procedures For Seeking Approval Of Fees And Expenses Of Liquidating Trustee And Professionals And Non-Professionals Retained By Liquidating Trustee* (“Fee Approval Procedures Order”). [Docket No. 531].

15. In the Fee Approval Procedures Order, the Court, among other things, authorized the Liquidating Trustee to file motions with the Bankruptcy Court seeking (i) the approval of the fees and/or expenses of the Liquidating Trustee and/or (ii) the approval of the fees and/or expenses of one or more Professionals and/or Non-Professionals retained by the Liquidating Trustee. See Fee Approval Procedures Order ¶ 3(a).

16. Since the Effective Date, the Liquidating Trustee has worked diligently to carry out his duties under the Plan, the Confirmation Order, and the Liquidating Trust Agreement.

**D. Fees And Expenses Sought In This Approval Motion**

17. The time period covered by this Approval Motion is December 1, 2022 Through February 28, 2023 (“Fee Period”).

18. During the Fee Period, the Liquidating Trustee rendered the services described in, and incurred the expenses set forth in, the invoices attached hereto as Exhibit 6a.

19. The Liquidating Trustee submits that the cost of such services and expenses are reasonable and necessary expenses of administering the Liquidating Trust and, therefore, constitute “Liquidating Trust Expenses” as defined in the Plan. See Plan Article I.B.109.

20. During the Fee Period, Wolfson Bolton Kochis PLLC (“WBK”), Stretto, and Plante & Moran, PLLC (“PM”) (collectively, “Retained Professionals”) also rendered services to assist the Liquidating Trustee and/or the Liquidating Trust.

21. The Retained Professionals’ invoices for the Fee Period are attached to this Approval Motion as follows: (i) WBK invoices are attached as Exhibits 6b; Stretto invoices are attached as Exhibit 6c; and PM invoices are attached as Exhibit 6d.

22. The Liquidating Trustee has reviewed the Retained Professionals’ invoices and believes that the fees and expenses in the invoices are reasonable and necessary expenses of administering the Liquidating Trust and, therefore, constitute Liquidating Trust Expenses as defined in the Plan. See Plan Article I.B.109.

23. A breakdown of the fees and expenses sought during the Fee Period is as follows:

<u>Description</u>	<u>Dec-22</u>	<u>Jan-23</u>	<u>Feb-23</u>	
Liquidating Trustee Fees	\$ 1,935.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$11,475.00	<b>\$ 17,910.00</b>
Liquidating Trustee Expenses	\$ 41.60	\$ -	\$ 136.00	<b>\$ 177.60</b>
WBK Fees	\$13,692.00	\$22,965.50	\$52,515.00	<b>\$ 89,172.50</b>
WBK Expenses	\$ 250.24	\$ 469.17	\$ 847.51	<b>\$ 1,566.92</b>
PM Tax and Accounting Fees	\$ 1,733.00	\$ 1,360.00	\$ 1,395.00	<b>\$ 4,488.00</b>
PM Tax and Accounting Expenses	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	<b>\$ 129.00</b>
Stretto Fees	\$ 4,388.95	\$ 4,172.60	\$ 2,774.20	<b>\$ 11,335.75</b>
Stretto Expenses	\$ 759.24	\$ 1,373.11	\$ 1,888.29	<b>\$ 4,020.64</b>
<b>Total</b>	<b>\$22,843.03</b>	<b>\$34,883.38</b>	<b>\$71,074.00</b>	<b>\$128,800.41</b>

### **RELIEF REQUESTED**

24. The Liquidating Trustee requests entry of an order substantially in the form attached as Exhibit 1 approving the fees and expenses of the Liquidating Trustee and his Retained Professionals and authorizing the Liquidating Trustee to pay these fees and expenses.

## **BASIS FOR RELIEF REQUESTED**

25. The fees and expenses of the Liquidating Trustee and his Retained Professionals are reasonable and necessary expenses in administering the Liquidating Trust, and, therefore, should be approved.

26. During the Fee Period, and as more fully set forth in the invoices attached as Exhibit 6a to this Approval Motion, the Liquidating Trustee performed services related to overseeing continued litigation matters by the State of Michigan in the Ingham County Circuit Court and Western District of Michigan; review and analysis regarding pending adversary proceedings and attendance at mediation in the Kogan Law Group, P.C. adversary proceeding; review regarding amended tax returns of the Liquidating Trust; and attention to claims review and on-going reconciliation of claims.

27. During the Fee Period, and as more fully set forth in the invoices attached as Exhibit 6b to this Approval Motion, WBK performed services related to on-going defense of litigation cases by the State of Michigan in Ingham County and Western District of Michigan; coordination and discussion with PM regarding amended tax returns of the Liquidating Trust; and review, reconciliation, and analysis of proofs of claim on file.

28. During the Fee Period, and as more fully set forth in the invoices attached as Exhibit 6c to this Approval Motion, Stretto performed services related to maintenance and updating of the special service list; service and notice related to filings by the Liquidating Trustee; reconciliation and review regarding pre-distribution certifications (W-9 and OFAC forms); and review, analysis, and preparation and discussion with WBK regarding proof of claims regarding potential grounds for objection.

29. During the Fee Period, and as more fully set forth in the invoices attached as Exhibit 6d to this Approval Motion, PM performed services related to trust accounting activity and preparation and submission of amended tax return filings for the Liquidating Trust.

30. The Liquidating Trustee submits that the Liquidating Trustee's and his Retained Professionals' fees and expenses should be approved and the Liquidating Trustee should be authorized to pay such fees and expenses.

WHEREFORE, the Liquidating Trustee respectfully requests that the Court enter an order, substantially in the form attached as Exhibit 1, granting the relief requested in the Motion and grant the Liquidating Trustee such additional relief as is just and equitable.

Respectfully submitted,

WOLFSON BOLTON KOCHIS PLLC

Dated: March 16, 2023

By: /s/ Anthony J. Kochis

Anthony J. Kochis (P72020)

3150 Livernois, Suite 275

Troy, MI 48083

(248) 247-7105

[akochis@wolfsonbolton.com](mailto:akochis@wolfsonbolton.com)

Counsel for the Liquidating Trustee

## **EXHIBIT INDEX**

EXHIBIT 1	Proposed Order
EXHIBIT 2	Notice of Motion and Opportunity to Respond
EXHIBIT 3	n/a
EXHIBIT 4	Certificate of Service
EXHIBIT 5	n/a
EXHIBIT 6a	Liquidating Trustee Invoices
EXHIBIT 6b	Wolfson Bolton Kochis PLLC Invoices
EXHIBIT 6c	Stretto Invoices
EXHIBIT 6d	Plante & Moran, PLLC Invoices

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT  
EASTERN DISTRICT OF MICHIGAN  
NORTHERN DIVISION – BAY CITY

In re:

BOYCE HYDRO, LLC, *et al.*

Debtors.<sup>1</sup>

Chapter 11

Case No. 20-21214

Hon. Daniel S. Opperman

**ORDER APPROVING FEES AND EXPENSES OF  
LIQUIDATING TRUSTEE AND PROFESSIONALS RETAINED  
BY LIQUIDATING TRUSTEE FOR THE PERIOD  
DECEMBER 1, 2022 THROUGH FEBRUARY 28, 2023**

The Court having reviewed the *Liquidating Trustee's Motion For Entry  
Of An Order Approving Fees And Expenses Of Liquidating Trustee And  
Professionals Retained By Liquidating Trustee For The Period December  
1, 2022 Through February 28, 2023 ("Motion")*<sup>2</sup>; and the Court having found  
that: (a) jurisdiction to consider the Motion is proper under 28 U.S.C. §§  
157 and 1334 and Article XII of the *Fourth Modified Joint Consolidated  
Chapter 11 Plan of Liquidation* [Docket No. 481]; (b) venue is proper before  
this Court under 28 U.S.C. §§ 1408 and 1409; (c) notice of the Motion was  
properly provided; and (d) good cause exists to grant the relief requested in

---

<sup>1</sup> The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, along with the last four digits of each Debtor's federal taxpayer-identification number, are: (i) Boyce Hydro, LLC (6694), Case No. 20-21214 and (ii) Boyce Hydro Power, LLC (3034), Case No. 20-21215.

<sup>2</sup> Capitalized terms used but not defined have the meanings given to them in the Motion.

the Motion;

**IT IS HEREBY ORDERED** that:

1. The Motion is granted.
2. The fees and expenses for the period December 1, 2022 through February 28, 2023 as set forth in the Liquidating Trustee's and his Retained Professionals' invoices attached as Exhibits 6a through 6d to the Motion are approved.
3. The Liquidating Trustee is authorized to pay the fees and expenses as follows:
  - a. Liquidating Trustee fees of \$17,910.00 and Liquidating Trustee expenses of \$177.60;
  - b. WBK fees of \$89,172.50 and WBK expenses of \$1,566.92;
  - c. PM Tax and Accounting fees of \$4,488.00 and PM Tax and Account expenses of \$129.00 and
  - d. Stretto fees of \$11,335.75 and Stretto expenses of \$4,020.64.
4. This Court retains jurisdiction with respect to all matters arising from or related to the implementation, interpretation, and enforcement of this Order.

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT  
EASTERN DISTRICT OF MICHIGAN  
NORTHERN DIVISION – BAY CITY

In re:

BOYCE HYDRO, LLC, *et al.*  
Debtors.<sup>1</sup>

Chapter 11  
Case No. 20-21214  
Hon. Daniel S. Opperman

/

**NOTICE OF LIQUIDATING TRUSTEE'S MOTION FOR ENTRY OF AN  
ORDER APPROVING FEES AND EXPENSES OF LIQUIDATING  
TRUSTEE AND PROFESSIONALS RETAINED  
BY LIQUIDATING TRUSTEE FOR THE PERIOD  
DECEMBER 1, 2022 THROUGH FEBRUARY 28, 2023  
AND OPPORTUNITY TO RESPOND**

The Liquidating Trustee, Scott A. Wolfson, has filed papers with the Court seeking approval of fees and expenses of the Liquidating Trustee and the following professionals: Plante & Moran, PLLC, Wolfson Bolton Kochis PLLC, and Stretto. The request for approval of fees and expenses covers the period December 1, 2022 through February 28, 2023. A breakdown of the fees and expenses is as follows:

---

<sup>1</sup> The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, along with the last four digits of each Debtor's federal taxpayer-identification number, are: (i) Boyce Hydro, LLC (6694), Case No. 20-21214 and (ii) Boyce Hydro Power, LLC (3034), Case No. 20-21215.

<u>Description</u>	<u>Dec-22</u>	<u>Jan-23</u>	<u>Feb-23</u>	
Liquidating Trustee Fees	\$ 1,935.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$11,475.00	<b>\$ 17,910.00</b>
Liquidating Trustee Expenses	\$ 41.60	\$ -	\$ 136.00	<b>\$ 177.60</b>
WBK Fees	\$13,692.00	\$22,965.50	\$52,515.00	<b>\$ 89,172.50</b>
WBK Expenses	\$ 250.24	\$ 469.17	\$ 847.51	<b>\$ 1,566.92</b>
PM Tax and Accounting Fees	\$ 1,733.00	\$ 1,360.00	\$ 1,395.00	<b>\$ 4,488.00</b>
PM Tax and Accounting Expenses	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00	<b>\$ 129.00</b>
Stretto Fees	\$ 4,388.95	\$ 4,172.60	\$ 2,774.20	<b>\$ 11,335.75</b>
Stretto Expenses	\$ 759.24	\$ 1,373.11	\$ 1,888.29	<b>\$ 4,020.64</b>
<b>Total</b>	<b>\$22,843.03</b>	<b>\$34,883.38</b>	<b>\$71,074.00</b>	<b>\$128,800.41</b>

**Your rights may be affected. You should read these papers carefully and discuss them with your attorney, if you have one in this bankruptcy case. (If you do not have an attorney you may wish to consult one.)**

If you do not want the court to grant the relief requested in the Motion, or if you want the court to consider your views on the Motion, within **14 days**, you or your attorney must:

1. File with the court a written response of answer<sup>2</sup>, explaining your position at:

Street Address: United States Bankruptcy Court 111 First Street Bay City, Michigan 48708	Mailing Address: United States Bankruptcy Court P.O. Box 911 Bay City, Michigan 48707
---	--

If you mail your response to the court for filing, you must mail it early enough so the court will **receive** it on or before the date stated above. All attorneys are required to file pleadings electronically.

You must also mail a copy to:

Wolfson Bolton Kochis PLLC  
Attn: Anthony J. Kochis 3150  
Livernois, Suite 275  
Troy, MI 48083

2. If a response or answer is timely filed and served, the clerk will schedule a hearing on the Motion and you will be served with a notice of the date, time and location of the hearing.

**If you or your attorney do not take these steps, the court may decide that you do not oppose the relief sought in the Motion or objection and may enter an order granting that relief.**

---

<sup>2</sup> Any response or answer must comply with F. C. Civ. P. 8(b), (c), and (e).

Respectfully submitted,

WOLFSON BOLTON KOCHIS PLLC

Dated: March 16, 2023

By: /s/ Anthony J. Kochis  
Anthony J. Kochis (P72020)  
3150 Livernois, Suite 275  
Troy, MI 48083  
(248) 247-7105  
[akochis@wolfsonbolton.com](mailto:akochis@wolfsonbolton.com)

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT  
EASTERN DISTRICT OF MICHIGAN  
NORTHERN DIVISION – BAY CITY

In re:

BOYCE HYDRO, LLC, *et al.*

Debtors.<sup>1</sup>

Chapter 11

Case No. 20-21214

Hon. Daniel S. Opperman

**CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE**

I certify that, on March 16, 2023, I caused the *Liquidating Trustee's Motion For Entry Of An Order Approving Fees And Expenses Of Liquidating Trustee And Professionals Retained By Liquidating Trustee For The Period December 1, 2022 Through February 28, 2023* to be electronically filed with the Clerk of the Court using the ECF system, which sent notification of such filing to all ECF participants requesting electronic service, including the following:

Danielle Allison-Yokom on behalf of Creditor Michigan Department of Environment, Great Lakes, and Energy

[allison.yokom@Michigan.gov](mailto:allison.yokom@Michigan.gov),

[WierengaJ1@Michigan.gov](mailto:WierengaJ1@Michigan.gov); [GibsonJ16@Michigan.gov](mailto:GibsonJ16@Michigan.gov)

Danielle Allison-Yokom on behalf of Creditor Michigan Department of Natural Resources

[allison.yokom@Michigan.gov](mailto:allison.yokom@Michigan.gov),

---

<sup>1</sup> The Debtors in these chapter 11 cases, along with the last four digits of each Debtor's federal taxpayer-identification number, are: (i) Boyce Hydro, LLC (6694), Case No. 20-21214 and (ii) Boyce Hydro Power, LLC (3034), Case No. 20-21215.

[WierengaJ1@michigan.gov](mailto:WierengaJ1@michigan.gov); [GibsonJ16@michigan.gov](mailto:GibsonJ16@michigan.gov)

Sharon S. Almonrode on behalf of Creditor Sanford Hardware 1, LLC  
[ssa@millerlawpc.com](mailto:ssa@millerlawpc.com), [aad@millerlawpc.com](mailto:aad@millerlawpc.com); [gam@millerlawpc.com](mailto:gam@millerlawpc.com)

Sharon S. Almonrode on behalf of Creditor Cassandra Colley  
[ssa@millerlawpc.com](mailto:ssa@millerlawpc.com), [aad@millerlawpc.com](mailto:aad@millerlawpc.com); [gam@millerlawpc.com](mailto:gam@millerlawpc.com)

Sharon S. Almonrode on behalf of Creditor Charles Colley  
[ssa@millerlawpc.com](mailto:ssa@millerlawpc.com), [aad@millerlawpc.com](mailto:aad@millerlawpc.com); [gam@millerlawpc.com](mailto:gam@millerlawpc.com)

Sharon S. Almonrode on behalf of Creditor Matthew S. Smith  
[ssa@millerlawpc.com](mailto:ssa@millerlawpc.com), [aad@millerlawpc.com](mailto:aad@millerlawpc.com); [gam@millerlawpc.com](mailto:gam@millerlawpc.com)

Sharon S. Almonrode on behalf of Creditor Michael Mercer  
[ssa@millerlawpc.com](mailto:ssa@millerlawpc.com), [aad@millerlawpc.com](mailto:aad@millerlawpc.com); [gam@millerlawpc.com](mailto:gam@millerlawpc.com)

Rebekah L. Bailey on behalf of Creditor Cable Class Plaintiffs  
[bailey@nka.com](mailto:bailey@nka.com)

Jason W. Bank on behalf of Defendant U.S. Bank National Association  
[jbank@kerr-russell.com](mailto:jbank@kerr-russell.com), [ssmith@kerr-russell.com](mailto:ssmith@kerr-russell.com)

Michael E. Baum on behalf of Creditor Holly Johnson  
[mbaum@schaferandweiner.com](mailto:mbaum@schaferandweiner.com),  
[jburns@schaferandweiner.com](mailto:jburns@schaferandweiner.com); [nmack@schaferandweiner.com](mailto:nmack@schaferandweiner.com)

Michael E. Baum on behalf of Creditor Holly Kovacs  
[mbaum@schaferandweiner.com](mailto:mbaum@schaferandweiner.com),  
[jburns@schaferandweiner.com](mailto:jburns@schaferandweiner.com); [nmack@schaferandweiner.com](mailto:nmack@schaferandweiner.com)

Michael E. Baum on behalf of Creditor Kimberly Borchard  
[mbaum@schaferandweiner.com](mailto:mbaum@schaferandweiner.com),  
[jburns@schaferandweiner.com](mailto:jburns@schaferandweiner.com); [nmack@schaferandweiner.com](mailto:nmack@schaferandweiner.com)

Michael E. Baum on behalf of Creditor Robert Woods  
[mbaum@schaferandweiner.com](mailto:mbaum@schaferandweiner.com),  
[jburns@schaferandweiner.com](mailto:jburns@schaferandweiner.com); [nmack@schaferandweiner.com](mailto:nmack@schaferandweiner.com)

Michael E. Baum on behalf of Creditor Timothy D. Dana

[mbaum@schaferandweiner.com](mailto:mbaum@schaferandweiner.com),  
[jburns@schaferandweiner.com](mailto:jburns@schaferandweiner.com);[nmack@schaferandweiner.com](mailto:nmack@schaferandweiner.com)

Kimberly Bedigian on behalf of Creditor Sanford Hardware 1, LLC  
[kbedigian@sbplclaw.com](mailto:kbedigian@sbplclaw.com)

Kimberly Bedigian on behalf of Creditor The Mass Coalition  
[kbedigian@sbplclaw.com](mailto:kbedigian@sbplclaw.com)

Kimberly Bedigian on behalf of Creditor Cassandra Colley  
[kbedigian@sbplclaw.com](mailto:kbedigian@sbplclaw.com)

Kimberly Bedigian on behalf of Creditor Charles Colley  
[kbedigian@sbplclaw.com](mailto:kbedigian@sbplclaw.com)

Kimberly Bedigian on behalf of Creditor Matthew S. Smith  
[kbedigian@sbplclaw.com](mailto:kbedigian@sbplclaw.com)

Kimberly Bedigian on behalf of Creditor Michael Mercer  
[kbedigian@sbplclaw.com](mailto:kbedigian@sbplclaw.com)

Jayson E. Blake on behalf of Creditor Alicia Mrdutt  
[jeblake@mcalpinepc.com](mailto:jeblake@mcalpinepc.com), [mlmcalpine@mcalpinepc.com](mailto:mlmcalpine@mcalpinepc.com)

Jayson E. Blake on behalf of Creditor Dana Ralko  
[jeblake@mcalpinepc.com](mailto:jeblake@mcalpinepc.com), [mlmcalpine@mcalpinepc.com](mailto:mlmcalpine@mcalpinepc.com)

Jayson E. Blake on behalf of Creditor David Phillips  
[jeblake@mcalpinepc.com](mailto:jeblake@mcalpinepc.com), [mlmcalpine@mcalpinepc.com](mailto:mlmcalpine@mcalpinepc.com)

Jayson E. Blake on behalf of Creditor James Mrdutt  
[jeblake@mcalpinepc.com](mailto:jeblake@mcalpinepc.com), [mlmcalpine@mcalpinepc.com](mailto:mlmcalpine@mcalpinepc.com)

Jayson E. Blake on behalf of Creditor Joe Bruneau  
[jeblake@mcalpinepc.com](mailto:jeblake@mcalpinepc.com), [mlmcalpine@mcalpinepc.com](mailto:mlmcalpine@mcalpinepc.com)

Jayson E. Blake on behalf of Creditor Mary Randall  
[jeblake@mcalpinepc.com](mailto:jeblake@mcalpinepc.com), [mlmcalpine@mcalpinepc.com](mailto:mlmcalpine@mcalpinepc.com)

Jayson E. Blake on behalf of Creditor Osro Randall

[jblake@mcalpinepc.com](mailto:jblake@mcalpinepc.com), [mlmcalpine@mcalpinepc.com](mailto:mlmcalpine@mcalpinepc.com)

Jayson E. Blake on behalf of Creditor Patty Ralko  
[jblake@mcalpinepc.com](mailto:jblake@mcalpinepc.com), [mlmcalpine@mcalpinepc.com](mailto:mlmcalpine@mcalpinepc.com)

Ian S. Bolton on behalf of Creditor Karl Kacel  
[ianboltonlaw@gmail.com](mailto:ianboltonlaw@gmail.com), [barbie51766@gmail.com](mailto:barbie51766@gmail.com)

Howard M. Borin on behalf of Creditor Holly Johnson  
[hborin@schaferandweiner.com](mailto:hborin@schaferandweiner.com),  
[jburns@schaferandweiner.com;nmack@schaferandweiner.com](mailto:jburns@schaferandweiner.com;nmack@schaferandweiner.com)

Howard M. Borin on behalf of Creditor Holly Kovacs  
[hborin@schaferandweiner.com](mailto:hborin@schaferandweiner.com),  
[jburns@schaferandweiner.com;nmack@schaferandweiner.com](mailto:jburns@schaferandweiner.com;nmack@schaferandweiner.com)

Howard M. Borin on behalf of Creditor Kimberly Borchard  
[hborin@schaferandweiner.com](mailto:hborin@schaferandweiner.com),  
[jburns@schaferandweiner.com;nmack@schaferandweiner.com](mailto:jburns@schaferandweiner.com;nmack@schaferandweiner.com)

Howard M. Borin on behalf of Creditor Robert Woods  
[hborin@schaferandweiner.com](mailto:hborin@schaferandweiner.com),  
[jburns@schaferandweiner.com;nmack@schaferandweiner.com](mailto:jburns@schaferandweiner.com;nmack@schaferandweiner.com)

Howard M. Borin on behalf of Creditor Timothy D. Dana  
[hborin@schaferandweiner.com](mailto:hborin@schaferandweiner.com),  
[jburns@schaferandweiner.com;nmack@schaferandweiner.com](mailto:jburns@schaferandweiner.com;nmack@schaferandweiner.com)

Charles D. Bullock on behalf of Creditor Sanford Hardware 1, LLC  
[cbullock@sbplclaw.com](mailto:cbullock@sbplclaw.com), [lhaas@sbplclaw.com](mailto:lhaas@sbplclaw.com)

Charles D. Bullock on behalf of Creditor The Mass Coalition  
[cbullock@sbplclaw.com](mailto:cbullock@sbplclaw.com), [lhaas@sbplclaw.com](mailto:lhaas@sbplclaw.com)

Charles D. Bullock on behalf of Creditor Adam Riggie  
[cbullock@sbplclaw.com](mailto:cbullock@sbplclaw.com), [lhaas@sbplclaw.com](mailto:lhaas@sbplclaw.com)

Charles D. Bullock on behalf of Creditor Adrian Wise  
[cbullock@sbplclaw.com](mailto:cbullock@sbplclaw.com), [lhaas@sbplclaw.com](mailto:lhaas@sbplclaw.com)

Charles D. Bullock on behalf of Creditor Amy Kaylor  
[cbullock@sbplclaw.com](mailto:cbullock@sbplclaw.com), [lhaas@sbplclaw.com](mailto:lhaas@sbplclaw.com)

Charles D. Bullock on behalf of Creditor Cassandra Colley  
[cbullock@sbplclaw.com](mailto:cbullock@sbplclaw.com), [lhaas@sbplclaw.com](mailto:lhaas@sbplclaw.com)

Charles D. Bullock on behalf of Creditor Charles Colley  
[cbullock@sbplclaw.com](mailto:cbullock@sbplclaw.com), [lhaas@sbplclaw.com](mailto:lhaas@sbplclaw.com)

Charles D. Bullock on behalf of Creditor Jeffrey Kaylor  
[cbullock@sbplclaw.com](mailto:cbullock@sbplclaw.com), [lhaas@sbplclaw.com](mailto:lhaas@sbplclaw.com)

Charles D. Bullock on behalf of Creditor Jillian Wise  
[cbullock@sbplclaw.com](mailto:cbullock@sbplclaw.com), [lhaas@sbplclaw.com](mailto:lhaas@sbplclaw.com)

Charles D. Bullock on behalf of Creditor Matthew S. Smith  
[cbullock@sbplclaw.com](mailto:cbullock@sbplclaw.com), [lhaas@sbplclaw.com](mailto:lhaas@sbplclaw.com)

Charles D. Bullock on behalf of Creditor Michael Mercer  
[cbullock@sbplclaw.com](mailto:cbullock@sbplclaw.com), [lhaas@sbplclaw.com](mailto:lhaas@sbplclaw.com)

Jacob Carlton on behalf of Creditor Mike and Lisa McGaugh  
[carltonj@millerjohnson.com](mailto:carltonj@millerjohnson.com),  
[9688700420@filings.docketbird.com](mailto:9688700420@filings.docketbird.com); [ecfpigginsj@millerjohnson.com](mailto:ecfpigginsj@millerjohnson.com)

Philip T. Carroll on behalf of Creditor Allianz Global Corporate & Specialty SE  
[pcarroll@cozen.com](mailto:pcarroll@cozen.com),  
[jgoeing@cozen.com](mailto:jgoeing@cozen.com); [mpolicastro@cozen.com](mailto:mpolicastro@cozen.com); [philip-carroll-5601@ecf.pacerpro.com](mailto:philip-carroll-5601@ecf.pacerpro.com)

Philip T. Carroll on behalf of Creditor American Bankers Insurance Company of Florida  
[pcarroll@cozen.com](mailto:pcarroll@cozen.com),  
[jgoeing@cozen.com](mailto:jgoeing@cozen.com); [mpolicastro@cozen.com](mailto:mpolicastro@cozen.com); [philip-carroll-5601@ecf.pacerpro.com](mailto:philip-carroll-5601@ecf.pacerpro.com)

Philip T. Carroll on behalf of Creditor American Security Insurance Company  
[pcarroll@cozen.com](mailto:pcarroll@cozen.com),

[jgoeing@cozen.com](mailto:jgoeing@cozen.com); [mpolicastro@cozen.com](mailto:mpolicastro@cozen.com); [philip-carroll-5601@ecf.pacerpro.com](mailto:philip-carroll-5601@ecf.pacerpro.com)

Philip T. Carroll on behalf of Creditor American Strategic Insurance Corporation

[pcarroll@cozen.com](mailto:pcarroll@cozen.com),

[jgoeing@cozen.com](mailto:jgoeing@cozen.com); [mpolicastro@cozen.com](mailto:mpolicastro@cozen.com); [philip-carroll-5601@ecf.pacerpro.com](mailto:philip-carroll-5601@ecf.pacerpro.com)

Philip T. Carroll on behalf of Creditor Frankenmuth Mutual Insurance Company

[pcarroll@cozen.com](mailto:pcarroll@cozen.com),

[jgoeing@cozen.com](mailto:jgoeing@cozen.com); [mpolicastro@cozen.com](mailto:mpolicastro@cozen.com); [philip-carroll-5601@ecf.pacerpro.com](mailto:philip-carroll-5601@ecf.pacerpro.com)

Philip T. Carroll on behalf of Creditor Great American Insurance Company of New York

[pcarroll@cozen.com](mailto:pcarroll@cozen.com),

[jgoeing@cozen.com](mailto:jgoeing@cozen.com); [mpolicastro@cozen.com](mailto:mpolicastro@cozen.com); [philip-carroll-5601@ecf.pacerpro.com](mailto:philip-carroll-5601@ecf.pacerpro.com)

Philip T. Carroll on behalf of Creditor Hiscox Syndicates Limited

[pcarroll@cozen.com](mailto:pcarroll@cozen.com),

[jgoeing@cozen.com](mailto:jgoeing@cozen.com); [mpolicastro@cozen.com](mailto:mpolicastro@cozen.com); [philip-carroll-5601@ecf.pacerpro.com](mailto:philip-carroll-5601@ecf.pacerpro.com)

Philip T. Carroll on behalf of Creditor Liberty Mutual Insurance Company

[pcarroll@cozen.com](mailto:pcarroll@cozen.com),

[jgoeing@cozen.com](mailto:jgoeing@cozen.com); [mpolicastro@cozen.com](mailto:mpolicastro@cozen.com); [philip-carroll-5601@ecf.pacerpro.com](mailto:philip-carroll-5601@ecf.pacerpro.com)

Philip T. Carroll on behalf of Creditor Marathon Insurance Company

[pcarroll@cozen.com](mailto:pcarroll@cozen.com),

[jgoeing@cozen.com](mailto:jgoeing@cozen.com); [mpolicastro@cozen.com](mailto:mpolicastro@cozen.com); [philip-carroll-5601@ecf.pacerpro.com](mailto:philip-carroll-5601@ecf.pacerpro.com)

Philip T. Carroll on behalf of Creditor Michigan Insurance Company

[pcarroll@cozen.com](mailto:pcarroll@cozen.com),

[jgoeing@cozen.com](mailto:jgoeing@cozen.com); [mpolicastro@cozen.com](mailto:mpolicastro@cozen.com); [philip-carroll-5601@ecf.pacerpro.com](mailto:philip-carroll-5601@ecf.pacerpro.com)

Philip T. Carroll on behalf of Creditor Safeco Insurance Company  
[pcarroll@cozen.com](mailto:pcarroll@cozen.com),  
[jgoeing@cozen.com](mailto:jgoeing@cozen.com); [mpolicastro@cozen.com](mailto:mpolicastro@cozen.com); [philip-carroll-5601@ecf.pacerpro.com](mailto:philip-carroll-5601@ecf.pacerpro.com)

Philip T. Carroll on behalf of Creditor State Farm Mutual Automobile Insurance Company  
[pcarroll@cozen.com](mailto:pcarroll@cozen.com),  
[jgoeing@cozen.com](mailto:jgoeing@cozen.com); [mpolicastro@cozen.com](mailto:mpolicastro@cozen.com); [philip-carroll-5601@ecf.pacerpro.com](mailto:philip-carroll-5601@ecf.pacerpro.com)

Philip T. Carroll on behalf of Creditor Westport Insurance Corporation  
[pcarroll@cozen.com](mailto:pcarroll@cozen.com),  
[jgoeing@cozen.com](mailto:jgoeing@cozen.com); [mpolicastro@cozen.com](mailto:mpolicastro@cozen.com); [philip-carroll-5601@ecf.pacerpro.com](mailto:philip-carroll-5601@ecf.pacerpro.com)

Kimberly Ross Clayson on behalf of Defendant The Kogan Law Group, P.C.  
[kclayson@jaffelaw.com](mailto:kclayson@jaffelaw.com)

Elliot G. Crowder on behalf of Creditor Sanford Hardware 1, LLC  
[ecrowder@sbplclaw.com](mailto:ecrowder@sbplclaw.com), [lhaas@sbplclaw.com](mailto:lhaas@sbplclaw.com)

Elliot G. Crowder on behalf of Creditor The Mass Coalition  
[ecrowder@sbplclaw.com](mailto:ecrowder@sbplclaw.com), [lhaas@sbplclaw.com](mailto:lhaas@sbplclaw.com)

Elliot G. Crowder on behalf of Creditor Adam Riggie  
[ecrowder@sbplclaw.com](mailto:ecrowder@sbplclaw.com), [lhaas@sbplclaw.com](mailto:lhaas@sbplclaw.com)

Elliot G. Crowder on behalf of Creditor Adrian Wise  
[ecrowder@sbplclaw.com](mailto:ecrowder@sbplclaw.com), [lhaas@sbplclaw.com](mailto:lhaas@sbplclaw.com)

Elliot G. Crowder on behalf of Creditor Amy Kaylor  
[ecrowder@sbplclaw.com](mailto:ecrowder@sbplclaw.com), [lhaas@sbplclaw.com](mailto:lhaas@sbplclaw.com)

Elliot G. Crowder on behalf of Creditor Cassandra Colley  
[ecrowder@sbplclaw.com](mailto:ecrowder@sbplclaw.com), [lhaas@sbplclaw.com](mailto:lhaas@sbplclaw.com)

Elliot G. Crowder on behalf of Creditor Charles Colley  
[ecrowder@sbplclaw.com](mailto:ecrowder@sbplclaw.com), [lhaas@sbplclaw.com](mailto:lhaas@sbplclaw.com)

Elliot G. Crowder on behalf of Creditor Jeffrey Kaylor  
[ecrowder@sbplclaw.com](mailto:ecrowder@sbplclaw.com), [lhaas@sbplclaw.com](mailto:lhaas@sbplclaw.com)

Elliot G. Crowder on behalf of Creditor Jillian Wise  
[ecrowder@sbplclaw.com](mailto:ecrowder@sbplclaw.com), [lhaas@sbplclaw.com](mailto:lhaas@sbplclaw.com)

Elliot G. Crowder on behalf of Creditor Matthew S. Smith  
[ecrowder@sbplclaw.com](mailto:ecrowder@sbplclaw.com), [lhaas@sbplclaw.com](mailto:lhaas@sbplclaw.com)

Elliot G. Crowder on behalf of Creditor Michael Mercer  
[ecrowder@sbplclaw.com](mailto:ecrowder@sbplclaw.com), [lhaas@sbplclaw.com](mailto:lhaas@sbplclaw.com)

David Dubin on behalf of Creditor Debra Kroening  
[ddubin@ldclassaction.com](mailto:ddubin@ldclassaction.com)

Nathan A. Gambill on behalf of Creditor Michigan Department of Environment, Great Lakes, and Energy  
[GambillN@michigan.gov](mailto:GambillN@michigan.gov),  
[WierengaJ1@michigan.gov](mailto:WierengaJ1@michigan.gov); [Gibson16@michigan.gov](mailto:Gibson16@michigan.gov)

Nathan A. Gambill on behalf of Creditor Michigan Department of Natural Resources  
[GambillN@michigan.gov](mailto:GambillN@michigan.gov),  
[WierengaJ1@michigan.gov](mailto:WierengaJ1@michigan.gov); [Gibson16@michigan.gov](mailto:Gibson16@michigan.gov)

Celeste R. Gill on behalf of Creditor Michigan Department of Environment, Great Lakes, and Energy  
[gillc1@michigan.gov](mailto:gillc1@michigan.gov), [WierengaJ1@michigan.gov](mailto:WierengaJ1@michigan.gov)

Celeste R. Gill on behalf of Creditor Michigan Department of Natural Resources  
[gillc1@michigan.gov](mailto:gillc1@michigan.gov), [WierengaJ1@michigan.gov](mailto:WierengaJ1@michigan.gov)

Rozanne M. Giunta on behalf of Creditor Four Lakes Task Force  
[rgiunta@wnj.com](mailto:rgiunta@wnj.com),  
[scardinal@wnj.com](mailto:scardinal@wnj.com); [GuintaRR81911@notify.bestcase.com](mailto:GuintaRR81911@notify.bestcase.com)

Paul R. Hage on behalf of Defendant The Kogan Law Group, P.C.  
[phage@jaffelaw.com](mailto:phage@jaffelaw.com), [tneddermeyer@jaffelaw.com](mailto:tneddermeyer@jaffelaw.com)

Robert J. Hahn on behalf of Creditor Gladwin County  
[rhahn@cmda-law.com](mailto:rhahn@cmda-law.com), [kueberroth@cmda-law.com](mailto:kueberroth@cmda-law.com); [bmccarty@cmda-law.com](mailto:bmccarty@cmda-law.com)

Robert J. Hahn on behalf of Creditor Midland County  
[rhahn@cmda-law.com](mailto:rhahn@cmda-law.com), [kueberroth@cmda-law.com](mailto:kueberroth@cmda-law.com); [bmccarty@cmda-law.com](mailto:bmccarty@cmda-law.com)

Ernest Hassan on behalf of Creditor Sanford Hardware 1, LLC  
[ehassan@sbplclaw.com](mailto:ehassan@sbplclaw.com), [lhaas@sbplclaw.com](mailto:lhaas@sbplclaw.com)

Ernest Hassan on behalf of Creditor Cassandra Colley  
[ehassan@sbplclaw.com](mailto:ehassan@sbplclaw.com), [lhaas@sbplclaw.com](mailto:lhaas@sbplclaw.com)

Ernest Hassan on behalf of Creditor Charles Colley  
[ehassan@sbplclaw.com](mailto:ehassan@sbplclaw.com), [lhaas@sbplclaw.com](mailto:lhaas@sbplclaw.com)

Ernest Hassan on behalf of Creditor Matthew S. Smith  
[ehassan@sbplclaw.com](mailto:ehassan@sbplclaw.com), [lhaas@sbplclaw.com](mailto:lhaas@sbplclaw.com)

Ernest Hassan on behalf of Creditor Michael Mercer  
[ehassan@sbplclaw.com](mailto:ehassan@sbplclaw.com), [lhaas@sbplclaw.com](mailto:lhaas@sbplclaw.com)

Ronna G. Jackson on behalf of U.S. Trustee Andrew R. Vara  
[Ronna.G.Jackson@usdoj.gov](mailto:Ronna.G.Jackson@usdoj.gov)

Henry L. Knier, Jr. on behalf of Creditor Gerace Construction Company  
[bankruptcy@smplklaw.com](mailto:bankruptcy@smplklaw.com), [hknier@smplklaw.com](mailto:hknier@smplklaw.com)

Anthony J. Kochis on behalf of Accountant Thomas A. Risi  
[akochis@wolfsonbolton.com](mailto:akochis@wolfsonbolton.com), [stravis@wolfsonbolton.com](mailto:stravis@wolfsonbolton.com)

Anthony J. Kochis on behalf of Liquidating Trustee Scott A. Wolfson  
[akochis@wolfsonbolton.com](mailto:akochis@wolfsonbolton.com), [stravis@wolfsonbolton.com](mailto:stravis@wolfsonbolton.com)

Anthony J. Kochis on behalf of Other Professional Stretto

[akochis@wolfsonbolton.com](mailto:akochis@wolfsonbolton.com), [stravis@wolfsonbolton.com](mailto:stravis@wolfsonbolton.com)

Anthony J. Kochis on behalf of Plaintiff Scott A. Wolfson  
[akochis@wolfsonbolton.com](mailto:akochis@wolfsonbolton.com), [stravis@wolfsonbolton.com](mailto:stravis@wolfsonbolton.com)

Anthony J. Kochis on behalf of Special Counsel H. Adam Cohen  
[akochis@wolfsonbolton.com](mailto:akochis@wolfsonbolton.com), [stravis@wolfsonbolton.com](mailto:stravis@wolfsonbolton.com)

Lawrence A Kogan on behalf of Creditor Lee Mueller  
[lkogan@koganlawgroup.com](mailto:lkogan@koganlawgroup.com)

Lawrence A Kogan on behalf of Creditor Michele Mueller  
[lkogan@koganlawgroup.com](mailto:lkogan@koganlawgroup.com)

Scott Kwiatkowski on behalf of Creditor Homrich Edenville Dam Class Plaintiffs  
[scott@bk-lawyer.net](mailto:scott@bk-lawyer.net)

Jonathan E. Lauderbach on behalf of Creditor Four Lakes Task Force  
[jlauderbach@wnj.com](mailto:jlauderbach@wnj.com)

Jonathan E. Lauderbach on behalf of Creditor Gerace Construction Company  
[jlauderbach@wnj.com](mailto:jlauderbach@wnj.com)

Michael D. Lieberman on behalf of Creditor Adam Riggie  
[MLieberman@lipsonneilson.com](mailto:MLieberman@lipsonneilson.com),  
[LOMeara@lipsonneilson.com;Mlieberman6160@yahoo.com](mailto:LOMeara@lipsonneilson.com;Mlieberman6160@yahoo.com)

Michael D. Lieberman on behalf of Creditor Adrian Wise  
[MLieberman@lipsonneilson.com](mailto:MLieberman@lipsonneilson.com),  
[LOMeara@lipsonneilson.com;Mlieberman6160@yahoo.com](mailto:LOMeara@lipsonneilson.com;Mlieberman6160@yahoo.com)

Michael D. Lieberman on behalf of Creditor Amy Kaylor  
[MLieberman@lipsonneilson.com](mailto:MLieberman@lipsonneilson.com),  
[LOMeara@lipsonneilson.com;Mlieberman6160@yahoo.com](mailto:LOMeara@lipsonneilson.com;Mlieberman6160@yahoo.com)

Michael D. Lieberman on behalf of Creditor Jeffrey Kaylor  
[MLieberman@lipsonneilson.com](mailto:MLieberman@lipsonneilson.com),  
[LOMeara@lipsonneilson.com;Mlieberman6160@yahoo.com](mailto:LOMeara@lipsonneilson.com;Mlieberman6160@yahoo.com)

Michael D. Lieberman on behalf of Creditor Jillian Wise  
[MLieberman@lipsonneilson.com](mailto:MLieberman@lipsonneilson.com),  
[LOMeara@lipsonneilson.com](mailto:LOMeara@lipsonneilson.com); [MLieberman6160@yahoo.com](mailto:MLieberman6160@yahoo.com)

Leon N. Mayer on behalf of Creditor Holly Johnson  
[Inmayer@schaferandweiner.com](mailto:Inmayer@schaferandweiner.com), [lfernandez@schaferandweiner.com](mailto:lfernandez@schaferandweiner.com)

Leon N. Mayer on behalf of Creditor Holly Kovacs  
[Inmayer@schaferandweiner.com](mailto:Inmayer@schaferandweiner.com), [lfernandez@schaferandweiner.com](mailto:lfernandez@schaferandweiner.com)

Leon N. Mayer on behalf of Creditor Kimberly Borchard  
[Inmayer@schaferandweiner.com](mailto:Inmayer@schaferandweiner.com), [lfernandez@schaferandweiner.com](mailto:lfernandez@schaferandweiner.com)

Leon N. Mayer on behalf of Creditor Robert Woods  
[Inmayer@schaferandweiner.com](mailto:Inmayer@schaferandweiner.com), [lfernandez@schaferandweiner.com](mailto:lfernandez@schaferandweiner.com)

Leon N. Mayer on behalf of Creditor Timothy D. Dana  
[Inmayer@schaferandweiner.com](mailto:Inmayer@schaferandweiner.com), [lfernandez@schaferandweiner.com](mailto:lfernandez@schaferandweiner.com)

Mark L. McAlpine on behalf of Creditor Alicia Mrdutt  
[mlmcalpine@mcalpinelawfirm.com](mailto:mlmcalpine@mcalpinelawfirm.com), [dajaworski@mcalpinepc.com](mailto:dajaworski@mcalpinepc.com)

Mark L. McAlpine on behalf of Creditor Dana Ralko  
[mlmcalpine@mcalpinelawfirm.com](mailto:mlmcalpine@mcalpinelawfirm.com), [dajaworski@mcalpinepc.com](mailto:dajaworski@mcalpinepc.com)

Mark L. McAlpine on behalf of Creditor David Phillips  
[mlmcalpine@mcalpinelawfirm.com](mailto:mlmcalpine@mcalpinelawfirm.com), [dajaworski@mcalpinepc.com](mailto:dajaworski@mcalpinepc.com)

Mark L. McAlpine on behalf of Creditor James Mrdutt  
[mlmcalpine@mcalpinelawfirm.com](mailto:mlmcalpine@mcalpinelawfirm.com), [dajaworski@mcalpinepc.com](mailto:dajaworski@mcalpinepc.com)

Mark L. McAlpine on behalf of Creditor Joe Bruneau  
[mlmcalpine@mcalpinelawfirm.com](mailto:mlmcalpine@mcalpinelawfirm.com), [dajaworski@mcalpinepc.com](mailto:dajaworski@mcalpinepc.com)

Mark L. McAlpine on behalf of Creditor Mary Randall  
[mlmcalpine@mcalpinelawfirm.com](mailto:mlmcalpine@mcalpinelawfirm.com), [dajaworski@mcalpinepc.com](mailto:dajaworski@mcalpinepc.com)

Mark L. McAlpine on behalf of Creditor Osro Randall  
[mlmcalpine@mcalpinelawfirm.com](mailto:mlmcalpine@mcalpinelawfirm.com), [dajaworski@mcalpinepc.com](mailto:dajaworski@mcalpinepc.com)

Mark L. McAlpine on behalf of Creditor Patty Ralko  
[mlmcalpine@mcalpinelawfirm.com](mailto:mlmcalpine@mcalpinelawfirm.com), [dajaworski@mcalpinepc.com](mailto:dajaworski@mcalpinepc.com)

Matthew E. McClintock on behalf of Debtor In Possession Boyce Hydro Power, LLC  
[MATTM@GOLDMCLAW.COM](mailto:MATTM@GOLDMCLAW.COM),  
[teresag@restructuringshop.com](mailto:teresag@restructuringshop.com); [ericg@goldmclaw.com](mailto:ericg@goldmclaw.com)

Matthew E. McClintock on behalf of Debtor In Possession Boyce Hydro, LLC  
[MATTM@GOLDMCLAW.COM](mailto:MATTM@GOLDMCLAW.COM),  
[teresag@restructuringshop.com](mailto:teresag@restructuringshop.com); [ericg@goldmclaw.com](mailto:ericg@goldmclaw.com)

Matthew E. McClintock on behalf of Interested Party Boyce Hydro Power, LLC  
[MATTM@GOLDMCLAW.COM](mailto:MATTM@GOLDMCLAW.COM),  
[teresag@restructuringshop.com](mailto:teresag@restructuringshop.com); [ericg@goldmclaw.com](mailto:ericg@goldmclaw.com)

Ralph E. McDowell on behalf of Creditor Brad Phillion  
[rmcdowell@bodmanlaw.com](mailto:rmcdowell@bodmanlaw.com)

Ralph E. McDowell on behalf of Creditor Daryl Zelenak  
[rmcdowell@bodmanlaw.com](mailto:rmcdowell@bodmanlaw.com)

Ralph E. McDowell on behalf of Creditor Gorgia Masouridis Moore  
[rmcdowell@bodmanlaw.com](mailto:rmcdowell@bodmanlaw.com)

Ralph E. McDowell on behalf of Creditor Heidi Kidd  
[rmcdowell@bodmanlaw.com](mailto:rmcdowell@bodmanlaw.com)

Ralph E. McDowell on behalf of Creditor James Beath  
[rmcdowell@bodmanlaw.com](mailto:rmcdowell@bodmanlaw.com)

Ralph E. McDowell on behalf of Creditor James Paquette  
[rmcdowell@bodmanlaw.com](mailto:rmcdowell@bodmanlaw.com)

Ralph E. McDowell on behalf of Creditor Michelle Hill  
[rmcdowell@bodmanlaw.com](mailto:rmcdowell@bodmanlaw.com)

Ralph E. McDowell on behalf of Creditor Mike Callan  
[rmcowell@bodmanlaw.com](mailto:rmcowell@bodmanlaw.com)

Ralph E. McDowell on behalf of Creditor Regan Wieland  
[rmcowell@bodmanlaw.com](mailto:rmcowell@bodmanlaw.com)

Ralph E. McDowell on behalf of Creditor Suzette Gay Zelenak  
[rmcowell@bodmanlaw.com](mailto:rmcowell@bodmanlaw.com)

Daniel R Merkle on behalf of Creditor Stephen Hultberg  
[danm@msfseattle.com](mailto:danm@msfseattle.com)

Daniel R Merkle on behalf of Defendant Helen's Holdings, LLC  
[danm@msfseattle.com](mailto:danm@msfseattle.com)

Matthew Hale Morgan on behalf of Creditor Cable Class Plaintiffs  
[morgan@nka.com](mailto:morgan@nka.com)

Bruce N. Moss on behalf of Creditor Affiliated FM Insurance Company  
[bmooss@dt-law.com](mailto:bmooss@dt-law.com)

Bruce N. Moss on behalf of Creditor Altman Management, LLC  
[bmooss@dt-law.com](mailto:bmooss@dt-law.com)

Bruce N. Moss on behalf of Creditor American Guarantee and Liability Insurance Company  
[bmooss@dt-law.com](mailto:bmooss@dt-law.com)

Bruce N. Moss on behalf of Creditor Axis Surplus  
[bmooss@dt-law.com](mailto:bmooss@dt-law.com)

Bruce N. Moss on behalf of Creditor Certain Underwriters-Lloyd's  
[bmooss@dt-law.com](mailto:bmooss@dt-law.com)

Bruce N. Moss on behalf of Creditor Certain Underwriters-Lloyd's-  
DNAPF006484-00-Tri-City  
[bmooss@dt-law.com](mailto:bmooss@dt-law.com)

Bruce N. Moss on behalf of Creditor Certain Underwriters-Lloyd's-  
MIFL00631003-Michels

[bmooss@dt-law.com](mailto:bmooss@dt-law.com)

Bruce N. Moss on behalf of Creditor Certain Underwriters-Lloyd's-  
NCIP303385-2020-Reaume  
[bmooss@dt-law.com](mailto:bmooss@dt-law.com)

Bruce N. Moss on behalf of Creditor Certain Underwriters-Lloyd's-  
NCIP407517-2019-Harris  
[bmooss@dt-law.com](mailto:bmooss@dt-law.com)

Bruce N. Moss on behalf of Creditor Certain Underwriters-Lloyd's-  
NCIP427616-2019-Gehrckhe  
[bmooss@dt-law.com](mailto:bmooss@dt-law.com)

Bruce N. Moss on behalf of Creditor Certain Underwriters-Lloyd's-  
NCIP576330-2019-Sprague  
[bmooss@dt-law.com](mailto:bmooss@dt-law.com)

Bruce N. Moss on behalf of Creditor Certain Underwriters-Lloyd's-  
NCIP616384-Thomas  
[bmooss@dt-law.com](mailto:bmooss@dt-law.com)

Bruce N. Moss on behalf of Creditor Certain Underwriters-Lloyd's-  
NCIP648136-2019-Chad  
[bmooss@dt-law.com](mailto:bmooss@dt-law.com)

Bruce N. Moss on behalf of Creditor Certain Underwriters-Lloyd's-  
NCIP660734-2019-Huver  
[bmooss@dt-law.com](mailto:bmooss@dt-law.com)

Bruce N. Moss on behalf of Creditor Certain Underwriters-Lloyd's-  
NCIP750302-Kabat  
[bmooss@dt-law.com](mailto:bmooss@dt-law.com)

Bruce N. Moss on behalf of Creditor Certain Underwriters-Lloyd's-  
NCIP807996-2020-Michael  
[bmooss@dt-law.com](mailto:bmooss@dt-law.com)

Bruce N. Moss on behalf of Creditor Certain Underwriters-Lloyd's-  
NCIP823658-Lynch

[bmooss@dt-law.com](mailto:bmooss@dt-law.com)

Bruce N. Moss on behalf of Creditor Certain Underwriters-Lloyd's-NCIP844682-2020-Neiman  
[bmooss@dt-law.com](mailto:bmooss@dt-law.com)

Bruce N. Moss on behalf of Creditor Certain Underwriters-Lloyd's-NIP878669-Parsons  
[bmooss@dt-law.com](mailto:bmooss@dt-law.com)

Bruce N. Moss on behalf of Creditor Certain Underwriters-Lloyd's-VPC-CN0000010-05-Altman  
[bmooss@dt-law.com](mailto:bmooss@dt-law.com)

Bruce N. Moss on behalf of Creditor Citizens Insurance Company of America  
[bmooss@dt-law.com](mailto:bmooss@dt-law.com)

Bruce N. Moss on behalf of Creditor Citizens Insurance Company of Midwest  
[bmooss@dt-law.com](mailto:bmooss@dt-law.com)

Bruce N. Moss on behalf of Creditor Conifer Insurance Company  
[bmooss@dt-law.com](mailto:bmooss@dt-law.com)

Bruce N. Moss on behalf of Creditor Dairyland Insurance Company  
[bmooss@dt-law.com](mailto:bmooss@dt-law.com)

Bruce N. Moss on behalf of Creditor Essentia Insurance Company  
[bmooss@dt-law.com](mailto:bmooss@dt-law.com)

Bruce N. Moss on behalf of Creditor Factory Mutual Insurance Company  
[bmooss@dt-law.com](mailto:bmooss@dt-law.com)

Bruce N. Moss on behalf of Creditor Farm Bureau General Insurance Company of Michigan  
[bmooss@dt-law.com](mailto:bmooss@dt-law.com)

Bruce N. Moss on behalf of Creditor Florists Mutual Insurance Company Hortica

[bmooss@dt-law.com](mailto:bmooss@dt-law.com)

Bruce N. Moss on behalf of Creditor Hastings Mutual Insurance Co.  
[bmooss@dt-law.com](mailto:bmooss@dt-law.com)

Bruce N. Moss on behalf of Creditor Houston Casualty Company  
[bmooss@dt-law.com](mailto:bmooss@dt-law.com)

Bruce N. Moss on behalf of Creditor Independent Specialty Insurance Company  
[bmooss@dt-law.com](mailto:bmooss@dt-law.com)

Bruce N. Moss on behalf of Creditor Indian Harbor Insurance Co.  
[bmooss@dt-law.com](mailto:bmooss@dt-law.com)

Bruce N. Moss on behalf of Creditor Indiana Harbor Insurance Co.  
[bmooss@dt-law.com](mailto:bmooss@dt-law.com)

Bruce N. Moss on behalf of Creditor Interstate Fire & Casualty Company  
[bmooss@dt-law.com](mailto:bmooss@dt-law.com)

Bruce N. Moss on behalf of Creditor Lexington Insurance Company  
[bmooss@dt-law.com](mailto:bmooss@dt-law.com)

Bruce N. Moss on behalf of Creditor MEEMIC Insurance Company  
[bmooss@dt-law.com](mailto:bmooss@dt-law.com)

Bruce N. Moss on behalf of Creditor National Fire & Marine Insurance  
[bmooss@dt-law.com](mailto:bmooss@dt-law.com)

Bruce N. Moss on behalf of Creditor Pioneer Mutual Insurance Company  
[bmooss@dt-law.com](mailto:bmooss@dt-law.com)

Bruce N. Moss on behalf of Creditor Princeton Excess and Surplus Lines Insurance Company  
[bmooss@dt-law.com](mailto:bmooss@dt-law.com)

Bruce N. Moss on behalf of Creditor Telephone & Data Systems, Inc.  
[bmooss@dt-law.com](mailto:bmooss@dt-law.com)

Bruce N. Moss on behalf of Creditor Trisura Specialty Insurance Company  
[bmoss@dt-law.com](mailto:bmoss@dt-law.com)

Bruce N. Moss on behalf of Creditor United Specialty Insurance Company  
[bmoss@dt-law.com](mailto:bmoss@dt-law.com)

Bruce N. Moss on behalf of Creditor Zurich American Insurance Company  
[bmoss@dt-law.com](mailto:bmoss@dt-law.com)

Barbara A. Patek on behalf of Creditor Adam Riggie  
[pateklaw@gmail.com](mailto:pateklaw@gmail.com)

Barbara A. Patek on behalf of Creditor Adrian Wise  
[pateklaw@gmail.com](mailto:pateklaw@gmail.com)

Barbara A. Patek on behalf of Creditor Amy Kaylor  
[pateklaw@gmail.com](mailto:pateklaw@gmail.com)

Barbara A. Patek on behalf of Creditor Jeffrey Kaylor  
[pateklaw@gmail.com](mailto:pateklaw@gmail.com)

Barbara A. Patek on behalf of Creditor Jillian Wise  
[pateklaw@gmail.com](mailto:pateklaw@gmail.com)

John T. Piggins on behalf of Creditor Mike and Lisa McGaugh  
[ecfpigginsi@millerjohnson.com](mailto:ecfpigginsi@millerjohnson.com),  
[pigginsi@millerjohnson.com](mailto:pigginsi@millerjohnson.com);8473902420@filings.docketbird.com

David L. Powers on behalf of Creditor Gerace Construction Company  
[dpowers@smpklaw.com](mailto:dpowers@smpklaw.com), [arex@smpklaw.com](mailto:arex@smpklaw.com);[shougaard@smpklaw.com](mailto:shougaard@smpklaw.com)

David Lawrence Puskar on behalf of Creditor City of Midland  
[davpus@braunkendrick.com](mailto:davpus@braunkendrick.com),  
[brierei@braunkendrick.com](mailto:brierei@braunkendrick.com);[kelspe@braunkendrick.com](mailto:kelspe@braunkendrick.com)

David Lawrence Puskar on behalf of Creditor Pat's Gradall Service, Inc.  
[davpus@braunkendrick.com](mailto:davpus@braunkendrick.com),

[birei@braunkendrick.com](mailto:birei@braunkendrick.com); [kelspe@braunkendrick.com](mailto:kelspe@braunkendrick.com)

Jane Derse Quasarano on behalf of Creditor Daryl Zelenak  
[jquasarano@bodmanlaw.com](mailto:jquasarano@bodmanlaw.com), [tvasser@bodmanllp.com](mailto:tvasser@bodmanllp.com)

Jane Derse Quasarano on behalf of Creditor Gorgia Masouridis Moore  
[jquasarano@bodmanlaw.com](mailto:jquasarano@bodmanlaw.com), [tvasser@bodmanllp.com](mailto:tvasser@bodmanllp.com)

Jane Derse Quasarano on behalf of Creditor Heidi Kidd  
[jquasarano@bodmanlaw.com](mailto:jquasarano@bodmanlaw.com), [tvasser@bodmanllp.com](mailto:tvasser@bodmanllp.com)

Jane Derse Quasarano on behalf of Creditor James Beath  
[jquasarano@bodmanlaw.com](mailto:jquasarano@bodmanlaw.com), [tvasser@bodmanllp.com](mailto:tvasser@bodmanllp.com)

Jane Derse Quasarano on behalf of Creditor James Paquette  
[jquasarano@bodmanlaw.com](mailto:jquasarano@bodmanlaw.com), [tvasser@bodmanllp.com](mailto:tvasser@bodmanllp.com)

Jane Derse Quasarano on behalf of Creditor Michelle Hill  
[jquasarano@bodmanlaw.com](mailto:jquasarano@bodmanlaw.com), [tvasser@bodmanllp.com](mailto:tvasser@bodmanllp.com)

Jane Derse Quasarano on behalf of Creditor Mike Callan  
[jquasarano@bodmanlaw.com](mailto:jquasarano@bodmanlaw.com), [tvasser@bodmanllp.com](mailto:tvasser@bodmanllp.com)

Jane Derse Quasarano on behalf of Creditor Regan Wieland  
[jquasarano@bodmanlaw.com](mailto:jquasarano@bodmanlaw.com), [tvasser@bodmanllp.com](mailto:tvasser@bodmanllp.com)

Jane Derse Quasarano on behalf of Creditor Suzette Gay Zelenak  
[jquasarano@bodmanlaw.com](mailto:jquasarano@bodmanlaw.com), [tvasser@bodmanllp.com](mailto:tvasser@bodmanllp.com)

Jeffery Jon Sattler on behalf of Creditor Holly Johnson  
[jsattler@schaferandweiner.com](mailto:jsattler@schaferandweiner.com), [lfernandez@schaferandweiner.com](mailto:lfernandez@schaferandweiner.com)

Jeffery Jon Sattler on behalf of Creditor Holly Kovacs  
[jsattler@schaferandweiner.com](mailto:jsattler@schaferandweiner.com), [lfernandez@schaferandweiner.com](mailto:lfernandez@schaferandweiner.com)

Jeffery Jon Sattler on behalf of Creditor Kimberly Borchard  
[jsattler@schaferandweiner.com](mailto:jsattler@schaferandweiner.com), [lfernandez@schaferandweiner.com](mailto:lfernandez@schaferandweiner.com)

Jeffery Jon Sattler on behalf of Creditor Robert Woods  
[jsattler@schaferandweiner.com](mailto:jsattler@schaferandweiner.com), [lfernandez@schaferandweiner.com](mailto:lfernandez@schaferandweiner.com)

Jeffery Jon Sattler on behalf of Creditor Timothy D. Dana  
[jsattler@schaferandweiner.com](mailto:jsattler@schaferandweiner.com), [lfernandez@schaferandweiner.com](mailto:lfernandez@schaferandweiner.com)

Craig S. Schoenherr, Sr. on behalf of Creditor Ally Bank  
[ecf@orlaw.com](mailto:ecf@orlaw.com)

Mark H. Shapiro on behalf of Trustee Mark H. Shapiro  
[shapiro@steinbergshapiro.com](mailto:shapiro@steinbergshapiro.com), [jbrown@steinbergshapiro.com](mailto:jbrown@steinbergshapiro.com)

Lisa D. Starks on behalf of Creditor Byline Bank  
[lisa.starks@btlaw.com](mailto:lisa.starks@btlaw.com), [Orlanda.Hauff@btlaw.com](mailto:Orlanda.Hauff@btlaw.com)

Andrew C. Thompson on behalf of Creditor Billings Township  
[athompson@pdkg.com](mailto:athompson@pdkg.com), [hgraham@pdkg.com](mailto:hgraham@pdkg.com)

David A. Tilem on behalf of Creditor Lee Mueller  
[DavidTilem@TilemLaw.com](mailto:DavidTilem@TilemLaw.com), [staff@tilemlaw.com](mailto:staff@tilemlaw.com)

David A. Tilem on behalf of Creditor Michele Mueller  
[DavidTilem@TilemLaw.com](mailto:DavidTilem@TilemLaw.com), [staff@tilemlaw.com](mailto:staff@tilemlaw.com)

Edward M Turfe on behalf of Creditor Allstate Fire and Casualty  
Insurance Company  
[edturfe@turfelaw.com](mailto:edturfe@turfelaw.com)

Edward M Turfe on behalf of Creditor Allstate Indemnity Company  
[edturfe@turfelaw.com](mailto:edturfe@turfelaw.com)

Edward M Turfe on behalf of Creditor Allstate Insurance Company  
[edturfe@turfelaw.com](mailto:edturfe@turfelaw.com)

Edward M Turfe on behalf of Creditor Allstate New Jersey Insurance  
Company  
[edturfe@turfelaw.com](mailto:edturfe@turfelaw.com)

Edward M Turfe on behalf of Creditor Allstate New Jersey Property and  
Casualty Insurance Company  
[edturfe@turfelaw.com](mailto:edturfe@turfelaw.com)

Edward M Turfe on behalf of Creditor Allstate Northbrook Indemnity Company  
[edturfe@turfelaw.com](mailto:edturfe@turfelaw.com)

Edward M Turfe on behalf of Creditor Allstate Property and Casualty Insurance Company  
[edturfe@turfelaw.com](mailto:edturfe@turfelaw.com)

Edward M Turfe on behalf of Creditor Allstate Texas Lloyds  
[edturfe@turfelaw.com](mailto:edturfe@turfelaw.com)

Edward M Turfe on behalf of Creditor Allstate Vehicle and Property Insurance Company  
[edturfe@turfelaw.com](mailto:edturfe@turfelaw.com)

Scott A. Wolfson on behalf of Liquidating Trustee Scott A. Wolfson  
[swolfson@wolfsonbolton.com](mailto:swolfson@wolfsonbolton.com), [stravis@wolfsonbolton.com](mailto:stravis@wolfsonbolton.com)

Respectfully submitted,

WOLFSON BOLTON KOCHIS PLLC

Dated: March 16, 2023

By: /s/ Anthony J. Kochis  
Anthony J. Kochis (P72020)  
3150 Livernois, Suite 275  
Troy, MI 48083  
(248) 247-7105  
akochis@wolfsonbolton.com

## EXHIBIT 6a - Liquidating Trustee's Invoices

Date	Timekeeper	Code	Description	Time	Value
12/06/22	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Receive and review Western District of Michigan Order Holding Motion In Abeyance re L. Mueller's motion for certification of an interlocutory appeal.	0.10	\$45.00
12/12/22	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Analyze order denying L. Mueller motion to enforce plan and opinion in support of same.	0.50	\$225.00
12/12/22	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Review transcript of my deposition in the Ingham County case and make corrections for court reporter.	1.00	\$450.00
12/14/22	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Receive and review proposed amendment to L. Kogan's affirmative defenses and correspondence from K. Clayson re same.	0.10	\$45.00
12/14/22	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Brief research re Michigan Voidable Transactions Act and L. Kogan's affirmative defenses and proposed amendment to same.	0.10	\$45.00
12/14/22	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Confer with A. Kochis re mediator selection for L. Kogan adversary proceeding. NO CHARGE.	0.10	\$0.00
12/15/22	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Receive and review correspondence from K. Clayson re mediation of Kogan case; correspondence with A. Kochis re potential mediators.	0.10	\$45.00
12/15/22	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Revised responses and objections to State's second request for production of documents in Western District case.	0.30	\$135.00
12/15/22	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Revise and execute errata sheet re my November 22, 2022 deposition.	0.10	\$45.00
12/15/22	SAW	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Review and revise draft First Omnibus Objection to Amended and Duplicate Claims.	0.50	\$225.00
12/16/22	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Receive and review correspondence from potential mediator of Kogan adversary proceeding and K. Clayson; correspondence with A. Kochis re same.	0.10	\$45.00
12/16/22	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Brief review of L. Mueller motion to modify case management order in Western District case.	0.10	\$45.00
12/16/22	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Confer with A. Kochis re L. Mueller motion to modify case management order in Western District case. NO CHARGE.	0.10	\$0.00
12/22/22	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Read Plaintiffs' motion for summary disposition and brief in support in Ingham County action.	0.90	\$405.00
12/22/22	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Several items of correspondence with A. Kochis re Plaintiffs' motion for summary disposition in Ingham County case.	0.10	\$45.00
12/22/22	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Telephone call with A. Kochis re response to Plaintiffs' motion for summary disposition.	0.30	\$135.00
01/03/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Receive and review proposed order appointing mediator in Kogan adversary proceeding; confer with A. Kochis re same.	0.10	\$45.00

01/03/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Receive and review State's response to motion for clarification by L. Mueller and Edenville Hydro Property in Western District case.	0.10	\$45.00
01/03/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Receive and review State's response to L. Mueller and Edenville Hydro Property's motion for leave to file overlength brief in Western District case.	0.10	\$45.00
01/03/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Receive and review correspondence with N. Gambill re discovery issues in Western District case.	0.10	\$45.00
01/05/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Review and execute mediation agreement in Kogan case; correspondence with A. Kochis re same.	0.10	\$45.00
01/05/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Review State's Ingham County motion for summary disposition re potential resolution.	0.40	\$180.00
01/05/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Confer with K. Postema re research needed in connection with potential resolution of State's Ingham County motion for summary disposition.	0.10	\$45.00
01/05/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Review K. Postema's research re potential resolution of State's Ingham County action.	0.60	\$270.00
01/05/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Correspondence with K. Postema and A. Kochis re potential resolution to propose to State re Ingham County action. NO CHARGE.	0.10	\$0.00
01/05/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Review and revise draft Stipulated Order Regarding Plaintiffs' Motion for Summary Disposition under MCR 2.116(C)(10) in Ingham County case.	0.10	\$45.00
01/05/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Correspondence with A. Kochis re revisions to draft Stipulated Order Regarding Plaintiffs' Motion for Summary Disposition under MCR 2.116(C)(10) in Ingham County case. NO CHARGE.	0.10	\$0.00
01/06/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Initial read of State's motion to compel discovery in Western District case.	0.50	\$225.00
01/06/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Meet with A. Kochis re State's motion to compel.	0.30	\$135.00
01/09/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Receive and review referral of discovery dispute in Western District case to magistrate judge and correspondence with A. Kochis re same.	0.10	\$45.00
01/09/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Receive and review L. Mueller letter to Ingham County Court re motion for summary disposition hearing.	0.10	\$45.00
01/10/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Receive and review Western District court's order re L. Mueller's motion to certify interlocutory appeal.	0.10	\$45.00
01/11/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Begin reviewing files and working on document production in response to State's requests in WD case.	2.70	\$1,215.00
01/11/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Receive and review correspondence with N. Gambill re Ingham County proposed stipulation and order to resolve State's motion for summary disposition.	0.10	\$45.00

01/11/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Receive and review several items of correspondence from N.s Gambill and L. Mueller re deposition of F. Christie and Ingham County summary disposition hearing.	0.10	\$45.00
01/11/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Receive and review State's second motion to enforce order in WD case and brief in support.	0.30	\$135.00
01/11/23	SAW	Reporting	Complete quarterly report.	0.10	\$45.00
01/18/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Revise response to State's motion to compel.	0.40	\$180.00
01/19/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Receive and review Plaintiffs' motion and brief in support of motion to strike L. Mueller's brief in support of motion for certification in WD case.	0.10	\$45.00
01/20/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Revise responses and objections to Kogan Law Group's discovery requests.	0.50	\$225.00
01/23/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Plaintiffs' response to second motion for clarification.	0.10	\$45.00
01/24/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Revise mediation statement re Kogan Law Group.	0.60	\$270.00
01/24/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Receive and review court order granting Plaintiffs' motion to strike in WD case.	0.10	\$45.00
01/25/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Receive and review order denying plaintiffs' motion to file a reply brief re motion to compel in WD case; correspondence with A. Kochis re same.	0.10	\$45.00
01/26/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Receive and review L. Mueller's response in opposition to second motion to enforce order in WD case.	0.40	\$180.00
01/30/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Revise draft response to State's motion for summary disposition in Ingham County case.	0.40	\$180.00
01/30/23	SAW	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Work on constructing claims review process.	0.70	\$315.00
01/31/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Further revisions to response to State's motion for summary disposition in Ingham County case.	0.30	\$135.00
01/31/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Receive and review State's motion to file a reply brief and proposed reply brief re motion to compel in WD case.	0.20	\$90.00
02/01/23	SAW	B150 Meetings of and Communications with Creditors	Creditor inquiry. NO CHARGE.	0.10	\$0.00
02/01/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Discuss Kogan Law mediation issues with A. Kochis. NO CHARGE.	0.10	\$0.00
02/01/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Brief review of Kogan Law Group mediation statement.	0.30	\$135.00
02/01/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Receive and review correspondence from L. Mueller re hearing on Plaintiff's motion for summary disposition in Ingham County case.	0.10	\$45.00

02/08/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Confer with A. Kochis re hearing on motion to compel discovery in WD case. NO CHARGE.	0.10	\$0.00
02/08/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Receive and review Plaintiffs' reply to Boyce Hydro's response to Plaintiff's motion for summary disposition.	0.10	\$45.00
02/08/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Receive and review Plaintiff's reply to L. Mueller's response to Plaintiff's motion for summary disposition.	0.10	\$45.00
02/09/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Receive and review correspondence from A. Kochis and N. Gambill re discovery dispute and proposal for proceeding.	0.10	\$45.00
02/09/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Confer with A. Kochis re discovery dispute in WD case and hearing on State's motion for summary disposition in Ingham County case.	0.10	\$45.00
02/09/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Receive and review correspondence from N. Gambill and A. Kochis re proposed stipulation to entry of judgment in Ingham County case.	0.10	\$45.00
02/09/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Attend Ingham County hearing on State's motion for summary disposition.	1.60	\$720.00
02/09/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Receive and review Opinion and Order Granting Plaintiffs' Motion to Enforce Court's Prior Order and for Further Sanctions in WD case.	0.30	\$135.00
02/09/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Receive and review correspondence and proposed summary disposition order submitted on seven-day notice by State.	0.10	\$45.00
02/10/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Review and revise State's second request for production per hearing in WD on motion to compel.	0.10	\$45.00
02/10/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Confer with A. Kochis re revisions to Plaintiff's second request for production per hearing in WD on motion to compel.	0.10	\$0.00
02/13/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Confer with A. Kochis and K. Postema re WD case document production protocol.	0.10	\$45.00
02/13/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Receive and review Plaintiff's second request for production to liquidating trustee in WD case as revised by agreement between counsel.	0.10	\$45.00
02/13/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Meet with K. Postema re WD discovery response protocol.	0.10	\$45.00
02/14/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Analyze and revise proposed order granting Plaintiffs' motion for summary disposition in Ingham County case.	0.40	\$180.00
02/14/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Confer with A. Kochis re revisions to and potential objection to proposed order granting Plaintiffs' motion for summary disposition in Ingham County case.	0.10	\$45.00
02/14/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Review revised proposed order on Plaintiffs' motion for summary disposition in Ingham County case; further revisions to same; correspondence with A. Kochis re same.	0.10	\$45.00

02/14/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Receive and review stipulated order amending answer and affirmative defenses in WD case. NO CHARGE.	0.10	\$0.00
02/14/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Review draft objection to notice of submission of Plaintiffs' proposed order granting motion for summary disposition in Ingham County case.	0.10	\$45.00
02/14/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Review emails in response to Plaintiffs' Second Request for Production to Liquidating Trustee.	1.00	\$450.00
02/14/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Receive and review correspondence from N. Gambill and from A. Kochis re potential resolution of Ingham County proposed order on motion for summary disposition.	0.10	\$45.00
02/14/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Receive and review correspondence from M. Mueller re objections to proposed order on motion for summary disposition in Ingham County case and re substitution of judge; correspondence with A. Kochis re same.	0.10	\$45.00
02/15/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Attend mediation of Kogan Law case with J. Teicher at Maddin Hauser in Southfield.	7.00	\$3,150.00
02/15/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Revised proposed new Kogan case dates; confer with A. Kochis re same.	0.10	\$45.00
02/15/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Prepare for mediation with Kogan.	0.80	\$360.00
02/16/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Receive and review finalized notice of objection to order on Plaintiffs' motion for summary disposition in Ingham County case. NO CHARGE.	0.10	\$0.00
02/16/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Receive and review order modifying scheduling order in Kogan adversary proceeding; attention to amended dates.	0.10	\$45.00
02/16/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Review documents for production to State in WD case.	1.20	\$540.00
02/16/23	SAW	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Meet with WBK team re claims review status and plan for proceeding.	0.30	\$135.00
02/17/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Correspondence with A. Kochis re Kogan adversary case strategy issues. NO CHARGE.	0.10	\$0.00
02/17/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Correspondence with N. Steinkamp re Kogan adversary proceeding.	0.10	\$45.00
02/17/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Continue document review for document production to State in WD case.	6.50	\$2,925.00
02/17/23	SAW	B240 Tax Issues	Review amended grantor letter and correspondence from B. Schultz; confer with A. Kochis re same.	0.10	\$45.00
02/20/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Work on document production to State in WD case.	1.00	\$450.00
02/23/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Receive and review State's motion to lift confidentiality in Ingham County case.	0.10	\$45.00

02/23/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Confer with A. Kochis re Ingham County motion, briefing, and hearing issues; receive and review two items of correspondence from N. Gambill re same.	0.10	\$45.00
02/23/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Revise response to State's motion to lift confidentiality designations and other relief from Protective Order in Ingham County case.	0.30	\$135.00
02/23/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Revise response to Plaintiff's motion to deem requests to admit in Ingham County case admitted.	0.20	\$90.00
02/24/23	SAW	B240 Tax Issues	Review draft amended tax returns.	0.10	\$45.00
02/27/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Confer with K. Postema re document production to State in WD case.	0.10	\$45.00
02/27/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Receive and review correspondence from L. Mueller re Ingham County hearing issues.	0.10	\$45.00
02/27/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Review proposed WD case supplemental discovery responses and related document production and privilege log.	0.50	\$225.00
02/27/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Correspondence with A. Kochis and K. Postema re revised declaration in WD case.	0.10	\$45.00
02/27/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Revise declaration re document production in WD case.	0.30	\$135.00
02/28/23	SAW	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Review emails and time records in response to N. Gambill email re discovery requests in WD.	1.10	\$495.00
02/28/23	SAW	B240 Tax Issues	Execute tax documents; correspondence with Plante Moran re same.	0.10	\$45.00
				<b>TOTAL</b>	<b>40.90</b> <b>\$17,910.00</b>

## LT Expenses

Client Date	File Code	Description	Value
Boyce Hydro, LLC, et al. 12/01/2022		Boyce Liquidating Trustee/SAW Billing Only PostNet Mailing Fowarding	<b>16.00</b>
Boyce Hydro, LLC, et al. 12/31/2022		Boyce Liquidating Trustee/SAW Billing Only Printing/Copying Fees	<b>25.60</b>
Boyce Hydro, LLC, et al. 02/03/2023		Boyce Liquidating Trustee/SAW Billing Only PostNet NV168 Mailbox Renewal	<b>120.00</b>
Boyce Hydro, LLC, et al. 02/11/2023		Boyce Liquidating Trustee/SAW Billing Only PostNet Mail Forwarding	<b>16.00</b>
<b>Firm Totals</b>			<b>177.60</b>

# EXHIBIT 6b - Wolfson Bolton Kochis PLLC Invoices

## Main Case Fees

Date	Timekeeper	Code	Description	Time	Value
12/01/22	KAP	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Revise First Omnibus Objection and exhibits re amended and duplicate claims.	1.80	\$405.00
12/02/22	SKT	B110 Case Administration	Correspondence to Signature Bank re GulfMark check.	0.20	\$39.00
12/02/22	KAP	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Review order re objections procedure; strategize next steps in claims reconciliation and objections.	0.70	\$157.50
12/03/22	AJK	B160 Fee/Employment Applications	Review Stretto invoices for September and October. NO CHARGE	0.20	\$0.00
12/05/22	AJK	B110 Case Administration	Review numerous items of Boyce mail.	0.10	\$49.50
12/05/22	AJK	B160 Fee/Employment Applications	Begin to analyze and review WB time re Fee Approval Motion. NO CHARGE.	0.40	\$0.00
12/05/22	SKT	B160 Fee/Employment Applications	Prepare professional fees and expenses for fee application.	0.50	\$97.50
12/05/22	SKT	B160 Fee/Employment Applications	Preparing fee statement exhibits.	0.60	\$117.00
12/05/22	AJK	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Correspondence with Stretto re Omnibus Objection to Amended and Duplicate Claims.	0.30	\$148.50
12/05/22	AJK	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Revise Omnibus Objection re Amended and Duplicate Claims.	0.70	\$346.50
12/05/22	KAP	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Continue review of claims registry; meet with A. Kochis re strategy for claims objections.	0.60	\$135.00
12/06/22	AJK	B160 Fee/Employment Applications	Correspondence with Plante Moran and Stretto re November invoices and Fee Approval Motion.	0.20	\$99.00
12/06/22	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Analyze and review Order Holding Motion to Certify in Abeyance.	0.10	\$49.50
12/06/22	AJK	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Zoom meeting with Stretto re claims reconciliation and objection issues.	0.50	\$247.50
12/06/22	KAP	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Correspondence with B. Brown re data supporting claims filed by Dennenburg Tuffley.	0.20	\$45.00
12/06/22	KAP	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Meeting with Stretto team re claims process and strategy for expunging claims.	0.50	\$112.50
12/07/22	AJK	B160 Fee/Employment Applications	Begin revising Fee Approval Motion.	0.50	\$247.50
12/07/22	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Brief review re State submission of expert reports in WD litigation.	0.30	\$148.50
12/08/22	SKT	B160 Fee/Employment Applications	Draft and prepare fee approval motion for September through November and supporting exhibits.	1.50	\$292.50
12/08/22	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Analyze and review deposition transcript re S. Wolfson in Ingham County case.	0.20	\$99.00
12/09/22	AJK	B160 Fee/Employment Applications	Correspondence with Stretto and Plante Moran teams re November invoices. NO CHARGE.	0.20	\$0.00

12/09/22	AJK	B160 Fee/Employment Applications	Revise and finalize Fee Approval Motion for filing and service.	1.00	\$495.00
12/09/22	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Analyze and review discovery by State of Michigan in WD case to Liquidating Trustee.	0.10	\$49.50
12/09/22	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Analyze and review Opinion and Order Denying Mueller Motion to Enforce.	0.40	\$198.00
12/09/22	KAP	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Correspondence with B. Brown re Denenberg claims data.	0.20	\$45.00
12/11/22	KAP	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Revise exhibits to First Omnibus Objection.	1.00	\$225.00
12/12/22	KAP	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Draft responses to State's second Requests for Production in WD case.	1.60	\$360.00
12/12/22	SKT	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Correspondence with court reporter re S. Wolfson's transcript and preparing errata sheet.	0.10	\$19.50
12/12/22	AJK	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Review and revise First Omnibus Objection.	0.40	\$198.00
12/12/22	KAP	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Download and provide Stretto with data supporting claims received from Denenberg Tuffley.	0.70	\$157.50
12/12/22	KAP	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Revise exhibits and draft notice re First Omnibus Objection.	1.00	\$225.00
12/13/22	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Analyze and review correspondence from L. Kogan re request to modify Case Management Order.	0.10	\$49.50
12/15/22	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Revise discovery responses re WD litigation case.	0.40	\$198.00
12/15/22	KAP	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Complete draft of responses to Plaintiff's Second RFP in WD case; review revisions re same.	0.70	\$157.50
12/15/22	AJK	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Review re expungement of amended and duplicate claims of Pitt McGehee.	0.70	\$346.50
12/15/22	KAP	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Review amended and duplicate claims filed by Pitt McGehee.	0.30	\$67.50
12/15/22	KAP	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Review S. Wolfson revisions to First Omnibus Objection; draft Certificate of Service; confer with A. Kochis re notice procedure for First Omnibus Objection and begin drafting cover letter re same.	1.10	\$247.50
12/16/22	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Analyze and review Mueller request to modify CMO in Western District action; correspondence to L. Kogan re same.	0.50	\$247.50

12/16/22	KAP	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Review Motion to Amend Case Management Order and Errata Motion to Amend in WD case.	0.50	\$112.50
12/16/22	KAP	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Continue to review amended and duplicate claims filed by Pitt McGehee; draft correspondence to counsel re same.	1.20	\$270.00
12/19/22	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Analyze and review L. Mueller Motion for Reconsideration re request to modify CMO.	0.10	\$49.50
12/20/22	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Briefly analyze and review L. Mueller Motion for Clarification re Sanctions Order.	0.10	\$49.50
12/20/22	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Correspondence from State of Michigan re Summary Disposition Motion in Ingham County case.	0.30	\$148.50
12/20/22	KAP	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Receive and review State's MSD in Ingham County litigation.	0.30	\$67.50
12/20/22	KAP	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Call with L. Wallin re stipulation to expunge amended and duplicate claims filed by Pitt McGehee/Stern Law.	0.20	\$45.00
12/20/22	KAP	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Review claims re Pitt McGehee/Stern Law; begin drafting stipulation expunging amended and duplicate claims.	0.60	\$135.00
12/21/22	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Analyze and review L. Mueller Motion for Leave re Motion to Certify.	0.10	\$49.50
12/21/22	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Analyze and review State Motion for Summary in Ingham County case.	0.70	\$346.50
12/21/22	KAP	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Continue drafting stipulation, exhibit and order expunging amended and duplicate claims filed by Pitt McGehee; call with K. Stern re same.	1.30	\$292.50
12/22/22	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Telephone conference with S. Wolfson re State Motion for Summary Disposition in Ingham County case; correspondence to E. Crowder re same.	0.40	\$198.00
12/22/22	KAP	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Correspondence with Stern law re stipulation expunging amended and duplicate claims.	0.20	\$45.00
12/23/22	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Telephone conference with E. Crowder re State Motion for Summary Disposition in Ingham case.	0.30	\$148.50
12/23/22	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Correspondence to N. Gambill re State Motion for Summary Disposition requesting extension to respond and continue to review potential response strategy.	0.70	\$346.50

12/26/22	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Follow up correspondence to N.Gambill re motion for SD in Ingham County litigation case.	0.10	\$49.50
12/27/22	KAP	B160 Fee/Employment Applications	Draft CNR re Fee Approval.	0.80	\$180.00
12/28/22	AJK	B160 Fee/Employment Applications	Correspondence with L. Langley re Order on Fee Approval Motion.	0.10	\$49.50
12/28/22	KAP	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Finalize responses to State's Second RFPs in WD case.	0.20	\$45.00
12/28/22	KAP	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Research re summary disposition standard under MCR 2.116(C)(10); begin drafting response to Plaintiff's MSD in Ingham County case.	2.60	\$585.00
12/28/22	SKT	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Finalize and file certificate of no response re fee approval motion; upload proposed order re same.	0.20	\$39.00
12/28/22	SKT	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Serve WD case responses to second request for production of documents; draft and file certificate of service re same.	0.50	\$97.50
12/30/22	KAP	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Draft email correspondence to N.Gambil re discovery responses.	0.20	\$45.00
01/03/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Analyze and review State Responses to numerous filings by L. Mueller in WD litigation case.	0.10	\$53.50
01/03/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Review re adjournment of hearing on State Motion for SD in Ingham County case; correspondence to E. Crowder re same.	0.20	\$107.00
01/03/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Receive and respond to correspondence from N.Gambill re Liquidating Trustee responses to discovery.	0.50	\$267.50
01/04/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Correspondence from N.Gambill re discovery responses in Western District case.	0.10	\$53.50
01/04/23	AJK	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Correspondence to Pitt McGehee and Stern Law re stipulation and order to expunge claims.	0.10	\$53.50
01/04/23	KAP	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Begin review of updated claims registry and analyze potential claims objections.	0.70	\$185.50
01/05/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Correspondence to N.Gambill re hearing on State Motion for Summary Disposition in Ingham County case.	0.10	\$53.50

01/05/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Draft Stipulated Order re Plaintiff's Motion for Summary in Ingham Case; correspondence to E. Crowder re same.	0.50	\$267.50
01/05/23	KAP	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Review Plaintiffs' motion for summary disposition and research re Part 17 and Part 301; analyze potential stipulation re Plaintiffs' motion for summary disposition.	2.40	\$636.00
01/05/23	AJK	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Telephone call to Pitt McGehee re Stipulation and Order to expunge; review updated Claims Registry from Stretto.	0.30	\$160.50
01/05/23	KAP	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Continue reviewing updated claims registry and analyze objection strategy; correspondence to Stretto re amended claims.	0.70	\$185.50
01/06/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Correspondence from N.Gambill re Re-Notice of Hearing on Motion for SD.	0.10	\$53.50
01/06/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Analyze and review Motion to Compel by State of Michigan in WD case and begin drafting Response re same.	1.60	\$856.00
01/06/23	KAP	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Review Plaintiffs' motion to compel; review previous production of emails and documents in Ingham County case.	0.80	\$212.00
01/06/23	AJK	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Correspondence with K. Carlson and K. Stern re Stipulation and Order to Expunge Claims.	0.40	\$214.00
01/06/23	KAP	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Follow-up re stipulation to expunge amended and duplicate claims filed by Cohen Milstein; review claims and revise first omnibus objection; draft cover letters re service of first omnibus objection.	3.50	\$927.50
01/09/23	AJK	B160 Fee/Employment Applications	Correspondence with L. Langley re Fee Approval Motion and Order detail.	0.10	\$53.50
01/09/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Analyze and review Order Referring Motion to Compel to Magistrate and Notice of Hearing in WD case.	0.10	\$53.50
01/09/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Continue drafting Response to Motion to Compel by State in Western District case.	2.30	\$1,230.50
01/09/23	AJK	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Correspondence and telephone conference with E. Crowder re First Omnibus Claims Objection.	0.10	\$53.50
01/09/23	AJK	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Revise First Omnibus Objection.	0.50	\$267.50
01/09/23	KAP	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Review revisions and continue drafting cover letters re service of First Omnibus Objection to Amended and Duplicate Claims.	1.40	\$371.00
01/10/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Analyze and review Order re Motion for Reconsideration on Sanctions Order in WD case.	0.20	\$107.00
01/10/23	AJK	Reporting	Draft Q4 post-confirmation report.	0.20	\$107.00

01/11/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Analyze and review Order re L. Mueller Motion for Interlocutory Appeal.	0.10	\$53.50
01/11/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Continue drafting Response to Motion to Compel by State of Michigan.	1.10	\$588.50
01/11/23	KAP	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Email correspondence with Cohen Milstein re expunging claims; finalize stipulation and order expunging claims filed by Cohen Milstein.	0.50	\$132.50
01/11/23	AJK	Reporting	Revise and finalize Q4 2022 post-confirmation report for filing and service.	0.30	\$160.50
01/12/23	AJK	B150 Meetings of and Communications with Creditors	Telephone call from creditor re submission of proof of claim; receive and respond to correspondence from A. Stoltz re claims reconciliation.	0.10	\$53.50
01/12/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Analyze and review Mueller Supplemental Motion to Clarify re Order on Motion for Sanctions in WD case.	0.20	\$107.00
01/12/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Review re document production subjection to Motion to Compel by State.	0.30	\$160.50
01/12/23	SKT	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	File stipulation for order expunging Cohen claims and supporting exhibits; upload proposed order re same.	0.20	\$43.00
01/13/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Analyze and review Mueller Brief in Support re Motion to Certify Appeal.	0.10	\$53.50
01/13/23	SKT	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	File corrected stipulation for order expunging Cohen claims and supporting corrected exhibits; upload proposed order re same.	0.20	\$43.00
01/13/23	KAP	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Communications with court clerk and counsel for Cohen Milstein re withdrawal of order; draft notice of withdrawal; drafted corrected stip and order.	1.20	\$318.00
01/17/23	AJK	B150 Meetings of and Communications with Creditors	Telephone call from creditor re grantor letter.	0.20	\$107.00
01/17/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Revise Brief in Support of Motion to Compel.	0.60	\$321.00
01/17/23	KAP	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Finalize stipulation re expunging claims filed by Pitt McGehee; teams meeting with A. Daversa re claims registry and strategy re reconciling claims; review claims and make notes re same.	1.10	\$291.50
01/18/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Revise Response to Motion to Compel per revisions from S. Wolfson; gather exhibits re same.	0.60	\$321.00
01/18/23	AJK	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Review re potential additional duplicate and amended claims to be added to First Omnibus Objection to Claims.	0.50	\$267.50
01/19/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Analyze and review State Motion to Strike Brief in WD case.	0.10	\$53.50

01/19/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Revise Brief in Support of Response to Motion to Compel.	0.30	\$160.50
01/19/23	KAP	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Continue drafting response to Plaintiffs' motion for summary disposition in Ingham case.	1.30	\$344.50
01/19/23	AJK	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Analyze and review Byline scheduled and filed claims.	0.30	\$160.50
01/19/23	AJK	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Meet with K. Postema re claims review and reconciliation; review next steps re same.	0.70	\$374.50
01/19/23	KAP	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Meet with A. Kochis re claim objections and strategy; revise exhibits to First Omnibus Objection.	0.80	\$212.00
01/20/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Revise and finalize Response to Motion to Compel for filing and service.	0.50	\$267.50
01/20/23	KAP	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Research re authentication and admissible evidence supporting motion for summary disposition; continue drafting response to Plaintiffs' motion for summary disposition in Ingham case.	1.40	\$371.00
01/20/23	KAP	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Call with A. Davera re service of First Omnibus Objection; finalize documents re same.	1.10	\$291.50
01/21/23	AJK	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Review service letter to counsel re First Omnibus Objection to Claims.	0.10	\$53.50
01/23/23	AJK	B160 Fee/Employment Applications	Correspondence from Plante Moran re December invoice. NO CHARGE.	0.10	\$0.00
01/23/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Receive and respond to correspondence from N.Gambill re WD Motion to Compel; brief review re Response to Motion for Summary in Ingham action.	0.40	\$214.00
01/23/23	KAP	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Continue drafting response to Plaintiffs motion for summary disposition in Ingham case; confer with A. Kochis re same.	1.60	\$424.00
01/23/23	KAP	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Revise and file First Omnibus Objection; correspondence with Stretto re service of same; review Stretto certificate of service and provide revisions re same.	1.40	\$371.00
01/24/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Analyze and review Order Granting Motion to Strike Mueller Errata Brief.	0.10	\$53.50
01/24/23	KAP	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Continue drafting response to Plaintiffs' motion for summary disposition in Ingham case; analyze and create summary of exhibits re Plaintiffs motion to determine admissibility.	1.70	\$450.50
01/24/23	AJK	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Revise Certificate of Service re Notice of Claims Objections.	0.10	\$53.50
01/24/23	KAP	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Further review and correspondence with Stretto re revisions to certificate of service for First Omnibus Objection.	0.40	\$106.00
01/25/23	AJK	B130 Asset Disposition	Correspondence with J. Vanas re Oren Court tax statement.	0.10	\$53.50

01/25/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Analyze and review Plaintiffs' Motion to File Reply in Support of Motion to Compel and Court Order Denying same.	0.50	\$267.50
01/25/23	KAP	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Review Plaintiff's motion for leave to file reply brief; brief research re opposing a motion for leave to file brief.	0.40	\$106.00
01/25/23	KAP	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Continue review of exhibits and drafting response to Plaintiffs' motion for summary disposition in Ingham case.	1.00	\$265.00
01/26/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Analyze and review Mueller Response to Plaintiffs' Second Motion to Sanction.	0.20	\$107.00
01/26/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Revise Response to State Motion for Summary Disposition in Ingham County case.	1.10	\$588.50
01/26/23	AJK	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Review re wrong priority claims.	0.10	\$53.50
01/26/23	KAP	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Begin review of remaining amended and duplicate claims following First Omnibus Objection.	0.70	\$185.50
01/27/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Correspondence from L. Kogan re discovery requests in WD case.	0.10	\$53.50
01/27/23	KAP	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Continue to review admissibility of exhibits to Plaintiffs' motion for summary disposition; revise response to motion for summary disposition.	1.40	\$371.00
01/30/23	AJK	B160 Fee/Employment Applications	Correspondence from Stretto re December invoice. NO CHARGE	0.10	\$0.00
01/30/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Revise Response to Motion for Summary and correspondence to S. Wolfson re same.	0.50	\$267.50
01/30/23	AJK	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Review Feiger amended/duplicate claim analysis.	0.20	\$107.00
01/30/23	AJK	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Telephonic meeting with S. Wolfson re claims review and analysis; correspondence to WB team re same.	0.70	\$374.50
01/30/23	KAP	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Meeting with S. Wolfson and A. Kochis re claims reconciliation process and strategy; continue claims review; correspondence with Feiger Law re amended and duplicate claims; call with D. Hogan re First Omnibus Objection.	3.00	\$795.00
01/31/23	AJK	B110 Case Administration	Correspondence from Stretto re update to Special Service List.	0.10	\$53.50
01/31/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Revise and finalize Response to Motion for Summary Disposition for filing and service.	0.50	\$267.50

01/31/23	KAP	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Review and revise response to Plaintiffs' motion for summary disposition.	0.30	\$79.50
02/01/23	SKT	B110 Case Administration	Draft, finalize and file notice of update to special service list.	0.30	\$64.50
02/01/23	AJK	B150 Meetings of and Communications with Creditors	Telephone call from creditor L. Krick re grantor letter.	0.20	\$107.00
02/01/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Correspondence from L. Mueller re Response to Motion for Summary in Ingham matter.	0.10	\$53.50
02/01/23	AJK	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Begin to outline claims review and reconciliation process and procedures to be implemented.	1.50	\$802.50
02/01/23	KAP	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Continued claims review; correspondence with Grant & Eisenhofer re additional amended claims; meeting with A. Kochis re claims review process.	1.50	\$397.50
02/02/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Correspondence to case parties re courtesy copy of Response to Motion for Summary.	0.10	\$53.50
02/02/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Begin preparing for hearing on Motion to Compel.	0.50	\$267.50
02/02/23	AJK	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Meet with WB team to explain and delegate claims review process.	1.30	\$695.50
02/02/23	KAP	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Meeting with A. Kochis, S. Travis and M. Bass re claims review assignment; revise claims review spreadsheets.	1.30	\$344.50
02/02/23	MHB	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Meeting regarding claims analysis and coding procedures for mandatory review and determination regarding objections to claims.	1.00	\$315.00
02/02/23	SKT	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Confer with WB team regarding claims review process.	1.00	\$215.00
02/03/23	AJK	B150 Meetings of and Communications with Creditors	Telephone call from M. Wagner re case status.	0.20	\$107.00
02/03/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Analyze and review State Response to Motion to Certify and Defendants' Motion for Reconsideration.	0.50	\$267.50
02/04/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Begin preparing for hearing on Motion to Compel.	0.60	\$321.00
02/06/23	AJK	B130 Asset Disposition	Review re receipt of Oren Court escrow refund check.	0.10	\$53.50
02/06/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Brief review re State Reply Brief in Support and Mueller Response to Motion for Summary in Ingham County.	0.40	\$214.00
02/06/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Continue preparing for hearing on Motion to Compel in Western District case.	1.30	\$695.50

02/06/23	KAP	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Review State's reply brief in support of motion for summary disposition.	0.30	\$79.50
02/06/23	AJK	B240 Tax Issues	Telephone call from B. Schultz re amended tax return.	0.30	\$160.50
02/07/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Analyze and review State Reply re Liquidating Trustee's Response and Mueller's Response in Support of State Motion for Summary Disposition.	0.50	\$267.50
02/07/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Hearing on Motion to Compel in Grand Rapids, MI re Western District matter.	5.80	\$3,103.00
02/07/23	AJK	B240 Tax Issues	Review correspondence from B. Schultz re amended tax return reconciliation.	0.30	\$160.50
02/07/23	KAP	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Continue claim review process; correspondence with K. Stern re amended claims; begin drafting stipulation expunging amended claims filed by Stern Law.	1.20	\$318.00
02/08/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Analyze and review Opinion and Order entering Default against L. Mueller and Edenville Hydro Property in WD case.	0.40	\$214.00
02/08/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Prepare for hearing on Motion for Summary in Ingham County case.	0.70	\$374.50
02/08/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Prepare for and virtually argue in opposition to Motion to Compel in Western District case.	1.50	\$802.50
02/08/23	KAP	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Briefly review Court order re motion to enforce and impose sanctions.	0.30	\$79.50
02/08/23	AJK	B240 Tax Issues	Teams meeting with Plante Moran team re amended tax returns; review reconciliation spreadsheet.	0.70	\$374.50
02/08/23	KAP	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Review Plante Moran notes re treatment of claims for tax purposes; meeting with Plante Moran.	2.20	\$583.00
02/09/23	SKT	B110 Case Administration	Send check to Signature Bank for deposit into Fund B.	0.20	\$43.00
02/09/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Correspondence from N.Gambill re revised discovery responses in WD case.	0.20	\$107.00
02/09/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Revise Stipulation to Amend WD Answer.	0.40	\$214.00
02/09/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Prepare for and argue in opposition to State Motion for Summary; analyze and review correspondence from N.Gambill re 7-day order submission.	2.30	\$1,230.50
02/09/23	KAP	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Draft stipulation amending Liquidating Trustee's Answer and Affirmative Defenses; correspondence with N. Gambill re same.	1.20	\$318.00

02/09/23	KAP	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Attend hearing on Plaintiffs' motion for summary disposition in Ingham case.	1.60	\$424.00
02/09/23	AJK	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Confer with K. Postema re claims review and reconciliation issues.	0.50	\$267.50
02/09/23	KAP	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Continue review of Plante Moran claim notes re taxes.	0.80	\$212.00
02/09/23	KAP	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Continued review of claims; confer with A. Kochis re claims reconciliation process; continue drafting stipulation and order re amended claims filed by Stern Law.	1.00	\$265.00
02/09/23	MHB	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Review claims.	0.50	\$157.50
02/10/23	SKT	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	File stipulation and order re amending answer in western district case.	0.10	\$21.50
02/10/23	SKT	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Request hearing transcript re Ingham case hearing.	0.20	\$43.00
02/10/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Analyze and review State proposed Order re Ingham County Summary Judgment Motion.	0.20	\$107.00
02/10/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Revise draft discovery requests from State and correspondence with N.Gambill re same.	0.50	\$267.50
02/10/23	KAP	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Research re exporting emails for production in Western District case.	0.50	\$132.50
02/10/23	KAP	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Finish drafting stipulation and order expunging claims filed by Stern Law; correspondence to K. Stern re same.	0.70	\$185.50
02/13/23	AJK	B110 Case Administration	Review re 2023 annual statements of Boyce entities.	0.10	\$53.50
02/13/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Correspondence with N.Gambill re production of emails.	0.10	\$53.50
02/13/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Review summary disposition order; correspondence with N.Gambill re same.	0.60	\$321.00
02/13/23	KAP	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Continue claims review; correspondence re amended claims filed by Gruel Mills Nims & Pylman PLLC.	0.80	\$212.00
02/14/23	AJK	B160 Fee/Employment Applications	Correspondence from Plante Moran re January 2023 invoice. NO CHARGE	0.10	\$0.00
02/14/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Analyze and review Order re Amended Complaint in WD action.	0.10	\$53.50

02/14/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Review re emails to produce in WD action.	0.10	\$53.50
02/14/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Draft revised Order re Summary Disposition ruling and Objection to 7-day Order submission by State of Michigan in Ingham County action.	2.20	\$1,177.00
02/14/23	KAP	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Draft stipulation and order expunging amended claims filed by Gruel Mills; correspondence with T. Behm re same; additional email correspondence following up re amended claims.	1.00	\$265.00
02/15/23	AJK	B160 Fee/Employment Applications	Review Plante Moran 2023 tax engagement letter; correspondence to Plante Moran re same and amended tax return.	0.30	\$160.50
02/15/23	SKT	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	File and serve Objection To Plaintiffs' Notice Of Submission Of Order, Certificate of Service, and Notice of Hearing re Ingham case.	0.50	\$107.50
02/15/23	AJK	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Brief review re additional Olsman claims to be expunged.	0.10	\$53.50
02/15/23	KAP	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Continue claims reconciliation; draft correspondence to Olsman re additional amended claims.	0.50	\$132.50
02/16/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Review re email document production by Liquidating Trustee in WD case.	0.10	\$53.50
02/16/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Analyze and review L. Mueller Objection re Order on Motion for Summary.	0.20	\$107.00
02/16/23	SKT	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	File stipulation and order re expunging Gruel Mills claims.	0.10	\$21.50
02/16/23	AJK	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Touchpoint with WB team re claims review and reconciliation.	0.40	\$214.00
02/16/23	KAP	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Meeting re claims review; multiple items of correspondence re expunging amended claims; continue review of wrong priority claims category; finalize stipulation and order expunging claims filed by Gruel Mills.	1.10	\$291.50
02/16/23	MHB	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Meeting with A. Kochis and S. Wolfson to discuss status of claims review.	0.20	\$63.00
02/16/23	MHB	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Non-opt-in claims review.	0.70	\$220.50
02/16/23	SKT	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Touchpoint meeting with WB team re claims review and reconciliation; continue Opt In claims review.	0.90	\$193.50
02/17/23	AJK	B150 Meetings of and Communications with Creditors	Telephone call from creditor re grantor letter.	0.30	\$160.50
02/17/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Review re email production in WD case.	0.50	\$267.50

02/17/23	KAP	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Correspondence with A. Kochis and S. Wolfson re document production in WD case.	0.30	\$79.50
02/17/23	AJK	B240 Tax Issues	Telephone conference and correspondence with B. Schultz re amended 2021 tax returns and 2022 engagement letter.	0.50	\$267.50
02/17/23	AJK	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Brief review re no support claims.	0.10	\$53.50
02/17/23	KAP	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Correspondence re claims review process; finalize stipulation expunging claims filed by Stern Law.	0.40	\$106.00
02/17/23	MHB	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Claims review.	2.00	\$630.00
02/18/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Correspondence with S. Wolfson re Boyce email production.	0.20	\$107.00
02/20/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Telephone conference with K. Postema re email document production in WD case.	0.10	\$53.50
02/20/23	KAP	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Correspondence re document production in WD case; confer with A. Kochis re review of email production and begin review of same.	1.50	\$397.50
02/20/23	SKT	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	File stipulation and order to expunge Stern Law claims.	0.10	\$21.50
02/20/23	KAP	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Correspondence with Stretto re claims reconciliation and supporting data.	0.10	\$26.50
02/21/23	AJK	B150 Meetings of and Communications with Creditors	Receive and respond to correspondence from B. Gordon re claim reconciliation status.	0.10	\$53.50
02/21/23	SKT	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Correspondence with Network Reporting re M. Mueller's deposition transcript; correspondence with K. Postema re same.	0.10	\$21.50
02/21/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Review re email document production in WD case.	0.20	\$107.00
02/21/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Correspondence from N. Gambill and analyze and review State Motion to Lift Protective Order and Motion to Deem RFAs admitted.	1.80	\$963.00
02/21/23	KAP	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Receive and review correspondence re lifting confidentiality of deposition transcripts; briefly review deposition transcripts; review Plaintiffs motions to lift confidentiality and to deem facts admitted in Ingham case; confer with A. Kochis re same; review argument outlines for both motions.	2.10	\$556.50
02/21/23	KAP	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Continue review of emails for production in WD case; confer with A. Kochis re same.	2.20	\$583.00

02/22/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Analyze and review correspondence from N.Gambill re Ingham County jury trial.	0.30	\$160.50
02/22/23	KAP	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Draft responses to Plaintiff's motions to deem facts admitted and to lift confidentiality designation in Ingham case.	3.40	\$901.00
02/22/23	MHB	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Claims Review.	2.00	\$630.00
02/22/23	SKT	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Continue to review Opt In Claims.	3.00	\$645.00
02/23/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Revise Response to Motion to Lift Confidentiality Obligation and revise Response to Motion to Have RFAs Deemed Admitted.	1.40	\$749.00
02/23/23	KAP	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Continue drafting responses to Plaintiffs motions to deem facts admitted and to lift confidentiality designation in Ingham case; correspondence with A. Kochis re same.	2.40	\$636.00
02/23/23	AJK	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Review re claims reconciliation status.	0.20	\$107.00
02/23/23	KAP	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Correspondence re claims review; calls with M. Bass and S. Travis re same.	0.30	\$79.50
02/23/23	MHB	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Claims review.	5.00	\$1,575.00
02/23/23	SKT	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Touchpoint correspondence and call with WB Team re status of claims review.	0.30	\$64.50
02/23/23	SKT	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Continue to review Opt in Claims.	3.00	\$645.00
02/24/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Brief review re privileged email production.	0.20	\$107.00
02/24/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Telephone call from L. Mueller re Ingham County action.	0.30	\$160.50
02/24/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Revise and finalize Response to Motion to Lift Confidentiality Order and Motion to Deem Facts Admitted.	1.00	\$535.00
02/24/23	KAP	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Revise responses to Plaintiffs motions to deem facts admitted and to lift confidentiality designation in Ingham case; confer with A. Kochis re same.	1.00	\$265.00
02/24/23	KAP	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Continue review of email production in WD case; confer with A. Kochis re same; create privilege log for production.	2.70	\$715.50
02/24/23	AJK	B240 Tax Issues	Correspondence with Plante Morna re amended tax return.	0.10	\$53.50

02/24/23	MHB	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Claims review.	7.00	\$2,205.00
02/27/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Correspondence to case parties re Response to Motion to Deem Facts Admitted and Response to Motion to Lift Confidentiality Restrictions; correspondence from L. Mueller re hearing on both.	0.20	\$107.00
02/27/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Draft Supplemental Responses to Discovery Requests in WD case; revise Declaration of Wolfson re same; revise privilege log.	1.70	\$909.50
02/27/23	KAP	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Draft S. Wolfson affidavit re email production in WD case; review revisions re same.	1.00	\$265.00
02/27/23	LTG	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Researched right to jury trial with multiple parties; correspondence with A. Kochis regarding issue of jury demand with multiple parties.	1.80	\$423.00
02/27/23	AJK	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Review re First Omnibus response deadline and CNR; correspondence from Stretto re claims review and reconciliation.	0.40	\$214.00
02/27/23	KAP	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Continue claims review; draft CNR re First Omnibus Objection; draft stipulation and order reclassifying priority claims filed by McAlpine PC; confer with A. Kochis re same.	3.20	\$848.00
02/27/23	MHB	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Claims review.	3.00	\$945.00
02/27/23	SKT	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Continue Opt in claim review.	2.00	\$430.00
02/28/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Correspondence to N. Gambill re supplemental production in WD case.	0.30	\$160.50
02/28/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Prepare for hearings on State's Motion to Have Facts Deemed Admitted and Motion to Lift Confidentiality Restrictions.	0.50	\$267.50
02/28/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Receive and respond to correspondence from N. Gambill re discovery production in WD case.	0.50	\$267.50
02/28/23	AJK	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Review Ingham County Scheduling Order re jury trial and other open issues, including Order on Motion for Summary Disposition.	1.10	\$588.50
02/28/23	KAP	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Receive and review correspondence from N. Gambill re discovery requests in WD case; review email production; correspondence with S. Wolfson and A. Kochis re same; research re requirements of privilege log.	1.10	\$291.50
02/28/23	LTG	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Legal research re right to jury trial in Ingham County case.	0.30	\$70.50

02/28/23	LTG	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Drafted legal memorandum re the right to a jury trial for specific claims in equity and law.	0.80	\$188.00
02/28/23	LTG	B190 Other Contested Matters (excluding assumption/rejection motions)	Researched the right to a jury trial for specific claims in equity and law.	1.50	\$352.50
02/28/23	AJK	B240 Tax Issues	Correspondence from Plante Moran and correspondence to Stretto re service of grantor letters.	0.30	\$160.50
02/28/23	AJK	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Revise CNR re First Omnibus Objection to Claims.	0.30	\$160.50
02/28/23	AJK	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Review stipulation and order re McAlpine priority claims to be reclassified.	0.40	\$214.00
02/28/23	AJK	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Review re duplicate claims of joint filers.	0.60	\$321.00
02/28/23	KAP	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Review revisions to CNR for First Omnibus Objection and stipulation and order re McAlpine priority claims; confer with A. Kochis and M. Bass re claims reconciliation issues; continue claims review re second omnibus objection; correspondence with J. Blake re McAlpine PC priority claims.	1.60	\$424.00
02/28/23	MHB	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Claims review.	8.00	\$2,520.00
02/28/23	SKT	B310 Claims Administration and Objections	Continue Opt In Claims review.	3.50	\$752.50
			<b>TOTAL</b>	<b>207.50</b>	<b>\$71,890.00</b>

## Kogan Adv. Proc. Fees

Date	Timekeeper	Code	Description	Time	Value
12/01/22	AJK	L310 Written Discovery	Analyze and review Kogan discovery responses.	0.90	\$445.50
12/10/22	SKT	L120 Analysis/Strategy	Review invoices and compile data.	1.40	\$273.00
12/14/22	AJK	L120 Analysis/Strategy	Analyze and create analysis re services provided and avoidable transfers.	1.40	\$693.00
12/14/22	AJK	L160 Settlement/Non-Binding ADR	Correspondence to K. Clayson re mediator selection.	0.20	\$99.00
12/14/22	AJK	L160 Settlement/Non-Binding ADR	Telephone conference with K. Clayson re settlement status and mediation.	0.50	\$247.50
12/14/22	AJK	L200 Pre-Trial Pleadings and Motions	Correspondence from K. Clayson re request to amend affirmative defenses.	0.10	\$49.50
12/15/22	AJK	L210 Pleadings	Telephone conference and correspondence with K. Clayson re amendment of Affirmative Defenses and mediation.	0.40	\$198.00
12/16/22	AJK	L160 Settlement/Non-Binding ADR	Correspondence with K. Clayson re mediation.	0.20	\$99.00
12/19/22	AJK	L160 Settlement/Non-Binding ADR	Continue to analyze and review discovery document production and potential settlement posture.	1.50	\$742.50
12/20/22	AJK	L160 Settlement/Non-Binding ADR	Correspondence with K. Clayson re mediation.	0.10	\$49.50
12/21/22	AJK	L120 Analysis/Strategy	Legal research re reasonably equivalent value.	0.20	\$99.00
12/21/22	KAP	L120 Analysis/Strategy	Legal research re reasonably equivalent value and future consideration.	1.50	\$337.50
12/21/22	AJK	L160 Settlement/Non-Binding ADR	Continue to analyze and review transfer avoidance defenses and strength of claims.	0.70	\$346.50
12/22/22	AJK	L310 Written Discovery	Analyze and review Defendant discovery requests to Liquidating Trustee.	0.20	\$99.00
12/23/22	AJK	L160 Settlement/Non-Binding ADR	Telephone conference with K. Clayson and J. Teicher re mediation.	0.50	\$247.50
12/23/22	AJK	L160 Settlement/Non-Binding ADR	Draft stipulation and order appointing mediator.	0.30	\$148.50
01/03/23	AJK	L160 Settlement/Non-Binding ADR	Revise and finalize Stipulation and Order re mediation for filing; correspondence to J. Teicher re same.	0.20	\$107.00
01/04/23	AJK	L160 Settlement/Non-Binding ADR	Correspondence from J. Teicher re mediation agreement.	0.10	\$53.50
01/04/23	AJK	L310 Written Discovery	Begin drafting Responses to Defendant's Discovery Requests.	1.70	\$909.50
01/05/23	AJK	L160 Settlement/Non-Binding ADR	Outline mediation statement.	0.60	\$321.00
01/05/23	AJK	L310 Written Discovery	Continue drafting Responses to Discovery Requests.	1.20	\$642.00
01/10/23	AJK	L160 Settlement/Non-Binding ADR	Draft mediation statement.	2.00	\$1,070.00
01/10/23	AJK	L320 Document Production	Review and oversee document production.	0.40	\$214.00
01/11/23	AJK	L160 Settlement/Non-Binding ADR	Continue drafting Mediation Statement and fraudulent transfer analysis.	1.10	\$588.50
01/11/23	AJK	L320 Document Production	Gather additional documents for production.	0.10	\$53.50
01/17/23	AJK	L310 Written Discovery	Revise Responses to Discovery Requests.	0.20	\$107.00
01/18/23	AJK	L320 Document Production	Continue to gather document production.	0.20	\$107.00
01/20/23	AJK	L310 Written Discovery	Revise and finalize Discovery Responses and document production for filing and service.	0.50	\$267.50
01/24/23	AJK	L160 Settlement/Non-Binding ADR	Revise Mediation Statement and correspondence with S. Wolfson re recovery analysis.	0.90	\$481.50
01/26/23	AJK	L160 Settlement/Non-Binding ADR	Finalize Mediation Statement.	0.30	\$160.50
01/27/23	AJK	L160 Settlement/Non-Binding ADR	Finalize Mediation Brief; receive Defendant's Mediation Brief and begin to review.	0.70	\$374.50
02/01/23	AJK	L160 Settlement/Non-Binding ADR	Telephone conference with K. Clayson re potential adjourned mediation date.	0.30	\$160.50
02/02/23	AJK	L160 Settlement/Non-Binding ADR	Telephone conference with J. Teicher re adjournment of mediation; correspondence with K. Clayson re same; analyze and review Defendant Mediation Statement.	1.40	\$749.00
02/06/23	AJK	L160 Settlement/Non-Binding ADR	Correspondence with J. Teicher re mediation issues.	0.10	\$53.50
02/08/23	AJK	L160 Settlement/Non-Binding ADR	Telephone conference with J. Teicher re mediation issues; correspondence to J. Teicher and K. Clayson re same.	1.00	\$535.00
02/14/23	AJK	L200 Pre-Trial Pleadings and Motions	Prepare for mediation; review Scheduling Order dates and deadlines.	0.70	\$374.50
02/15/23	AJK	L160 Settlement/Non-Binding ADR	Prepare for and attend mediation.	7.20	\$3,852.00

02/15/23	AJK	L200 Pre-Trial Pleadings and Motions	Draft Stipulation and Order modifying Scheduling Order dates and deadlines; correspondence with K. Clayson re same.	0.70	\$374.50
02/16/23	AJK	L200 Pre-Trial Pleadings and Motions	Analyze and review entered Order Modifying Scheduling Order dates and deadlines.	0.10	\$53.50
02/17/23	AJK	L160 Settlement/Non-Binding ADR	Correspondence to K. Clayson re mediation follow up requests.	0.20	\$107.00
02/21/23	AJK	L160 Settlement/Non-Binding ADR	Analyze and review correspondence from K. Clayson re mediation issues.	0.10	\$53.50
02/21/23	AJK	L340 Expert Discovery	Zoom meeting with potential expert re expert report issues.	0.90	\$481.50
02/22/23	SKT	L340 Expert Discovery	Assemble potential expert's Boyce Hydro Insolvency documents.	0.50	\$107.50
02/22/23	AJK	L340 Expert Discovery	Correspondence with potential expert re expert issues.	0.20	\$107.00
02/23/23	AJK	L340 Expert Discovery	Telephone conference with potential expert re expert report needs.	0.40	\$214.00
02/24/23	AJK	L340 Expert Discovery	Telephone conference with potential expert re expert report needs.	0.30	\$160.50
02/27/23	AJK	L160 Settlement/Non-Binding ADR	Brief review re correspondence from K. Clayson re mediation issues.	0.10	\$53.50
02/27/23	AJK	L340 Expert Discovery	Telephone conference with potential expert re expert report needs.	0.30	\$160.50
02/28/23	AJK	L340 Expert Discovery	Correspondence with potential expert re terms of engagement.	0.10	\$53.50
			<b>TOTAL</b>	<b>34.90</b>	<b>\$17,282.50</b>

## WBK Expenses

Client	File		
Date	Code	Description	Value
Boyce Hydro, LLC, et al.		Boyce/WB Billing	
12/01/2022		FedEx re Ingham County Court Filing	<b>25.21</b>
Boyce Hydro, LLC, et al.		Boyce/WB Billing	
12/31/2022		Online Research - LexisNexis/CourtLink	<b>173.84</b>
Boyce Hydro, LLC, et al.		Boyce/WB Billing	
12/31/2022		Online Research re Kogan - LexisNexis/CourtLink	<b>45.59</b>
Boyce Hydro, LLC, et al.		Boyce/WB Billing	
12/31/2022		Printing/Copying Fees	<b>5.60</b>
Boyce Hydro, LLC, et al.		Boyce/WB Billing	
01/31/2023		Online Research - LexisNexis/CourtLink	<b>437.57</b>
Boyce Hydro, LLC, et al.		Boyce/WB Billing	
01/31/2023		Printing/Copying	<b>31.60</b>
Boyce Hydro, LLC, et al.		Boyce/WB Billing	
02/01/2023		FedEx to Ingham County Court	<b>28.80</b>
Boyce Hydro, LLC, et al.		Boyce/WB Billing	
02/07/2023		Mileage and parking re hearing in Western District.	<b>212.29</b>
Boyce Hydro, LLC, et al.		Boyce/WB Billing	
02/09/2023		FedEx check to Signature Bank	<b>25.67</b>

20-21214-dob Doc 804 Filed 03/16/23 Entered 03/16/23 12:05:31 Page 64 of 83

## WBK Expenses

Boyce Hydro, LLC, et al.	Boyce/WB Billing	
02/10/2023	Ingham Case Hearing Transcript	<b>185.00</b>
Boyce Hydro, LLC, et al.	Boyce/WB Billing	
02/15/2023	FedEx to Ingham County Circuit Court	<b>28.08</b>
Boyce Hydro, LLC, et al.	Boyce/WB Billing	
02/15/2023	Mileage re mediation in Southfield	<b>12.58</b>
Boyce Hydro, LLC, et al.	Boyce/WB Billing	
02/24/2023	FedEx to Ingham County Circuit Court	<b>23.11</b>
Boyce Hydro, LLC, et al.	Boyce/WB Billing	
02/28/2023	Online Research - LexisNexis/CourtLink	<b>206.38</b>
Boyce Hydro, LLC, et al.	Boyce/WB Billing	
02/28/2023	Print/Copy Fees	<b>125.60</b>
<b>Firm Totals</b>		<b>1,566.92</b>

# EXHIBIT 6c - Stretto Invoices

Stretto, Inc.  
410 Exchange, Ste 100  
Irvine, CA 92602  
800.634.7734  
StrettoCR-Billing@stretto.com

Invoice 7728



**BILL TO**  
Boyce Hydro, LLC

DATE	PLEASE PAY	DUE DATE
12/31/2022	\$ -534.96	01/30/2023

DATE	ACCOUNT SUMMARY	AMOUNT
11/30/2022	Balance Forward	43,296.84
12/31/2022	Payments and credits already applied to this invoice	-5,148.19
	Other payments and credits after 11/30/2022 through 12/30/2022	-43,831.80
12/31/2022	Other invoices from this date	0.00
	New charges (details below)	5,148.19
	Total Amount Due	-534.96

DESCRIPTION	QTY	RATE	AMOUNT
Hourly Fees			4,388.95
Electronic Imaging	109	0.11	11.99
License Fee and System Maintenance	5,875	0.11	646.25
Quarterly Court PACER Charges			101.00
			<b>TOTAL OF NEW CHARGES</b>
			<b>5,148.19</b>

PAID

**TOTAL DUE** **\$ -534.96**

THANK YOU.

For wire/ACH payments:

Bank Name – Pacific Western Bank

Bank Address – 110 West A Street, Suite 100, San Diego, CA 92101

Account No – 1000681781

ABA - 122238200

Beneficiary - Stretto

Remit Check Payments to:

Stretto: Attn Accounts Receivable

410 Exchange, Ste 100  
Irvine, CA 92602



**Case Name:** Boyce Hydro Liquidating Trust

## Summary of Hourly Fees

**Date Range:** 12/01/2022 - 12/31/2022

Role	Hours	Rate	Total
Analyst II	1.9	\$49.50	\$94.05
Analyst III	1.5	\$66.00	\$99.00
Associate II	5.0	\$112.50	\$562.50
Associate III	0.6	\$154.00	\$92.40
Director I	3.2	\$211.00	\$675.20
Director III	11.5	\$236.00	\$2,714.00
Managing Director	0.6	\$253.00	\$151.80
		<b>Total</b>	<b>\$4,388.95</b>

**Case Name:** Boyce Hydro Liquidating Trust

## Time Detail

**Date Range:** 12/01/2022 - 12/31/2022

Date	Employee Name	Role	Task	Description	Hours
12/01/2022	Abigail Nolasco	Analyst	Document Processing	Scan W9/W8 Forms received into case management system	1.8
12/01/2022	Abigail Nolasco	Associate	Document Processing	Input W9/W8 Forms received into case management system	3.0
12/01/2022	Melissa Membrino	Director	Document Processing	Facilitate W8/W9 Forms input in case management system for accuracy and completeness	0.4
12/01/2022	Sheryl Betance	Managing Director	Case Management	Senior management oversight of case activity including team correspondence, filed documents and client requests; check-in with case team	0.2
<b>Subtotal 12/01/2022</b>					<b>5.4</b>
Date	Employee Name	Role	Task	Description	Hours
12/05/2022	Abigail Nolasco	Analyst	Document Processing	Scan W9/W8 Forms received into case management system	0.1
12/05/2022	Abigail Nolasco	Associate	Document Processing	Input W9/W8 Forms received into case management system	0.2
12/05/2022	Clarissa Cu	Director	Claims Register Maintenance	Review draft exhibits and prepare claims last name, first	0.8
12/05/2022	Laura Tondreault	Analyst	Document Processing	Prepare and organize general case documents for accuracy and completeness	0.2
<b>Subtotal 12/05/2022</b>					<b>1.3</b>
Date	Employee Name	Role	Task	Description	Hours
12/06/2022	Aileen Daversa	Director	Claims Register Maintenance	Prepare for and participate on phone call with Trustee's counsel and Stretto team re claim objection next steps; confer with Stretto team re formatting of claims register data	0.7
12/06/2022	Clarissa Cu	Director	Claims Register Maintenance	Meeting with A. Kochis and team re upcoming claims objection filings; Confer with case team re formatting of claims register data; Review exhibits for upcoming claim objection exhibits	0.6
12/06/2022	Janira Sanabria	Associate	Data Formatting	Prepare and format special service list per docket no. 594	0.6
12/06/2022	Laura Tondreault	Analyst	Document Processing	Prepare and organize general case documents for accuracy and completeness	0.6
12/06/2022	Melissa Membrino	Director	Undeliverable Mail	Prepare and organize general case documents for accuracy and completeness	0.1
12/06/2022	Sabrina Tu	Associate	Document Processing	Review W9 Forms received into case management system	1.0
12/06/2022	Sheryl Betance	Managing Director	Case Management	Senior management oversight of case activity including team correspondence, filed documents and client requests; check-in with case team	0.1
<b>Subtotal 12/06/2022</b>					<b>3.7</b>

Date	Employee Name	Role	Task	Description	Hours
12/09/2022	Aileen Daversa	Director	Case Management	Review draft exhibits and format creditor name by last name, first	0.5
12/09/2022	Clarissa Cu	Director	Claims Register Maintenance	Prepare link to disseminate Denenberg files per K. Postema	0.1
<b>Subtotal 12/09/2022</b>					<b>0.6</b>
Date	Employee Name	Role	Task	Description	Hours
12/10/2022	Aileen Daversa	Director	Case Management	Review draft exhibits and format creditor name by last name, first	1.2
<b>Subtotal 12/10/2022</b>					<b>1.2</b>
Date	Employee Name	Role	Task	Description	Hours
12/12/2022	Laura Tondreault	Analyst	Document Processing	Prepare and organize general case documents for accuracy and completeness	0.5
<b>Subtotal 12/12/2022</b>					<b>0.5</b>
Date	Employee Name	Role	Task	Description	Hours
12/16/2022	Aileen Daversa	Director	Case Management	Make updates to claim register; identify potential objections; define next steps	1.7
<b>Subtotal 12/16/2022</b>					<b>1.7</b>
Date	Employee Name	Role	Task	Description	Hours
12/17/2022	Aileen Daversa	Director	Case Management	Claims analysis; correspondence with Stretto team re same	3.4
12/17/2022	Sheryl Betance	Managing Director	Case Management	Senior management oversight of case activity including team correspondence, filed documents and client requests; check-in with case team	0.1
<b>Subtotal 12/17/2022</b>					<b>3.5</b>
Date	Employee Name	Role	Task	Description	Hours
12/23/2022	Aileen Daversa	Director	Case Management	Claims register and objection analysis; correspondence with Trustee's counsel re same	4.0
12/23/2022	Kacie Tu	Director	Case Management	Generate custom report per request by A. Daversa	0.5
12/23/2022	Sheryl Betance	Managing Director	Case Management	Senior management oversight of case activity including team correspondence, filed documents and client requests; check-in with case team	0.2
<b>Subtotal 12/23/2022</b>					<b>4.7</b>
Date	Employee Name	Role	Task	Description	Hours
12/27/2022	Kacie Tu	Director	Case Management	Update claim records per request by A. Daversa	0.7
<b>Subtotal 12/27/2022</b>					<b>0.7</b>
Date	Employee Name	Role	Task	Description	Hours
12/28/2022	Laura Tondreault	Analyst	Document Processing	Prepare and organize general case documents for accuracy and completeness	0.1
<b>Subtotal 12/28/2022</b>					<b>0.1</b>

<b>Date</b>	<b>Employee Name</b>	<b>Role</b>	<b>Task</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>
12/29/2022	Sabrina Tu	Associate	Document Processing	Input W9 Forms received into case management system	0.2
12/29/2022	Sabrina Tu	Associate	Document Processing	Review W9 Forms input in case management system for accuracy and completeness	0.6
<b>Subtotal 12/29/2022</b>					<b>0.8</b>
<b>Date</b>	<b>Employee Name</b>	<b>Role</b>	<b>Task</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>
12/30/2022	Laura Tondreault	Analyst	Document Processing	Prepare and organize general case documents for accuracy and completeness	0.1
<b>Subtotal 12/30/2022</b>					<b>0.1</b>
<b>Total 12/01/2022 - 12/31/2022</b>					<b>24.3</b>

Stretto, Inc.  
410 Exchange, Ste 100  
Irvine, CA 92602  
800.634.7734  
StrettoCR-Billing@stretto.com

# Invoice 7806



**BILL TO**  
Boyce Hydro, LLC

DATE	PLEASE PAY	DUE DATE
01/31/2023	\$5,010.75	03/02/2023

DATE	ACCOUNT SUMMARY	AMOUNT
12/31/2022	Balance Forward	-534.96
	Other payments and credits after 12/31/2022 through 01/30/2023	0.00
01/31/2023	Other invoices from this date	0.00
	New charges (details below)	5,545.71
	Total Amount Due	5,010.75

DESCRIPTION	QTY	RATE	AMOUNT
Hourly Fees			4,172.60
Printing	4,919	0.11	541.09
Postage			153.00
Envelopes and Packaging – See Noticing Summary for details			9.45
Electronic Imaging	196	0.11	21.56
License Fee and System Maintenance	5,891	0.11	648.01
	TOTAL OF NEW CHARGES		5,545.71
	TOTAL DUE		<b>\$5,010.75</b>

THANK YOU.

For wire/ACH payments:

Bank Name – Pacific Western Bank

Bank Address – 110 West A Street, Suite 100, San Diego, CA 92101

Account No – 1000681781

ABA - 122238200

Beneficiary - Stretto

Remit Check Payments to:

Stretto: Attn Accounts Receivable

410 Exchange, Ste 100  
Irvine, CA 92602



## Noticing Detail

Date of Service	Document(s) or Mailing Description	Number of Recipients	Method(s) of Service
1/16/2023	Printed POCs for FRC	1	First Class Mail
1/23/2023	1st Omnibus Claims Objection JOHNSON (DN 788)	2	First Class Mail Email
1/23/2023	1st Omnibus Claims Objection RASOR (DN 788)	2	First Class Mail Email
1/23/2023	First Omni Claims Objection (DN 788)	52	First Class Mail Email
1/23/2023	1st Omnibus Claims Objection NAPOLI (DN 788)	2	First Class Mail Email
1/23/2023	1st Omnibus Claims Objection OLSMAN (DN 788)	2	First Class Mail Email
1/23/2023	1st Omnibus Claims Objection STUTMAN (DN 788)	2	First Class Mail Email



**Case Name:** Boyce Hydro Liquidating Trust

## Summary of Hourly Fees

**Date Range:** 01/01/2023 - 01/31/2023

Role	Hours	Rate	Total
Analyst II	2.9	\$54.00	\$156.60
Analyst III	0.6	\$72.00	\$43.20
Associate I	2.5	\$78.00	\$195.00
Associate II	4.3	\$123.00	\$528.90
Associate III	3.5	\$169.00	\$591.50
Director I	7.8	\$232.00	\$1,809.60
Director III	2.2	\$259.00	\$569.80
Managing Director	1.0	\$278.00	\$278.00
		<b>Total</b>	<b>\$4,172.60</b>

**Case Name:** Boyce Hydro Liquidating Trust

## Time Detail

**Date Range:** 01/01/2023 - 01/31/2023

Date	Employee Name	Role	Task	Description	Hours
01/03/2023	Melissa Membrino	Director	Claims Processing	Facilitate claims processing received for scanning into case management system	0.4
					<b>Subtotal 01/03/2023</b> 0.4
Date	Employee Name	Role	Task	Description	Hours
01/04/2023	Abigail Nolasco	Analyst	Document Processing	Scan W9/W8 Forms received into case management system	0.6
					<b>Subtotal 01/04/2023</b> 0.6
Date	Employee Name	Role	Task	Description	Hours
01/05/2023	Abigail Nolasco	Analyst	Document Processing	Scan W9/W8 Forms received into case management system	0.7
01/05/2023	Aileen Daversa	Director	Case Management	Correspondence with Liquidating Trustee's counsel re amended claim objections	0.1
01/05/2023	Kristine Tu	Associate	Document Processing	Input W9/W8 Forms received into case management system	0.9
01/05/2023	Sheryl Betance	Managing Director	Case Management	Senior management oversight of case activity including team correspondence, filed documents and client requests; check-in with case team	0.1
					<b>Subtotal 01/05/2023</b> 1.8
Date	Employee Name	Role	Task	Description	Hours
01/06/2023	Abigail Nolasco	Analyst	Document Processing	Scan W9/W8 Forms received into case management system	0.2
					<b>Subtotal 01/06/2023</b> 0.2
Date	Employee Name	Role	Task	Description	Hours
01/09/2023	Clarissa Cu	Director	Creditor Correspondence	Respond to creditor inquiry (S. Rupp) via email re: Mass Coalition proof of claim	0.1
01/09/2023	Melissa Membrino	Director	Document Processing	Prepare and organize general case documents for accuracy and completeness	0.3
					<b>Subtotal 01/09/2023</b> 0.4
Date	Employee Name	Role	Task	Description	Hours
01/11/2023	Abigail Nolasco	Analyst	Document Processing	Scan W9/W8 Forms received into case management system	0.8
					<b>Subtotal 01/11/2023</b> 0.8

<b>Date</b>	<b>Employee Name</b>	<b>Role</b>	<b>Task</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>
01/12/2023	Abigail Nolasco	Analyst	Document Processing	Case file case related documents	0.1
01/12/2023	Clarissa Cu	Director	Claims Register Maintenance	Review Stipulation between Liquidating Trustee and Cohen Milsten [docket no. 782] re expungement of certain claims; Format and import claim updates into case management database in preparation for Order	0.8
01/12/2023	Kristine Tu	Associate	Document Processing	Input W9/W8 Forms received into case management system	1.0
01/12/2023	Sheryl Betance	Managing Director	Case Management	Senior management oversight of case activity including team correspondence, filed documents and client requests; check-in with case team	0.1
<b>Subtotal 01/12/2023</b>					<b>2.0</b>
<b>Date</b>	<b>Employee Name</b>	<b>Role</b>	<b>Task</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>
01/13/2023	Clarissa Cu	Director	Claims Processing	Remove pending claim objections in case management database per Notice of Withdrawal [Docket No. 783]	0.2
01/13/2023	Clarissa Cu	Director	Claims Register Maintenance	Review Stipulation between Liquidating Trustee and Cohen Milsten [docket no. 784] re expungement of certain claims; Format and import claim updates into case management database in preparation for Order	0.6
<b>Subtotal 01/13/2023</b>					<b>0.8</b>
<b>Date</b>	<b>Employee Name</b>	<b>Role</b>	<b>Task</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>
01/16/2023	Abigail Nolasco	Analyst	Document Processing	Scan W9/W8 Forms received into case management system	0.2
01/16/2023	Abigail Nolasco	Associate	Document Processing	Input W9/W8 Forms received into case management system	0.2
<b>Subtotal 01/16/2023</b>					<b>0.4</b>
<b>Date</b>	<b>Employee Name</b>	<b>Role</b>	<b>Task</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>
01/17/2023	Aileen Daversa	Director	Case Management	Prepare for and participate on phone call with Liquidating trustee's counsel re claim reconciliation and objection next steps	0.6
<b>Subtotal 01/17/2023</b>					<b>0.6</b>
<b>Date</b>	<b>Employee Name</b>	<b>Role</b>	<b>Task</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>
01/18/2023	Aileen Daversa	Director	Case Management	Review amended claim objection and confirm surviving law firm for liquidating trustee's counsel	1.0
01/18/2023	Sheryl Betance	Managing Director	Case Management	Senior management oversight of case activity including team correspondence, filed documents and client requests; check-in with case team	0.1
<b>Subtotal 01/18/2023</b>					<b>1.1</b>
<b>Date</b>	<b>Employee Name</b>	<b>Role</b>	<b>Task</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>
01/20/2023	Aileen Daversa	Director	Case Management	Phone call with liquidating trustee's counsel re amended claim objections; phone call with Stretto team re same	0.3
01/20/2023	Clarissa Cu	Director	Claims Register Maintenance	Review Stipulation and Order between Liquidating Trustee and Pitt McGehee [Docket Nos. 786-787] re expungement of certain claims; Format and import claim updates into case management database	1.0
01/20/2023	Laura Tondreault	Analyst	Document Processing	Prepare and organize general case documents for accuracy and completeness	0.6

Date	Employee Name	Role	Task	Description	Hours
01/20/2023	Sheryl Betance	Managing Director	Case Management	Senior management oversight of case activity including team correspondence, filed documents and client requests; check-in with case team	0.1
<b>Subtotal 01/20/2023</b>					<b>2.0</b>
Date	Employee Name	Role	Task	Description	Hours
01/23/2023	Abigail Nolasco	Analyst	Document Processing	Scan W9/W8 Forms received into case management system	0.1
01/23/2023	Aileen Daversa	Director	Case Management	Attention to service of docket nos. 788	0.2
01/23/2023	Aimee Marshall	Associate	Noticing	Generate service of 1st Omnibus Claims Objection STUTMAN (DN 788) mailing including printing and fulfillment	0.2
01/23/2023	Aimee Marshall	Associate	Noticing	Generate service of 1st Omnibus Claims Objection RASOR (DN 788) mailing including printing and fulfillment	0.2
01/23/2023	Aimee Marshall	Associate	Noticing	Generate service of 1st Omnibus Claims Objection OLSMAN (DN 788) mailing including printing and fulfillment	0.2
01/23/2023	Aimee Marshall	Associate	Noticing	Generate service of 1st Omnibus Claims Objection NAPOLI (DN 788) mailing including printing and fulfillment	0.2
01/23/2023	Aimee Marshall	Associate	Noticing	Generate service of 1st Omnibus Claims Objection JOHNSON (DN 788) mailing including printing and fulfillment	0.2
01/23/2023	Aimee Marshall	Associate	Noticing	Generate service of First Omni Claims Objection (DN 788) mailing including printing and fulfillment	0.1
01/23/2023	Alberto Chachagua	Associate	Noticing	Generate service of 1st Omnibus Claims Objection JOHNSON (DN 788) mailing including printing and fulfillment	0.2
01/23/2023	Alberto Chachagua	Associate	Noticing	Generate service of 1st Omnibus Claims Objection RASOR (DN 788) mailing including printing and fulfillment	0.2
01/23/2023	Alberto Chachagua	Associate	Noticing	Generate service of First Omni Claims Objection (DN 788) mailing including printing and fulfillment	0.6
01/23/2023	Alberto Chachagua	Associate	Noticing	Generate service of 1st Omnibus Claims Objection NAPOLI (DN 788) mailing including printing and fulfillment	0.2
01/23/2023	Alberto Chachagua	Associate	Noticing	Generate service of 1st Omnibus Claims Objection OLSMAN (DN 788) mailing including printing and fulfillment	0.2
01/23/2023	Alberto Chachagua	Associate	Noticing	Generate service of 1st Omnibus Claims Objection STUTMAN (DN 788) mailing including printing and fulfillment	0.2
01/23/2023	Clarissa Cu	Director	Noticing	Coordinate service re: docket no. 788 on SSL and affected claimants per K. Postema and related certificate of service	2.3
01/23/2023	Clarissa Cu	Director	Claims Register Maintenance	Review and process First Omnibus Claim Objection per docket no. 788; Input claim objections for amended and duplicate claims (exhibits 4 and 5) into case management database	1.8
01/23/2023	David Bribiesca	Associate	Noticing	Generate service of First Omni Claims Objection (DN 788) mailing including printing and fulfillment	0.8
01/23/2023	David Bribiesca	Associate	Noticing	Generate service of 1st Omnibus Claims Objection JOHNSON (DN 788) mailing including printing and fulfillment	0.4
01/23/2023	David Bribiesca	Associate	Noticing	Generate service of 1st Omnibus Claims Objection NAPOLI (DN 788) mailing including printing and fulfillment	0.3

Date	Employee Name	Role	Task	Description	Hours
01/23/2023	David Bribiesca	Associate	Noticing	Generate service of 1st Omnibus Claims Objection OLSMAN (DN 788) mailing including printing and fulfillment	0.3
01/23/2023	David Bribiesca	Associate	Noticing	Generate service of 1st Omnibus Claims Objection RASOR (DN 788) mailing including printing and fulfillment	0.3
01/23/2023	David Bribiesca	Associate	Noticing	Generate service of 1st Omnibus Claims Objection STUTMAN (DN 788) mailing including printing and fulfillment	0.3
01/23/2023	Janira Sanabria	Associate	Noticing	Coordinate service re: docket no. 788 per K. Postema	0.9
01/23/2023	Janira Sanabria	Associate	Noticing	Prepare and file the Affidavit of Service re: docket no. 788	0.8
01/23/2023	Melissa Membrino	Director	Noticing	Coordinate service of First Omni Claims Objection (DN 788) mailing including printing and fulfillment	0.3
01/23/2023	Sheryl Betance	Managing Director	Noticing	Facilitate service of First Omni Claims Objection (DN 788) mailing	0.2
01/23/2023	Sheryl Betance	Managing Director	Case Management	Senior management oversight of case activity including team correspondence, filed documents and client requests; check-in with case team	0.4
<b>Subtotal 01/23/2023</b>					<b>12.1</b>
Date	Employee Name	Role	Task	Description	Hours
01/29/2023	Naomi Rodriguez	Associate	Noticing	Administrative review of mailing details	0.6
<b>Subtotal 01/29/2023</b>					<b>0.6</b>
Date	Employee Name	Role	Task	Description	Hours
01/30/2023	Abigail Nolasco	Analyst	Document Processing	Scan W9/W8 Forms received into case management system	0.1
01/30/2023	Abigail Nolasco	Associate	Document Processing	Input W9/W8 Forms received into case management system	0.1
<b>Subtotal 01/30/2023</b>					<b>0.2</b>
Date	Employee Name	Role	Task	Description	Hours
01/31/2023	Abigail Nolasco	Analyst	Document Processing	Scan W9/W8 Forms received into case management system	0.1
01/31/2023	Janira Sanabria	Associate	Data Formatting	Prepare and format SSL per docket no. 594	0.7
<b>Subtotal 01/31/2023</b>					<b>0.8</b>
<b>Total 01/01/2023 - 01/31/2023</b>					<b>24.8</b>

# EXHIBIT 6d - Plante & Moran, PLLC Invoices



Plante & Moran, PLLC  
3000 Town Center  
Suite 100  
Southfield, MI 48075  
Tel:248.352.2500  
Fax:248.352.0018

## INVOICE

Boyce Hydro Liquidating Trust  
3150 Livernois, Suite 275  
Troy, MI 48083

Date: January 21, 2023  
Client No: 133694  
Invoice No: 2239486  
Page: 1

For Professional Services Rendered

Progress billing for professional services rendered December 1  
through December 31, 2022.

Fees in accordance with our engagement letters dated April 2, 2021.

Accounting services 1,733.00

Expenses 43.00  
• Accounting software subscription

Balance Due \$ 1,776.00 USD

### Remittance information:

<u>Check:</u>	<u>Wire Transfer:</u>	<u>ACH:</u>	
Plante & Moran, PLLC 16060 Collections Center Drive Chicago, IL 60693	Bank Routing/ABA# Bank Address Account Number Account Name	Bank of America 026009593 100 West 33rd Street New York, NY 10001 9890996003 Plante & Moran, PLLC	Bank of America 071000039 1401 Elm Street 2nd Floor Dallas, TX 75202 9890996003 Plante & Moran, PLLC



Progress billing for services rendered December 2022

Date	job	Staff	Service Description	Hours
12/1/2022	Accounting Services	Lori Langley	bank activity, documentation	0.50
12/2/2022	Accounting Services	Lori Langley	bank activity, QBO	1.50
12/5/2022	Accounting Services	Lori Langley	bank activity, QBO, documentation	1.00
12/6/2022	Accounting Services	Lori Langley	bank activity, QBO	0.50
12/7/2022	Accounting Services	Lori Langley	bank activity, QBO	0.50
12/9/2022	Accounting Services	Lori Langley	bank activity, QBO, documentation	1.00
12/12/2022	Accounting Services	Lori Langley	bank activity, QBO, documentation	1.00
12/14/2022	Accounting Services	Lori Langley	bank activity, QBO	1.00
12/16/2022	Accounting Services	Lori Langley	bank activity	0.50
12/19/2022	Accounting Services	Lori Langley	bank activity, QBO, documentation	1.00
12/21/2022	Accounting Services	Lori Langley	bank activity, QBO	1.00
12/22/2022	Accounting Services	Lori Langley	bank activity, QBO	1.00
<b><i>Lori Langley Total</i></b>				<b>10.50</b>
<b><i>Grand Total Accounting Services</i></b>				<b>10.5</b>

## INVOICE

Boyce Hydro Liquidating Trust  
 3150 Livernois, Suite 275  
 Troy, MI 48083

Date: February 14, 2023  
 Client No: 133694  
 Invoice No: 2249732  
 Page: 1

For Professional Services Rendered

Progress billing for professional services rendered January 1  
 through January 31, 2023.

Fees in accordance with our engagement letters dated April 2, 2021.

Accounting services	1,360.00
---------------------	----------

Expenses	43.00
• Accounting software subscription	

Balance Due	<u><u>\$ 1,403.00</u></u> USD
-------------	-------------------------------

**Remittance information:**

**Check:**

Plante & Moran, PLLC  
 16060 Collections Center Drive  
 Chicago, IL 60693

**Wire Transfer:**

Bank: Bank of America  
 Routing/ABA#: 026009593  
 Bank Address: 100 West 33rd Street  
 New York, NY 10001  
 Account Number: 9890996003  
 Account Name: Plante & Moran, PLLC

**ACH:**

Bank of America  
 071000039  
 1401 Elm Street 2nd Floor  
 Dallas, TX 75202  
 9890996003  
 Plante & Moran, PLLC



Progress billing for services rendered January 2023

Date	Job	Staff	Service Description	Hours
1/4/2023	Accounting Services	Lori Langley	bank activity, QBO	0.50
1/5/2023	Accounting Services	Lori Langley	bank activity, QBO	0.50
1/9/2023	Accounting Services	Lori Langley	bank activity, QBO	2.50
1/11/2023	Accounting Services	Lori Langley	bank activity, QBO	1.00
1/13/2023	Accounting Services	Lori Langley	bank activity, QBO	0.50
1/16/2023	Accounting Services	Lori Langley	bank activity, QBO	0.50
1/18/2023	Accounting Services	Lori Langley	bank activity, QBO	0.50
1/20/2023	Accounting Services	Lori Langley	bank activity, QBO	0.50
1/24/2023	Accounting Services	Lori Langley	bank activity, QBO	0.50
1/27/2023	Accounting Services	Lori Langley	bank activity, QBO	0.50
1/30/2023	Accounting Services	Lori Langley	bank activity, QBO	0.50
<b><i>Lori Langley Total</i></b>				<b><i>8.00</i></b>
<b><i>Grand Total Accounting Services</i></b>				<b><i>8.00</i></b>

## INVOICE

Boyce Hydro Liquidating Trust  
 3150 Livernois, Suite 275  
 Troy, MI 48083

Date: March 6, 2023  
 Client No: 133694  
 Invoice No: 2259573  
 Page: 1

For Professional Services Rendered

Progress billing for professional services rendered February 1  
 through February 28, 2023.

Fees in accordance with our engagement letters dated April 2, 2021.

Accounting services	935.00
Tax services	460.00
• Initial work towards preparation of 2022 Boyce Hydro Liquidating Trust grantor trust return.	
Expenses	43.00
• Accounting software subscription	

**Balance Due** **\$ 1,438.00** **USD**

**Remittance information:**

**Check:**

Plante & Moran, PLLC  
 16060 Collections Center Drive  
 Chicago, IL 60693

**Wire Transfer:**

Bank: Bank of America  
 Routing/ABA#: 026009593  
 Bank Address: 100 West 33rd Street  
 New York, NY 10001  
 Account Number: 9890996003  
 Account Name: Plante & Moran, PLLC

**ACH:**

Bank of America  
 071000039  
 1401 Elm Street 2nd Floor  
 Dallas, TX 75202  
 9890996003  
 Plante & Moran, PLLC



Progress billing for services rendered February 2023

Date		Staff	Service description	Hours
2/1/2023	Accounting Services	Lori Langley	bank activity, QBO	0.50
2/6/2023	Accounting Services	Lori Langley	bank activity, QBO	0.50
2/10/2023	Accounting Services	Lori Langley	bank activity, QBO	1.00
2/13/2023	Accounting Services	Lori Langley	bank activity, QBO	0.50
2/15/2023	Accounting Services	Lori Langley	bank activity, QBO	0.50
2/17/2023	Accounting Services	Lori Langley	bank activity, QBO	0.50
2/20/2023	Accounting Services	Lori Langley	bank activity, QBO	0.50
2/24/2023	Accounting Services	Lori Langley	bank activity, QBO	1.00
2/27/2023	Accounting Services	Lori Langley	bank activity, QBO	0.50
<b>Lori Langley Total</b>				<b>5.50</b>
<b>Accounting Services Total</b>				<b>5.50</b>

2/18/2023	Tax Services	Alaa Hider	Case management	0.40
<b>Alaa Hider Total</b>				<b>0.40</b>
2/17/2023	Tax Services	Brian Schultz	Case management	0.10
2/24/2023	Tax Services	Brian Schultz	Case management	0.20
<b>Brian Schultz Total</b>				<b>0.30</b>
2/24/2023	Tax Services	John Dwyer	Case management	0.60
<b>John Dwyer Total</b>				<b>0.60</b>
<b>Tax Services Total</b>				1.30