### IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT FOR THE DISTRICT OF UTAH

SAFEMOON US LLC,

In re:

Bankruptcy Case No. 23-25749 Chapter 7

Debtor.

Honorable Peggy Hunt

# FIRST INTERIM APPLICATION OF DUNDON ADVISERS LLC FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION INCURRED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES AS FINANCIAL ADVISOR TO ELLEN E. OSTROW, CHAPTER 7 TRUSTEE

Name of Applicant:	Dundon Advisers LLC
Authorized to provide professional services to:	Ellen E. Ostrow, Chapter 7 Trustee
Time Period covered by this Application:	December 20, 2023 through October 31, 2024
Total Compensation sought this period:	\$546,926.00
Total Expenses sought this period:	\$313.80
Petition Date:	December 14, 2023
Retention Date:	December 20, 2023
Date of Order approving employment:	January 24, 2024, effective as of December 20, 2023
Total compensation approved by interim order to date:	\$0.00
Total expenses approved by interim order to date:	\$0.00
Total allowed compensation paid to date:	\$0.00
Total allowed expenses paid to date:	\$0.00
Blended rate in this application for all timekeepers:	\$769.45
Number of professionals included in this application:	9
If applicable, number of professionals in this application not included in staffing plan approved by client:	N/A

### Case 23-25749 Doc 242 Filed 12/06/24 Entered 12/06/24 10:36:02 Desc Main Document Page 2 of 34

If applicable, difference between fees budgeted and compensation sought for this period:	N/A
Number of professionals billing fewer than 15 hours to the case during this period:	4
Are any rates higher than those approved or disclosed at retention? If yes, calculate and disclose the total compensation sought in this application using the rates originally disclosed in the retention application:	N/A
This is a(n):MonthlyX_Interim	Final Application

Dundon Advisers LLC ("Dundon" or the "Applicant"), as financial advisor to Ellen E. Ostrow (the "Trustee"), the duly-appointed trustee in the above-entitled Chapter 7 Bankruptcy Case (the "Bankruptcy Case") filed by SafeMoon US LLC (the "Debtor"), pursuant to sections §§ 330 and 331 of title 11 of the United States Code (the "Bankruptcy Code") and Rule 2016 of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure (the "Bankruptcy Rules"), files this first interim application for compensation for professional services rendered, and for reimbursement for actual and necessary costs and expenses incurred (the "Interim Fee Application") for the period of December 20, 2023 through October 31, 2024 (the "Fee Period"). In support of the Interim Fee Application, Dundon respectfully represents as follows:

#### **JURISDICTION AND VENUE**

- 1. The Court has jurisdiction over this Interim Fee Application pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 157 and 1334. This is a core proceeding pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 157(b)(2). Venue of the Bankruptcy Case and this proceeding is proper in this district pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 1408 and 1409.
- 2. The bases for the relief requested herein are §§ 330 and 331 of the Bankruptcy Code and Rule 2016 of the Bankruptcy Rules.

### **BACKGROUND**

#### A. Bankruptcy Case

3. The Debtor was a cryptocurrency and blockchain company based in Pleasant Grove, Utah. The Debtor was created in March 2021. Concurrently with its inception, the Debtor created and sold a SafeMoon token ("SFM Token") that trades on the BNB Chain (Binance)

Case 23-25749 Doc 242 Filed 12/06/24 Entered 12/06/24 10:36:02 Desc Main Document Page 4 of 34

blockchain. The value of the SFM Token increased exponentially in its first month of existence, resulting in the total market value of the token rising to the billions of dollars in April 2021.

- 4. Over time, however, allegations that the Debtor's principals made misrepresentations and engaged in other alleged misconduct led to a sharp reduction in the market price of the SFM Tokens.
- 5. On February 17, 2022, certain individuals filed a class action complaint against the Debtor, Braden John Karony (the Debtor's former CEO), Kyle Nagy (the Debtor's founder), and various other executives and/or insiders of the Debtor, in the United States District Court for the District of Utah (the "Class Action Complaint"). See Combs et al v. SafeMoon LLC et al, Case No. 22-cv-00642 (D. Utah). In the Class Action Complaint, as it has been amended, the plaintiffs allege that the Debtor and other defendants violated, among other things, Section 10(b) of the Securities Exchange Act of 1934 (15 U.S.C. §78j(b)) (the "Exchange Act"), Rule 10b-5(b) promulgated thereof, and various other federal and state laws by making false statements of material fact and engaging in a scheme to defraud investors relating to the purchase or sale of a security (i.e., the SFM Token).
- 6. On November 1, 2023, the Securities and Exchange Commission ("SEC") filed a Complaint against the Debtor and others in the United States District Court for the Eastern District of New York. See Securities and Exchange Commission v. SafeMoon LLC et al, Case No. 23-08138 (E.D.N.Y.) (the "SEC Case"). In the SEC Case, the SEC asserts various claims against the Debtor and other Defendants under the Exchange Act, Rule 10b-5 and the Securities Act of 1933 (15 U.S.C. § 77a et seq.).

- 7. The Debtor commenced the Bankruptcy Case on December 14, 2023 (the "*Petition Date*") by filing a voluntary petition for relief under Chapter 7 of the Bankruptcy Code.
- 8. The Trustee is the duly qualified and acting Chapter 7 trustee in the Bankruptcy Case.

### B. Retention of Dundon Advisers LLC

- 9. On December 29, 2023, the Trustee filed the Application of Ellen E. Ostrow, Chapter 7 Trustee, for Entry of an Order Authorizing the Trustee to Retain and Employ Dundon Advisers LLC as her Financial Advisor Effective as of December 20, 2023 [Dkt. No. 18] (the "Dundon Retention Application").
- 10. As set forth in the Dundon Retention Application, the Trustee determined that the services of a financial advisor were necessary to enable her to administer the Estate in the Bankruptcy Case. The Trustee retained Dundon to render services to her in the Bankruptcy Case, including, without limitation, the following:
  - a. Analyzing the business, assets, liabilities, and financial affairs of the Debtor and the Estate;
  - b. Analyzing the Debtor's Statements and Schedules, and valuing the Debtor's assets, liabilities and financial affairs as requested by the Trustee;
  - c. Assisting in the analysis, review, and monitoring of the bankruptcy process, including but not limited to, an assessment of the unsecured claims pool and potential recoveries for unsecured creditors;
  - d. Assisting the Trustee in securing, protecting and liquidating cryptocurrency assets of the Debtor;
  - e. Assisting the Trustee in marketing and monetizing the Debtor's assets and evaluating whether a sale or sales of those assets is appropriate and in the best interests of the Estate;

- f. Assisting the Trustee in investigating potential claims and causes of action against various parties;
- g. Advising the Trustee about the Estate's assets, and helping the Trustee monetize unencumbered assets for the benefit of creditors;
- h. Assisting the Trustee in analyzing and pursuing any proposed dispositions of assets of the Estate;
- i. Pursuing any claims and causes of action of the Estate, including, but not limited to Chapter 5 avoidance claims and any state-law claims;
- j. Defending the Trustee and the Estate in any litigation matters which may be asserted, including the defense of motions seeking relief from the automatic stay;
- k. Assisting the Trustee in providing information to creditors and other parties in interest;
  - Reviewing, analyzing, and advising the Trustee regarding fee applications or other issues involving professional compensation in the Bankruptcy Case;
- l. Assisting the Trustee in negotiations with various creditor constituencies regarding treatment, resolution, and payment of creditor claims; and
- m. Performing all other necessary financial services as may be required by the needs of the Trustee in the Bankruptcy Case.
- n. Determining whether there are viable alternative paths for the disposition of the Debtors' assets from those being currently proposed by the Debtors, such as alternative buyers or partial sales of the Debtor's assets to different purchasers;
- o. Assisting the Trustee in identifying, valuing, and pursuing estate causes of action, including but not limited to, relating to pre-petition transactions, control person liability, and lender liability;
- p. Assisting the Trustee in preparing Debtor's financial reports, including, but not limited to, statements of financial affairs, schedules of assets and liabilities, cash budgets, and monthly operating reports;
- q. Attending meetings and assist in discussions with the Trustee, the Debtor, the U.S. Trustee, other parties in interest and professionals;
- r. Performing such other advisory services for the Trustee as may be necessary or proper in these proceedings, subject to the aforementioned scope; and
- s. Provide testimony on behalf of the Trustee as and when may be deemed

Case 23-25749 Doc 242 Filed 12/06/24 Entered 12/06/24 10:36:02 Desc Main Document Page 7 of 34

appropriate.

11. On January 24, 2024, the Court entered an order granting the Dundon Retention Application [Dkt. No. 48] (the "*Dundon Retention Order*").

### C. Dundon's Assistance to the Trustee During the Fee Period

- 12. While the Debtor was no longer marketing SafeMoon tokens ("SFM Tokens") as of the Petition Date, an immediate liquidation of all assets by the Trustee would have been detrimental to the estate and its creditors. The Trustee needed to maintain the Debtor's platform to, among other things, transition certain crypto wallets, market and sell the Debtor's operating assets, liquidate substantial crypto assets and convert them to cash, and manage crypto "liquidity pools." Accordingly, pursuant to § 721, Dundon worked with counsel to the Trustee, Foley & Lardner LLP ("Foley") in assisting the Trustee in obtaining the authority to hire certain former employees of the Debtor as independent contractors and operate the Debtor's business for a limited time (the "721 Order"). See Docket No. 15. The Bankruptcy Court renewed the Trustee's authority to operate the Debtor's business pursuant to the 721 Order on multiple occasions, until it expired on April 25, 2024. See Docket Nos. 35, 73 and 146.
- 13. The Trustee, with the assistance of Foley and Dundon, has made significant progress converting the Debtor's assets to cash in this chapter 7 case. *First*, the Trustee, with the assistance of Foley and Dundon, converted substantial Ethereum to cash pursuant to the authority granted to the Trustee under the 721 Order. *Second*, pursuant to authority provided by the Bankruptcy Court and after an extensive bidding process, the Trustee, with Foley and Dundon's assistance, sold a substantial portion of the Debtor's remaining cryptocurrency assets to an offshore trading partner for a total of \$15,393,900. *See* Docket No. 135 (*Order Granting Motion*

Case 23-25749 Doc 242 Filed 12/06/24 Entered 12/06/24 10:36:02 Desc Main Document Page 8 of 34

to Sell Property Free and Clear of Liens Under Section 363(f)), and Docket No. 170 (Notice of Cryptocurrency Sale).

- 14. *Third*, after a marketing process run by Dundon and pursuant to procedures approved by the Bankruptcy Court, Dundon assisted the Trustee in selling the Debtor's operating assets to two buyers for a total of \$350,000. *See* Docket No. 169. *Finally*, the Trustee obtained authority to sell certain token assets of the Debtor for a total of \$150,000 (the "*Token Sale*"). *See* Docket No. 226.
- 15. As of the date hereof, the Trustee is holding a total of \$17,766,859.78 in cash. The Trustee also possesses certain cryptocurrency assets of the Debtor that are not yet available for sale. The Trustee also possesses causes of action that could be brought on behalf of the Debtor's estate.
- Date Order"), and after substantial work by Foley and Dundon, the Trustee established a deadline of July 22, 2024 for any creditor to file a proof of claim against the Debtor's estate. Because the identity of SFM Token holders is not generally known, the Trustee published the bar date on the Debtor's social media platforms and advertised it in a crypto-industry publication to maximize the exposure of that deadline.
- 17. Approximately 1,171 claimants filed claims for a total of approximately \$91 million. The Trustee and her advisors are reviewing the claims. The Trustee also engaged in a mediation with the Class Plaintiffs. Subject to certain conditions, which have yet to be resolved, the Trustee believes she will be able to file 9019 motion before the court approving the proposed settlement.

### SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES

- 18. By this Interim Fee Application, Dundon requests interim approval of compensation for services rendered during the Fee Period in the amount of \$546,926.00, as well as allowance of \$313.80 as reimbursement for actual and necessary expenses incurred by Dundon during the Fee Period.
- 19. Dundon maintains computerized records of the time spent by all timekeepers in connection with its representation of the Trustee. Nine (9) professionals expended a total of 710.80 hours during the Fee Period for which compensation is requested. All services for which compensation is requested by Dundon were performed for or on behalf of the Trustee.
- 20. Dundon has received no payment and no promises of payment from any source for services rendered or to be rendered in any capacity whatsoever in connection with the matters covered by this Interim Fee Application. There is no agreement or understanding between Dundon and any other person, other than members of the firm, for the sharing of compensation to be received for services rendered in the Bankruptcy Case.
- 21. The fees charged by Dundon in the Bankruptcy Case are billed in accordance with the Dundon Retention Application and Dundon's hourly rates and procedures in effect during the Fee Period and as discounted as set forth in the Dundon Retention Application. Dundon's fees are reasonable based on the customary compensation charged by comparably skilled practitioners in comparable non-bankruptcy cases in a competitive national legal market. Pursuant to Paragraph 21 of the Dundon Retention Application, Dundon agreed to discount its standard rate fees by 25%. Further, pursuant to Paragraph 22 of the Dundon Retention Application, Dundon is entitled to recover the full amount of such discounted amount based on a sliding scale of a percentage of

recoveries by the Trustee (2.5% of the first \$5,000,000, 3.0% of the next \$3,000,000 and 3.5% therefter). As outlined above, the huge successes of the Trustee in recovering assets exceeds \$15,000,000. Based on the agreed schedule, Dundon is entitled to recover the full amount of the deferred portion of such fees and thus by this Application seeks full reimbursement of its fees at this time.

22. In support of this Interim Fee Application, attached hereto as **Exhibit A** is a summary of compensation by each professional of the Applicant that worked on the Bankruptcy Case during the Fee Period; (ii) attached hereto as **Exhibit B** is a summary of compensation by project category during the Fee Period; (iii) attached hereto as **Exhibit C** is the expense summary for the Fee Period; and (iv) attached hereto as **Exhibit D** is a copy of the Applicant's time detail for the Fee Period.

#### SUMMARY OF SERVICES PROJECT CATEGORY

23. The following is a summary of the significant professional services rendered by Dundon during the Fee Period. This summary is organized in accordance with the internal system of task codes set up by Dundon at the outset of the Bankruptcy Case. Given the interconnectedness of the issues in the Bankruptcy Case, certain of these categories may overlap with one another. If a task code does not appear below, then Dundon did not bill time for that work code during the Fee Period but may bill time for that work code in the future.

Case 23-25749 Doc 242 Filed 12/06/24 Entered 12/06/24 10:36:02 Desc Main Document Page 11 of 34

(A) Business Analysis

**Hours: 297.40** 

Fees: \$219,069.00

24. This category includes time spent by Dundon professionals analyzing issues related

to the Debtor's business and operations generally. Dundon professionals spent time transitioning

with M3 the Chapter 11 advisors. Dundon spent time understanding and unlocking the liquidity

pools and working with prior management to identify and secure the Debtor's assets. Dundon

professionals spent time identifying the various wallets holding crypto assets and created a secure

wallet under the control of the Trustee. Dundon professionals worked with former employees to

identify assets and to secure them and then transfer them to the Trustee controlled wallet. Dundon

professionals prepared the monthly operating reports. Dundon professionals also incurred time

addressing operational issues such as the maintenance of the Debtor's cryptocurrency wallets,

notifying walletholders of the need to transfer their funds in the event of decommission of the

wallets, addressing patent matters, and addressing license and contract issues with AWS and other

various vendors

(B) Case Administration

**Hours:** 12.70

Fees: \$9,118.00

25. This category includes fees applicable to a broad scope of services intended to assist

the Trustee and her professionals in fulfilling their responsibilities, including, but not limited to:

(i) time spent analyzing the Debtor and its operations including with the Debtor's former

employees and advisors; (ii) preparation and maintenance of the payroll for contractors; and (iii)

other tasks associated with the day-to-day representation of the Trustee not characterized under

11

Case 23-25749 Doc 242 Filed 12/06/24 Entered 12/06/24 10:36:02 Desc Main Document Page 12 of 34

any specific task, or during the initial stages of the Bankruptcy Case in anticipation of likely issues

arising in other categories.

(C) Claims Analysis

Hours: 15.10

Fees: \$13,549.00

26. This category comprises of identification and review of potential assets that belong

to the Estate, including claims and causes of action against insiders and the Debtor's past conduct.

Dundon personnel spent time analyzing and valuing such claims in support of the Trustees.

(D) Sale Process

Hours: 228.20

Fees: \$180,071.00

27. Dundon spent considerable time in the Fee Period on asset disposition. The various

sales of assets of the Debtor's estate generated a total of approximately \$15,500,000 and were a

critical step toward making significant distributions to creditors in the future.

28. This category includes time incurred by Dundon professionals to (i) run a fulsome

marketing process for the Debtors operating assets, including preparing all marketing

documentation, teasers, product descriptions, market outreach to numerous parties and

coordination of the auction process. These efforts resulted in a successful 363 sale of those assets.

Dundon also worked with numerous potential buyers of the cryptocurrency assets, and reviewed

various proposals for the sale of the Debtor's cryptocurrency assets, and negotiate such proposals

with potential buyers; (ii); (iii) analysis of issues raised by the SEC in connection with such sales;

(iv) analyze and revise drafts of cryptocurrency purchase agreements with prospective buyers; (v).

Case 23-25749 Doc 242 Filed 12/06/24 Entered 12/06/24 10:36:02 Desc Main Document Page 13 of 34

(E) Meetings of and Communications with Professionals

Hours: 153.80

Fees: \$122,209.00

29. This category includes time incurred by Dundon engaging in conversations and

coordinating with the Trustee and her other professionals, updates and workflow coordination and

responding to specific case issues identified by the Trustee.

(F) Retention and Fee Applications

**Hours:** 

3.60

Fees:

\$2,910.00

30. This category includes work conducted in relation to the preparation of the

application to employ Dundon as financial advisor to the Trustee, the engagement of Stretto as

claims agent to the Trustee, and the preparation of this Interim Fee Application.

31. The foregoing professional services performed by Dundon were necessary and

appropriate to the administration of the Bankruptcy Case. Compensation for the foregoing services

as requested is commensurate with the complexity, importance, and nature of the problems, issues,

or tasks involved. The professional services were performed with expedition and in an efficient

manner.

ACTUAL AND NECESSARY DISBURSEMENTS

32. Dundon requests allowance of actual and necessary expenses incurred during the

Fee Period in the aggregate amount of \$313.80. The attached Exhibit C includes copies of

Dundon's itemized actual and necessary expenses.

33. Dundon's disbursement policies pass through all out-of-pocket expenses at actual

cost or an estimated actual cost when the actual cost is difficult to determine.

13

### **JUSTIFICATION FOR AWARD**

- 34. All services for which compensation is requested by Dundon were performed for or on behalf of the Trustee.
- 35. Section 330(a) of the Bankruptcy Code governs compensation of professionals in bankruptcy matters. *See In re Market Center East Retail Property, Inc.*, 730 F.3d 1239, 1246 (10th Cir. 2013). Section 330(a) provides, in relevant part, as follows:

the court shall consider the nature, the extent, and the value of such services, taking into account all relevant factors, including –

- (A) the time spent on such services;
- (B) the rates charged for such services;
- (C) whether the services were necessary to the administration of, or beneficial at the time at which the service was rendered toward the completion of, a case under this title;
- (D) whether the services were performed within a reasonable amount of time commensurate with the complexity, importance, and nature of the problem, issue, or task addressed; and
- (E) whether the compensation is reasonable based on the customary compensation charged by comparably skilled practitioners in cases other than cases under this title.
- 11 U.S.C. § 330(a)(3). Under section 331 of the Bankruptcy Code, compensation for professional services may be awarded on an interim basis. 11 U.S.C. § 331.
- 36. The Tenth Circuit has applied the factors originally set forth in *Johnson v. Georgia Highway Express, Inc.*, 488 F.2d 714 (5th Cir. 1974) in determining "reasonableness" of attorneys' fees. *See In re Market Center East Retail Property, Inc.*, 730 F.3d 1239, 1246 (10th Cir. 2013). The *Johnson* factors to be considered are delineated below, and Dundon's compliance therewith, if applicable, is described following each factor:

- a. <u>Time and Labor Required. Exhibit B</u> to this Interim Fee Application delineates all of the work performed by Dundon for which compensation is requested during the Fee Period. Dundon submits that the information contained in this exhibit supports the fees requested and reflects the reasonableness of such fees.
- b. Novelty and Difficulty. Dundon believes that various issues involved in these cases have been complex and challenging. This Bankruptcy Case has required professionals to expend relatively significant time getting up the learning curve with respect to the Debtor and its operations, particularly in light of the cryptocurrency issues,. The specific circumstances of the Bankruptcy Case, including the class action lawsuit and the criminal and civil lawsuits pending against the Debtor's founder and CEO, have also contributed to the complex nature of this engagement.
- c. <u>Skill Requisite to Perform the Services Properly</u>. The professionals primarily working on this matter are specialists in matters such as asset sales, managing a liquidation, the claims process and pursuit of causes of action that have provided significant value to the Trustee.
- d. **Preclusion of Other Employment.** The time demands of representation of the Trustee in the Bankruptcy Case resulted in some disruption of other employment engagements undertaken by Dundon. While no large-scale reassignment of work has been required to properly represent the Trustee, this representation did consume a significant amount of time and preclude work for other clients.
- e. <u>Customary Fee.</u> The hourly rates charged for each professional and paraprofessional performing services are no greater, and in some instances may be lower, than those being charged by professionals with similar qualifications and experience. The hourly rates requested herein compare favorably with average costs for similar advisory services being provided nationally and regionally.
- f. Whether the Fee is Fixed or Contingent. Dundon's fees are neither fixed nor contingent other than on the contingency of allowance by the Court and availability of assets for payment. Fees are based on the actual total number of hours worked, less hours written off, plus actual expenses incurred.
- g. <u>Time Limitations</u>. The representation of a Trustee in a chapter 7 case is inherently time sensitive, particularly in the first few months of a proceeding such as this one in which time is of the essence. Dundon was required to provide capable representation within the time limitations imposed by the Bankruptcy Code, the Bankruptcy Rules, the Local Rules, counsel for various parties in interest, and this Court.

- h. <u>Amount Involved and Results Obtained</u>. Dundon has assisted the Trustee in all facets of the Bankruptcy Case. Dundon believes that the information contained herein and in the attached exhibits, as well as the record in these proceedings, support the reasonableness of its requested compensation.
- i. Experience, Reputation, and Ability of the Professionals. Dundon's advisors have regularly appeared in significant representations over many years, including bankruptcy cases in this District and throughout the United States.
- j. <u>Undesirability of Case</u>. Dundon has not found the Bankruptcy Case to be undesirable, but rather, considers the issues that have been raised in the Bankruptcy Case to be of the type that Dundon is trained to adequately address.
- k. <u>Nature and Length of Professional Relationship with Client.</u> Not applicable.
- 1. <u>Awards in Similar Cases</u>. Based on Dundon's experience, the fees requested herein are commensurate with fees allowed in proceedings of similar scope for the services rendered.
- 37. Dundon has rendered substantial and valuable professional services on behalf of the Trustee that have resulted in a significant benefit to the creditors of the Debtor's Estate and to the administration of this complex Bankruptcy Case. Dundon's work in the Bankruptcy Case includes, without limitation, analysis of the Debtor's assets, including various forms of cryptocurrency, the development of a plan to recover and liquidate such assets, the negotiations for the sale of the Debtor's assets, through which the Trustee has realized approximately \$15,500,000 for the benefit of the Estate. In addition, Dundon has managed the claim noticing and administration process which was complicated by the lack of information the Debtor had on its customers. Dundon has also performed general bankruptcy tasks, including settlement with creditors, maintaining the Debtor's patent portfolio and addressed employee issues.
- 38. Dundon's services were provided with the requisite level of skill and were performed within a reasonable amount of time commensurate with the complexity, importance,

and nature of the problems, issues and tasks addressed. The amount sought in compensation is in line with awards in similar cases and is commensurate with the professional standing, ability, and expertise of Dundon and the professionals who have participated in this case but has been discounted as discussed below. Accordingly, the compensation requested herein reflects the reasonable value of the services Dundon provided to the Trustee.

39. Given the size of this case, the speed at which it has moved forward, and the significant amount of claims at issue (over \$91,000,000 in claims have been filed through the claims bar date), Dundon has been mindful of the need to avoid excessive fees in these cases and has taken all reasonable steps to provide cost-effective representation while rendering services with the highest degree of skill and professionalism. Such efforts include staffing this matter leanly and eliminating duplication of effort.

#### RESERVATION

40. To the extent time or disbursement charges for services rendered or disbursements incurred relate to the Fee Period but were not processed prior to the preparation of this Interim Fee Application, or Dundon has for any other reason not sought compensation or reimbursement of expenses herein with respect to any services rendered or expenses incurred during the Fee Period, Dundon reserves the right to request additional compensation for such services and reimbursement of such expenses in a future application.

WHEREFORE, Dundon respectfully requests (i) interim allowance of compensation for professional services rendered to the Trustee during the Fee Period in the amount of \$546,926.00, and for expenses incurred during the Fee Period in the amount of \$313.80, (ii) that the Court authorize the Trustee to pay Dundon a total of \$547,239.80 representing the balance owed thereto,

Filed 12/06/24 Entered 12/06/24 10:36:02 Desc Main Case 23-25749 Doc 242 Document Page 18 of 34

(iii) that the interim allowance of such compensation for professional services rendered and

reimbursement of actual and necessary expenses incurred be without prejudice to Dundon's right

to seek such further compensation for the full value of services performed and expenses incurred,

and (iv) that the Court grant Dundon such other and further relief as is just.

Dated: December 6, 2024

Respectfully submitted,

/s/Peter A. Hurwitz

Peter Hurwitz

Financial Advisor for the Chapter 7 Trustee

(December 20, 2023 through October 31, 2024)

# $\underline{\text{EXHIBIT } \mathbf{A^{1}}}$ SUMMARY OF COMPENSATION REQUESTED BY PROFESSIONAL

Professional	Title	Hours Billed	<b>Total Fees</b>	Blended Hourly Rate
Matthew Dundon	Principal	1.70	\$1,513.00	\$890.00
Peter Hurwitz	Principal	204.30	\$194,945.00	\$954.21
Lee Rooney	Managing Director	365.00	\$259,385.00	\$710.64
Eric Rubel	Managing Director	1.00	\$790.00	\$790.00
Michael Garbe	Senior Director	3.30	\$2,398.00	\$72667
Peter Mikhailenok	Senior Adviser	87.50	\$56,875.00	\$650.00
Colin Breeze	Senior Adviser	20.50	\$13,325.00	\$650.00
Harry Tucker	Director	26.90	\$17,485.00	\$650.00
Alex Zahringer	Associate	0.60	\$210.00	\$350.00
Total		710.80	\$546,926.00	

<sup>&</sup>lt;sup>1</sup> Dundon increases their hourly rates on July 1st of each year. Therefore, some of the rates listed are blended rates representing rates for fees billed (a) December 20, 2023 through June 30, 2024 and rates for fees billed (b) July 1, 2024 through October 31, 2024.

### EXHIBIT B

### SUMMARY OF COMPENSATION REQUESTED BY TASK CODE CATEGORY (December 20, 2023 through October 31, 2024)

	Project Category	Hours	Fees Billed
		Billed	
Business An	alysis	297.40	\$219,069.00
Case Admin	istration	12.70	\$9,118.00
Claims Anal	ysis	15.10	\$13,549.00
Professional	Meetings and Communications	153.80	\$122,209.00
Retention an	d Fee Applications	3.60	\$2,910.00
Sales Proces	s	228.20	\$180,071.00
Total		710.80	\$546,926.00

### **EXHIBIT C**

## SUMMARY OF EXPENSE REIMBURSEMENT REQUESTED BY CATEGORY (December 20, 2023 through October 31, 2024)

	Description	Amount
1/15/24	Purchase of Digital Wallet for Trustee	\$140.00
2/9/24	Crunchbase Fee	\$128.00
5/2/24	GoDaddy Transfer Fee	\$45.80
	TOTAL	\$313.80

### EXHIBIT D

**DUNDON TIME DETAIL** (December 20, 2023 through October 31, 2024)

### **Dundon Advisers LLC - Activity Type**

Date Start: 12/1/2023 | Date End: 10/31/2024 | Clients: Safemoon | Users: | Matters: All | Activity Types: | Group By: Activity Code

Date	Client	Matter	Description	Billable Time	Billable Amount
<b>Business Anal</b>	ysis				
Eric Reubel					
01/22/2024	Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review P/Daugherty correspondence re: safemoon trading alt coins approvals	0.10	\$79.00
01/31/2024		Chapter 7 Trustee	Research cred banking process (.5); Correspond w/ L. Rooney re: same (.1)	0.60	
02/01/2024	Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon discussion w/ L. Rooney re: potential sale process	0.30	
			Totals Amounts for User Eric Reubel	1.00	0 \$790.00
Lee Rooney	C-f	Charter 7 Tourston	Cifference and CD and inches	0.7	c
12/21/2023		Chapter 7 Trustee	Efforts to get FB activated	0.70	
12/22/2023 12/22/2023		Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with E. Ostrow, C. Guilmin, and P. Hurwitz re: crypto assets and locations Review of fireblocks account correspondence and reach out	0.90 0.80	
12/22/2023		Chapter 7 Trustee	Bank account research with email traffic	1.30	
12/22/2023		Chapter 7 Trustee	Intro emails for calls with employees	0.90	
12/22/2023		Chapter 7 Trustee	Review of LP liquidation plan	0.60	•
12/22/2023		Chapter 7 Trustee	Galaxy wallet set-up efforts including telecon P. Hurwitz	1.20	
12/26/2023		Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with M3, E. Ostrow, and P. Hurwitz	0.60	
12/26/2023		Chapter 7 Trustee	Review of the Liquidity Pool Farming white paper, DEX proposal	1.40	
12/26/2023		Chapter 7 Trustee	Review of M3 employee salary with extrapolation to correct amounts	1.30	
12/26/2023		Chapter 7 Trustee	Calculation of tax holdbacks	1.70	
12/26/2023		Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with P. Hurwitz re: tax holdbacks	0.40	
12/28/2023		Chapter 7 Trustee	Review of Empath Whitepaper with telecon with C. Guilmin	2.50	
12/28/2023		Chapter 7 Trustee	Contractor pay analysis with telecon with E. Ostrow	1.50	
12/29/2023		Chapter 7 Trustee	Attempts to get access to Gusto	1.80	
01/02/2024		Chapter 7 Trustee	W-9 issue with Galaxy	0.60	
01/02/2024		Chapter 7 Trustee	Contractor wages	0.40	
01/02/2024		Chapter 7 Trustee	Exchange fee email with E. Ostrow	0.20	•
01/02/2024		Chapter 7 Trustee	Creation of employee organization chart in prepartion of calls	0.90	
01/02/2024		Chapter 7 Trustee	Email correspondence with A. Woodall and Gusto help desk re: Gusto payroll service	1.20	
01/04/2024		Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow, P. Hurwitzre: business strategy	0.80	
01/04/2024		Chapter 7 Trustee	Efforts to get Gusto account working	1.40	
01/05/2024		Chapter 7 Trustee	Payroll preparation	1.10	
01/05/2024		Chapter 7 Trustee	Gusto efforts	0.80	
01/05/2024		Chapter 7 Trustee	Review of M. Stevens LP plan	0.20	
01/10/2024		Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with C. Guilmin re: wallet addresses, DEX	1.50	
01/10/2024		Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with E. Ostrow re: case management	0.30	
01/10/2024		Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with D. Nijhawan, P. Hurwitz and E. Ostrow re: insurance, litigation	1.30	
01/10/2024		Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow and P. Hurwitz re: case management and contractor payments	0.50	
01/12/2024	Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Payroll Analysis	1.80	0 \$1,260.00
01/12/2024	Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review of corporate documents, SFMM, SFMA	1.40	980.00
01/15/2024	Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with E. Ostrow re: Debtor wallets	1.10	0 \$770.00
01/16/2024		Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with C. Guilmin, P. Hurwitz re: smart contracts and Bybit report	0.70	
01/16/2024	Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Drafting of product marketing descriptions	1.30	0 \$910.00
01/17/2024		Chapter 7 Trustee	Analysis of bank accounts - Citi	2.60	
01/22/2024		Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with P. Hurwitz and M. Friedler re: crypto wallets	0.60	
01/22/2024		Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow, P. Hurwitz re: Debtor products	1.00	
01/23/2024		Chapter 7 Trustee	Analysis of crypto assets	2.10	
01/25/2024		Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with E. Ostrow re: products	0.20	
01/26/2024		Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with Citibank re: Debtor accounts	0.90	
01/29/2024		Chapter 7 Trustee	Tax filing process: DUNS	1.30	
01/29/2024		Chapter 7 Trustee	Review of Bitmart Wallet communications and value	1.70	
01/30/2024		Chapter 7 Trustee	Setting up asset transfer with telecon with C. Guilmin and M. Stevens	2.30	
01/30/2024		Chapter 7 Trustee	Review of BitMart accounts with telecom with BitMart Legal	1.10	
01/30/2024		Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with A. Kimm re: tax disclosures	0.40	
01/30/2024		Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow, M. Friedler, P. Hurwitz and others re: asset transfers and wallets Telecon with M. Friedler re: wallet options	1.60	
01/30/2024		Chapter 7 Trustee	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	0.60	
01/31/2024 01/31/2024		Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Participated in the asset transfer with E. Ostrow, P. Hurwitz, and devs  Marketing outreach contact list	2.30 2.10	
02/02/2024		Chapter 7 Trustee	Marketing outreach contact list	1.20	
02/02/2024		Chapter 7 Trustee	Internal assets tracking with telecom with C Guilmin	0.70	
02/02/2024		Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with D. Oliver re: vendor payments	0.60	
02/05/2024		Chapter 7 Trustee  Chapter 7 Trustee	Continued asset valuation — updated wallets	1.60	
02/06/2024		Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with M. Williams re: 90-day payments, insider payments	0.90	
		Chapter 7 Trustee		2.30	
02/06/2024	JaieIIIUUII	Chapter / Trustee	LP unpairing with M. Stevens, E. Ostrow, P. Hurwitz and others	2.30	0 \$1,610.00

## Case 23-25749 Doc 242 Filed 12/06/24 Entered 12/06/24 10:36:02 Desc Main Document Page 24 of 34

02/07/2024 5-f	Charter 7 Tours	Telescoperith F. October and March 2022 healt / conduction	0.20	Ć140.00
02/07/2024 Safemoon 02/07/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with E. Ostrow re: March 2023 hack / marketing  Review of March 2023 hack	0.20 0.60	\$140.00 \$420.00
02/07/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Editing of the teaser with P. Hurwitz	0.60	\$420.00
02/07/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with A. Woodle, P. Hurwitz re: employee claims	1.60	\$1,120.00
02/08/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with D. Oliver and P. Hurwitz re: infrastructure discussions	0.50	\$350.00
02/09/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with M. Stevens re: social media / wallets	0.80	\$560.00
02/09/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with T. Halkowski, P. Hurwitz re: wallets and dexs	1.00	\$700.00
02/12/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with C. Guiliman re: valuation of customers	0.70	\$490.00
	Chapter 7 Trustee	Creation of customer valuation deck	1.80	\$1,260.00
02/12/2024 Safemoon 02/13/2024 Safemoon	·	Telecon with P. Hurwitz and P. Mikhailenok re: infrastructure	0.80	\$560.00
02/13/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Okta calls	0.60	\$420.00
02/13/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Review of SEC letter	0.80	\$560.00
02/13/2024 Safemoon	·	Telecon with P. Mikhailenok re: infrastructure	0.40	\$280.00
02/14/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee		0.90	\$630.00
02/14/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with C. Guilmin re: data collection exercise for marketing purposes  Telecon with Okta to get accounts reinstated	0.40	\$280.00
02/14/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with T. Halkowski re: crypto tracing	0.40	\$280.00
02/14/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with G. Goodman re: case management	0.20	\$140.00
02/14/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with D. Nichols re: data room creation	0.40	\$280.00
02/14/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Editing of Marketing Deck	1.30	\$910.00
02/14/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Token research for valuation—comps to SFM	1.60	\$1,120.00
02/19/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Marketing emails	1.60	\$1,120.00
02/22/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Tracing call with T. Halkowski and E. Ostrow	0.80	\$560.00
02/22/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with P. Hurwitz re: infrastructure plans	0.60	\$420.00
02/22/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with D. Ortega and Peter M. re: admin	0.80	\$560.00
02/23/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Payroll with email exchange with E. Ostrow	0.70	\$490.00
02/23/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review of bar date motion	0.50	\$350.00
03/04/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review of letter sent to Squidgrow Joe	0.50	\$350.00
03/04/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review of patents issue	0.40	\$280.00
03/04/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Wallet review	0.70	\$490.00
03/05/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with R. Peter and C. Guilmin re: AWS account management	1.10	\$770.00
03/06/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review of contractor v1-v2 swap to-dos	1.10	\$770.00
03/06/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with P. Mikhailenok and C. Guilmin re: service usage	0.90	\$630.00
03/07/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Analysis of crypto assets	1.40	\$980.00
03/07/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review of asset sale motion with email correspondence	0.30	\$210.00
03/08/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Analysis and creation of figures for the crypto assets, telecoms P. Hurwitz	1.30	\$910.00
03/08/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Payroll generation	0.70	\$490.00
03/08/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Crypto transfer records	0.80	\$560.00
03/09/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow and C. Guilmin re: wallets/assets	2.00	\$1,400.00
03/11/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review of motion to approve the decommissioning of the SafeMoon wallet	0.40	\$280.00
03/12/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with P. Hurwitz re: AWS	0.40	\$280.00
03/12/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow re: AWS usage	0.30	\$210.00
03/14/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	DEX Partner outreach with telecon with M. Markoe	0.70	\$490.00
03/14/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Analysis of Debtor insurance policies with telecon with D. Nijhawan	0.30	\$210.00
03/20/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with C. Guilmin, P. Hurwitz re: token claims, founder communications at launch	1.80	\$1,260.00
03/21/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with P. Hurwitz re: token holder claims	1.10	\$770.00
03/22/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Payroll	1.10	\$770.00
03/25/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow, m. Stevens, and C. Guilmin re: wallet transfers	1.10	\$770.00
03/25/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow and C. Guilmin re: wallets and Fair Launch LP lockup	0.90	\$630.00
03/25/2024 Safemoon 03/26/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	LP ownership language emails  Telecon with G. Goodman, E. Ostrow, P. Hurwitz and others re: LP	1.30 1.20	\$910.00 \$840.00
	Chapter 7 Trustee	Drafting of LP description		\$840.00
03/28/2024 Safemoon 03/28/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Drafting of description  Drafting of description of LP for declaration	1.20 2.10	\$1,470.00
	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review of Liquidity Pool pairs for SEC	1.70	\$1,470.00
04/01/2024 Safemoon 04/01/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Email exchanges with M. Stevens and C. Guilmin re: safemoon treasury tokens	1.30	\$910.00
04/03/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Setting up escrow account	0.80	\$560.00
04/04/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Efforts to obtain escrow account	0.70	\$490.00
04/05/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Payroll creation/submission with telecon with E. Ostrow	1.30	\$910.00
04/16/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review of MOR financials with E. Ostrow	0.60	\$420.00
04/17/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with M. Garbe to discuss MOR	1.20	\$840.00
04/17/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Editing of MOR, attachments	2.20	\$1,540.00
04/18/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow, G. Goodman, P. Hurwitz and others re: portfolio sale	0.60	\$420.00
04/19/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Payroll run	0.70	\$490.00
04/22/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Internal telecons re: transition services	2.30	\$1,610.00
04/22/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with SFM contractors and E. Ostrow re: asset transfer	1.30	\$910.00
04/22/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with R. Peter re: asset transfer and domain name	0.70	\$490.00
04/22/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Description of amount due from Buyers	0.80	\$560.00
04/23/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Continued MOR preparation	2.40	\$1,680.00

## Case 23-25749 Doc 242 Filed 12/06/24 Entered 12/06/24 10:36:02 Desc Main Document Page 25 of 34

04/23/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review of transfer of assets plan, with email to E. Ostrow, G. Goodman	1.70	\$1,190.00
04/23/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow and contractors re: techno transfer call	0.40	\$280.00
04/24/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow and SFM contractors	1.00	\$700.00
04/30/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review of Spraggs expenses and appropriate payment for their services	2.70	\$1,890.00
05/02/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Transfer process - website, domain	1.40	\$980.00
05/03/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	payroll processing	0.50	\$350.00
05/03/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Payroll	1.30	\$910.00
05/03/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with P. Hurwitz re: asset transfer	0.40	\$280.00
05/03/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. OStrow re: payroll	0.40	\$280.00
05/03/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow re: admin expenses and NW	0.50	\$350.00
05/03/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with R. Peter re: domain transfer	0.60	\$420.00
05/03/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with P. Hurwitz, NW, and R. Peter	0.40	\$280.00
05/06/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow and P. Hurwitz re: APA, payroll	0.50	\$350.00
05/06/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with R. Peter re: domain name preservation	0.30	\$210.00
05/17/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review of admin claims	1.10	\$770.00
05/17/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Payroll with call with E. Ostrow	0.60	\$420.00
07/16/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Payroll administration	0.20	\$170.00
07/31/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow re: claims, MOR	0.40	\$340.00
08/01/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with C. Guilmin re: crypto assets	0.40	\$340.00
08/02/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with R. Peter re: dApp creditor confirmation	0.20	\$170.00
08/06/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with G. Goodman re: claims, dApp	0.20	\$170.00
08/16/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review of March 2023 BNB hack documentation with telecon with C. Guilmin	1.30	\$1,105.00
08/16/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with G. Goodman re: Mar '23 BNB hack	0.20	\$170.00
08/29/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecons with E. Galen and J. Miller re: administrative expenses	0.80	\$680.00
08/30/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with G. Goodman re: AWS VGX	0.20	\$170.00
08/30/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with J. Miller (VGX) re: AWS	0.30	\$255.00
09/17/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow re: MOR	0.60	\$510.00
09/23/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Editing of second MOR	1.30	\$1,105.00
, ,			1.10	\$935.00
09/23/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with M. Garbeire: MOR		
09/24/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow and P. Hurwitz re: MOR, claims	0.30	\$255.00
09/24/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with P. Hurwitz re: MOR	0.40	\$340.00
10/08/2024 Safemoon 10/09/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow, G. Goodman, and P. Hurwitz re: claims, litigation Telecon with E. Ostrow re:MOR	0.90 0.70	\$765.00 \$595.00
	Chapter / hustee	refectif with L. Ostrow relivion		
		Editing of MOR	1.40	
10/09/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Editing of MOR  Analysis of sim price/volume changes	1.40	\$1,190.00
		Analysis of sfm price/volume changes	1.20	\$1,190.00 \$1,020.00
10/09/2024 Safemoon 10/09/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	-		\$1,190.00
10/09/2024 Safemoon 10/09/2024 Safemoon Michael Garbe	Chapter 7 Trustee	Analysis of sfm price/volume changes  Totals Amounts for User Lee Rooney	1.20	\$1,190.00 \$1,020.00
10/09/2024 Safemoon 10/09/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Analysis of sfm price/volume changes  Totals Amounts for User Lee Rooney  Meeting with Lee to discuss approach to preparation of initial MOR.	1.20 153.40	\$1,190.00 \$1,020.00 <b>\$109,195.00</b> \$840.00
10/09/2024 Safemoon 10/09/2024 Safemoon Michael Garbe 04/16/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Analysis of sfm price/volume changes  Totals Amounts for User Lee Rooney	1.20 <b>153.40</b>	\$1,190.00 \$1,020.00 <b>\$109,195.00</b>
10/09/2024 Safemoon 10/09/2024 Safemoon Michael Garbe 04/16/2024 Safemoon 04/23/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Analysis of sfm price/volume changes  Totals Amounts for User Lee Rooney  Meeting with Lee to discuss approach to preparation of initial MOR.  Receive and review MOR as prepared by Lee, send Lee review comments.	1.20 153.40 1.20 0.50	\$1,190.00 \$1,020.00 <b>\$109,195.00</b> \$840.00 \$350.00
10/09/2024 Safemoon 10/09/2024 Safemoon Michael Garbe 04/16/2024 Safemoon 04/23/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Analysis of sfm price/volume changes Totals Amounts for User Lee Rooney  Meeting with Lee to discuss approach to preparation of initial MOR. Receive and review MOR as prepared by Lee, send Lee review comments. Receive and review Safemoon April 2024 MOR from Lee, call with Lee to discuss preparation details and suggested changes to MOR details. Call with Lee to discuss issue related to preparation of MOR.	1.20 153.40 1.20 0.50 1.50 0.10	\$1,190.00 \$1,020.00 <b>\$109,195.00</b> \$840.00 \$350.00 \$1,132.50 \$75.50
10/09/2024 Safemoon 10/09/2024 Safemoon Michael Garbe 04/16/2024 Safemoon 04/23/2024 Safemoon 09/23/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Analysis of sfm price/volume changes Totals Amounts for User Lee Rooney  Meeting with Lee to discuss approach to preparation of initial MOR. Receive and review MOR as prepared by Lee, send Lee review comments. Receive and review Safemoon April 2024 MOR from Lee, call with Lee to discuss preparation details and suggested changes to MOR details.	1.20 153.40 1.20 0.50 1.50	\$1,190.00 \$1,020.00 <b>\$109,195.00</b> \$840.00 \$350.00 \$1,132.50
10/09/2024 Safemoon 10/09/2024 Safemoon Michael Garbe 04/16/2024 Safemoon 04/23/2024 Safemoon 09/23/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Analysis of sfm price/volume changes Totals Amounts for User Lee Rooney  Meeting with Lee to discuss approach to preparation of initial MOR. Receive and review MOR as prepared by Lee, send Lee review comments. Receive and review Safemoon April 2024 MOR from Lee, call with Lee to discuss preparation details and suggested changes to MOR details. Call with Lee to discuss issue related to preparation of MOR. Totals Amounts for User Michael Garbe	1.20 153.40 1.20 0.50 1.50 0.10 3.30	\$1,190.00 \$1,020.00 \$109,195.00 \$840.00 \$350.00 \$1,132.50 \$75.50 \$2,398.00
10/09/2024 Safemoon 10/09/2024 Safemoon Michael Garbe 04/16/2024 Safemoon 04/23/2024 Safemoon 09/23/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon Peter Hurwitz 12/20/2023 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Analysis of sfm price/volume changes Totals Amounts for User Lee Rooney  Meeting with Lee to discuss approach to preparation of initial MOR. Receive and review MOR as prepared by Lee, send Lee review comments. Receive and review Safemoon April 2024 MOR from Lee, call with Lee to discuss preparation details and suggested changes to MOR details. Call with Lee to discuss issue related to preparation of MOR. Totals Amounts for User Michael Garbe  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman) re: workflows	1.20 153.40 1.20 0.50 1.50 0.10 3.30	\$1,190.00 \$1,020.00 \$109,195.00 \$840.00 \$350.00 \$1,132.50 \$75.50 \$2,398.00
10/09/2024 Safemoon 10/09/2024 Safemoon Michael Garbe 04/16/2024 Safemoon 04/23/2024 Safemoon 09/23/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon Peter Hurwitz 12/20/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Analysis of sfm price/volume changes  Totals Amounts for User Lee Rooney  Meeting with Lee to discuss approach to preparation of initial MOR.  Receive and review MOR as prepared by Lee, send Lee review comments.  Receive and review Safemoon April 2024 MOR from Lee, call with Lee to discuss preparation details and suggested changes to MOR details.  Call with Lee to discuss issue related to preparation of MOR.  Totals Amounts for User Michael Garbe  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman) re: workflows  Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), C. Guilmin, and L. Rooney re: crypto assets and locations	1.20 153.40 1.20 0.50 1.50 0.10 3.30 0.50 0.90	\$1,190.00 \$1,020.00 \$109,195.00 \$840.00 \$350.00 \$1,132.50 \$75.50 \$2,398.00 \$480.00 \$864.00
10/09/2024 Safemoon 10/09/2024 Safemoon Michael Garbe 04/16/2024 Safemoon 04/23/2024 Safemoon 09/23/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon Peter Hurwitz 12/20/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Analysis of sfm price/volume changes Totals Amounts for User Lee Rooney  Meeting with Lee to discuss approach to preparation of initial MOR. Receive and review MOR as prepared by Lee, send Lee review comments. Receive and review Safemoon April 2024 MOR from Lee, call with Lee to discuss preparation details and suggested changes to MOR details. Call with Lee to discuss issue related to preparation of MOR. Totals Amounts for User Michael Garbe  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman) re: workflows Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), C. Guilmin, and L. Rooney re: crypto assets and locations Research token liquidation plan, telecon L. Rooney re:same	1.20 153.40 1.20 0.50 1.50 0.10 3.30 0.50 0.90 0.50	\$1,190.00 \$1,020.00 \$109,195.00 \$840.00 \$350.00 \$1,132.50 \$75.50 \$2,398.00 \$480.00 \$864.00 \$480.00
10/09/2024 Safemoon 10/09/2024 Safemoon Michael Garbe 04/16/2024 Safemoon 04/23/2024 Safemoon 09/23/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 12/20/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Analysis of sfm price/volume changes Totals Amounts for User Lee Rooney  Meeting with Lee to discuss approach to preparation of initial MOR. Receive and review MOR as prepared by Lee, send Lee review comments. Receive and review Safemoon April 2024 MOR from Lee, call with Lee to discuss preparation details and suggested changes to MOR details. Call with Lee to discuss issue related to preparation of MOR. Totals Amounts for User Michael Garbe  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman) re: workflows Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), C. Guilmin, and L. Rooney re: crypto assets and locations Research token liquidation plan, telecon L. Rooney re:same Research token wallets, telecon L. Rooney re:same	1.20 153.40 1.20 0.50 1.50 0.10 3.30 0.50 0.90 0.50	\$1,190.00 \$1,020.00 \$109,195.00 \$840.00 \$350.00 \$1,132.50 \$75.50 \$2,398.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$864.00 \$864.00
10/09/2024 Safemoon 10/09/2024 Safemoon Michael Garbe 04/16/2024 Safemoon 04/23/2024 Safemoon 09/23/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 12/20/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Analysis of sfm price/volume changes  Totals Amounts for User Lee Rooney  Meeting with Lee to discuss approach to preparation of initial MOR. Receive and review MOR as prepared by Lee, send Lee review comments. Receive and review Safemoon April 2024 MOR from Lee, call with Lee to discuss preparation details and suggested changes to MOR details. Call with Lee to discuss issue related to preparation of MOR.  Totals Amounts for User Michael Garbe  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman) re: workflows Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), C. Guilmin, and L. Rooney re: crypto assets and locations Research token liquidation plan, telecon L. Rooney re:same Research token wallets, telecon L. Rooney re:same Telecon M3 Partners, Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: transition issues	1.20 153.40 1.20 0.50 1.50 0.10 3.30 0.50 0.90 0.50 0.90 0.60	\$1,190.00 \$1,020.00 \$109,195.00 \$840.00 \$350.00 \$1,132.50 \$75.50 \$2,398.00 \$480.00 \$864.00 \$480.00 \$864.00 \$576.00
10/09/2024 Safemoon 10/09/2024 Safemoon Michael Garbe 04/16/2024 Safemoon 04/23/2024 Safemoon 09/23/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 12/20/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Analysis of sfm price/volume changes  Totals Amounts for User Lee Rooney  Meeting with Lee to discuss approach to preparation of initial MOR.  Receive and review MOR as prepared by Lee, send Lee review comments.  Receive and review Safemoon April 2024 MOR from Lee, call with Lee to discuss preparation details and suggested changes to MOR details.  Call with Lee to discuss issue related to preparation of MOR.  Totals Amounts for User Michael Garbe  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman) re: workflows  Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), C. Guilmin, and L. Rooney re: crypto assets and locations  Research token liquidation plan, telecon L. Rooney re:same  Research token wallets, telecon L. Rooney re:same  Telecon M3 Partners, Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: transition issues  Telecon tax accountant re: employee witholding, telecons L. Rooney re: calculation of same	1.20 153.40 1.20 0.50 1.50 0.10 3.30 0.50 0.90 0.50 0.90 0.60 1.10	\$1,190.00 \$1,020.00 \$109,195.00 \$840.00 \$350.00 \$1,132.50 \$75.50 \$2,398.00 \$480.00 \$864.00 \$480.00 \$864.00 \$576.00 \$1,056.00
10/09/2024 Safemoon 10/09/2024 Safemoon Michael Garbe 04/16/2024 Safemoon 04/23/2024 Safemoon 09/23/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 12/20/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Analysis of sfm price/volume changes  Totals Amounts for User Lee Rooney  Meeting with Lee to discuss approach to preparation of initial MOR. Receive and review MOR as prepared by Lee, send Lee review comments. Receive and review Safemoon April 2024 MOR from Lee, call with Lee to discuss preparation details and suggested changes to MOR details. Call with Lee to discuss issue related to preparation of MOR.  Totals Amounts for User Michael Garbe  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman) re: workflows Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), C. Guilmin, and L. Rooney re: crypto assets and locations Research token liquidation plan, telecon L. Rooney re:same Research token wallets, telecon L. Rooney re:same Telecon M3 Partners, Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: transition issues	1.20 153.40 1.20 0.50 1.50 0.10 3.30 0.50 0.90 0.50 0.90 0.60	\$1,190.00 \$1,020.00 \$109,195.00 \$840.00 \$350.00 \$1,132.50 \$75.50 \$2,398.00 \$480.00 \$864.00 \$480.00 \$864.00 \$576.00
10/09/2024 Safemoon 10/09/2024 Safemoon Michael Garbe 04/16/2024 Safemoon 04/23/2024 Safemoon 09/23/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 12/20/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Analysis of sfm price/volume changes  Totals Amounts for User Lee Rooney  Meeting with Lee to discuss approach to preparation of initial MOR.  Receive and review MOR as prepared by Lee, send Lee review comments.  Receive and review Safemoon April 2024 MOR from Lee, call with Lee to discuss preparation details and suggested changes to MOR details.  Call with Lee to discuss issue related to preparation of MOR.  Totals Amounts for User Michael Garbe  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman) re: workflows  Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), C. Guilmin, and L. Rooney re: crypto assets and locations  Research token liquidation plan, telecon L. Rooney re:same  Research token wallets, telecon L. Rooney re:same  Telecon M3 Partners, Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: transition issues  Telecon tax accountant re: employee witholding, telecons L. Rooney re: calculation of same	1.20 153.40 1.20 0.50 1.50 0.10 3.30 0.50 0.90 0.50 0.90 0.60 1.10	\$1,190.00 \$1,020.00 \$109,195.00 \$840.00 \$350.00 \$1,132.50 \$75.50 \$2,398.00 \$480.00 \$864.00 \$480.00 \$864.00 \$576.00 \$1,056.00
10/09/2024 Safemoon 10/09/2024 Safemoon Michael Garbe 04/16/2024 Safemoon 04/23/2024 Safemoon 09/23/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 12/20/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 01/03/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Analysis of sfm price/volume changes Totals Amounts for User Lee Rooney  Meeting with Lee to discuss approach to preparation of initial MOR. Receive and review MOR as prepared by Lee, send Lee review comments. Receive and review Safemoon April 2024 MOR from Lee, call with Lee to discuss preparation details and suggested changes to MOR details. Call with Lee to discuss issue related to preparation of MOR. Totals Amounts for User Michael Garbe  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman) re: workflows Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), C. Guilmin, and L. Rooney re: crypto assets and locations Research token liquidation plan, telecon L. Rooney re:same Research token wallets, telecon L. Rooney re:same Telecon M3 Partners, Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: transition issues Telecon tax accountant re: employee witholding, telecons L. Rooney re: case strategy and work flows	1.20 153.40 1.20 0.50 1.50 0.10 3.30 0.50 0.90 0.50 0.90 0.60 1.10 1.50	\$1,190.00 \$1,020.00 \$109,195.00 \$840.00 \$350.00 \$1,132.50 \$75.50 \$2,398.00 \$480.00 \$864.00 \$480.00 \$576.00 \$1,056.00 \$1,440.00
10/09/2024 Safemoon 10/09/2024 Safemoon Michael Garbe 04/16/2024 Safemoon 04/23/2024 Safemoon 09/23/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 12/20/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 01/03/2024 Safemoon 01/04/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Analysis of sfm price/volume changes Totals Amounts for User Lee Rooney  Meeting with Lee to discuss approach to preparation of initial MOR. Receive and review MOR as prepared by Lee, send Lee review comments. Receive and review Safemoon April 2024 MOR from Lee, call with Lee to discuss preparation details and suggested changes to MOR details. Call with Lee to discuss issue related to preparation of MOR. Totals Amounts for User Michael Garbe  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman) re: workflows Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), C. Guilmin, and L. Rooney re: crypto assets and locations Research token liquidation plan, telecon L. Rooney re:same Research token wallets, telecon L. Rooney re:same Telecon M3 Partners, Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: transition issues Telecon tax accountant re: employee witholding, telecons L. Rooney re: calculation of same Telecon Foley (Goodman, Daugherty), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: case strategy and work flows	1.20 153.40 1.20 0.50 1.50 0.10 3.30 0.50 0.90 0.50 0.90 0.60 1.10 1.50 0.80	\$1,190.00 \$1,020.00 \$109,195.00 \$840.00 \$350.00 \$1,132.50 \$75.50 \$2,398.00 \$480.00 \$864.00 \$480.00 \$576.00 \$1,056.00 \$1,440.00
10/09/2024 Safemoon 10/09/2024 Safemoon 10/09/2024 Safemoon  Michael Garbe 04/16/2024 Safemoon 04/23/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 01/03/2024 Safemoon 01/03/2024 Safemoon 01/04/2024 Safemoon 01/07/2024 Safemoon 01/07/2024 Safemoon 01/07/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Analysis of sfm price/volume changes Totals Amounts for User Lee Rooney  Meeting with Lee to discuss approach to preparation of initial MOR. Receive and review MOR as prepared by Lee, send Lee review comments. Receive and review Safemoon April 2024 MOR from Lee, call with Lee to discuss preparation details and suggested changes to MOR details. Call with Lee to discuss issue related to preparation of MOR. Totals Amounts for User Michael Garbe  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman) re: workflows Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), C. Guilmin, and L. Rooney re: crypto assets and locations Research token liquidation plan, telecon L. Rooney re:same Research token wallets, telecon L. Rooney re:same Telecon M3 Partners, Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: transition issues Telecon tax accountant re: employee witholding, telecons L. Rooney re: calculation of same Telecon Foley (Goodman, Daugherty), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: case strategy and work flows  Telecon Trustee, L. Rooney re: business strategy Review payroll with L. Rooney Emails Foley (G. Goodman) re: missing funds tracing Telecon SFM GC (Nijawan), Trustee, L. Rooney re: litigation background and insurance matters	1.20 153.40  1.20 0.50 1.50 0.10 3.30  0.50 0.90 0.50 0.90 0.60 1.10 1.50  0.80 0.70 0.20 1.30	\$1,190.00 \$1,020.00 \$109,195.00 \$840.00 \$350.00 \$1,132.50 \$75.50 \$2,398.00 \$480.00 \$864.00 \$864.00 \$576.00 \$1,056.00 \$1,440.00 \$768.00 \$672.00 \$192.00 \$1,248.00
10/09/2024 Safemoon 10/09/2024 Safemoon 10/09/2024 Safemoon  Michael Garbe 04/16/2024 Safemoon 04/23/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 01/03/2024 Safemoon 01/03/2024 Safemoon 01/04/2024 Safemoon 01/07/2024 Safemoon 01/07/2024 Safemoon 01/10/2024 Safemoon 01/10/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Analysis of sfm price/volume changes Totals Amounts for User Lee Rooney  Meeting with Lee to discuss approach to preparation of initial MOR. Receive and review MOR as prepared by Lee, send Lee review comments. Receive and review Safemoon April 2024 MOR from Lee, call with Lee to discuss preparation details and suggested changes to MOR details. Call with Lee to discuss issue related to preparation of MOR. Totals Amounts for User Michael Garbe  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman) re: workflows Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), C. Guilmin, and L. Rooney re: crypto assets and locations Research token liquidation plan, telecon L. Rooney re:same Research token wallets, telecon L. Rooney re:same Telecon M3 Partners, Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: transition issues Telecon tax accountant re: employee witholding, telecons L. Rooney re: calculation of same Telecon Foley (Goodman, Daugherty), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: case strategy and work flows  Telecon Trustee, L. Rooney re: business strategy Review payroll with L. Rooney Emails Foley (G. Goodman) re: missing funds tracing Telecon SFM GC (Nijawan), Trustee, L. Rooney re: litigation background and insurance matters Telecon Trustee, L. Rooney re: employee contractors and case strategy	1.20 153.40  1.20 0.50 1.50 0.10 3.30  0.50 0.90 0.50 0.90 0.60 1.10 1.50  0.80 0.70 0.20 1.30 0.50	\$1,190.00 \$1,020.00 \$109,195.00 \$840.00 \$350.00 \$1,132.50 \$75.50 \$2,398.00 \$480.00 \$864.00 \$480.00 \$576.00 \$1,056.00 \$1,440.00 \$768.00 \$672.00 \$192.00 \$1,248.00 \$480.00
10/09/2024 Safemoon 10/09/2024 Safemoon 10/09/2024 Safemoon  Michael Garbe 04/16/2024 Safemoon 04/23/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 12/20/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 01/03/2024 Safemoon 01/03/2024 Safemoon 01/05/2024 Safemoon 01/07/2024 Safemoon 01/10/2024 Safemoon 01/10/2024 Safemoon 01/10/2024 Safemoon 01/10/2024 Safemoon 01/10/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Analysis of sfm price/volume changes Totals Amounts for User Lee Rooney  Meeting with Lee to discuss approach to preparation of initial MOR. Receive and review MOR as prepared by Lee, send Lee review comments. Receive and review Safemoon April 2024 MOR from Lee, call with Lee to discuss preparation details and suggested changes to MOR details. Call with Lee to discuss issue related to preparation of MOR. Totals Amounts for User Michael Garbe  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman) re: workflows Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), C. Guilmin, and L. Rooney re: crypto assets and locations Research token liquidation plan, telecon L. Rooney re:same Research token wallets, telecon L. Rooney re:same Telecon M3 Partners, Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: transition issues Telecon tax accountant re: employee witholding, telecons L. Rooney re: calculation of same Telecon Foley (Goodman, Daugherty), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: case strategy and work flows  Telecon Foley (Goodman, Tustee, L. Rooney re: business strategy Review payroll with L. Rooney Emails Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee, L. Rooney re: litigation background and insurance matters Telecon Trustee, L. Rooney re: employee contractors and case strategy Telecon Foley (Goodman), Trustee (E., Ostrow), and others re: social media and Discord	1.20 153.40  1.20 0.50 1.50 0.10 3.30  0.50 0.90 0.50 0.90 0.60 1.10 1.50 0.80 0.70 0.20 1.30 0.50 0.50	\$1,190.00 \$1,020.00 \$109,195.00 \$840.00 \$350.00 \$1,132.50 \$75.50 \$2,398.00 \$480.00 \$864.00 \$480.00 \$576.00 \$1,056.00 \$1,440.00 \$768.00 \$672.00 \$192.00 \$1,248.00 \$480.00 \$480.00
10/09/2024 Safemoon 10/09/2024 Safemoon 10/09/2024 Safemoon  Michael Garbe 04/16/2024 Safemoon 04/23/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 12/20/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 01/03/2024 Safemoon 01/03/2024 Safemoon 01/07/2024 Safemoon 01/07/2024 Safemoon 01/10/2024 Safemoon 01/10/2024 Safemoon 01/10/2024 Safemoon 01/10/2024 Safemoon 01/10/2024 Safemoon 01/10/2024 Safemoon 01/12/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Analysis of sfm price/volume changes Totals Amounts for User Lee Rooney  Meeting with Lee to discuss approach to preparation of initial MOR. Receive and review MOR as prepared by Lee, send Lee review comments. Receive and review Safemoon April 2024 MOR from Lee, call with Lee to discuss preparation details and suggested changes to MOR details. Call with Lee to discuss issue related to preparation of MOR. Totals Amounts for User Michael Garbe  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman) re: workflows Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), C. Guilmin, and L. Rooney re: crypto assets and locations Research token liquidation plan, telecon L. Rooney re:same Research token wallets, telecon L. Rooney re:same Telecon M3 Partners, Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: transition issues Telecon tax accountant re: employee witholding, telecons L. Rooney re: calculation of same Telecon Foley (Goodman, Daugherty), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: case strategy and work flows  Telecon Trustee, L. Rooney re: business strategy Review payroll with L. Rooney Emails Foley (G. Goodman) re: missing funds tracing Telecon SFM GC (Nijawan), Trustee, L. Rooney re: litigation background and insurance matters Telecon Trustee, L. Rooney re: employee contractors and case strategy Telecon Foley (Goodman), Trustee (E., Ostrow), and others re: social media and Discord Review payroll for contractors, telecon L. Rooney re: same	1.20 153.40  1.20 0.50 1.50 0.10 3.30  0.50 0.90 0.50 0.90 0.60 1.10 1.50 0.80 0.70 0.20 1.30 0.50 0.50 0.50	\$1,190.00 \$1,020.00 \$109,195.00 \$840.00 \$350.00 \$1,132.50 \$75.50 \$2,398.00 \$480.00 \$864.00 \$480.00 \$1,056.00 \$1,056.00 \$1,440.00 \$672.00 \$192.00 \$1,248.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00
10/09/2024 Safemoon 10/09/2024 Safemoon 10/09/2024 Safemoon  Michael Garbe 04/16/2024 Safemoon 04/23/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 12/20/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 01/03/2024 Safemoon 01/03/2024 Safemoon 01/04/2024 Safemoon 01/07/2024 Safemoon 01/10/2024 Safemoon 01/10/2024 Safemoon 01/10/2024 Safemoon 01/10/2024 Safemoon 01/12/2024 Safemoon 01/12/2024 Safemoon 01/12/2024 Safemoon 01/12/2024 Safemoon 01/16/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Analysis of sfm price/volume changes Totals Amounts for User Lee Rooney  Meeting with Lee to discuss approach to preparation of initial MOR. Receive and review MOR as prepared by Lee, send Lee review comments. Receive and review Safemoon April 2024 MOR from Lee, call with Lee to discuss preparation details and suggested changes to MOR details. Call with Lee to discuss issue related to preparation of MOR. Totals Amounts for User Michael Garbe  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman) re: workflows Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), C. Guilmin, and L. Rooney re: crypto assets and locations Research token liquidation plan, telecon L. Rooney re:same Research token wallets, telecon L. Rooney re:same Telecon M3 Partners, Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: transition issues Telecon tax accountant re: employee witholding, telecons L. Rooney re: calculation of same Telecon Foley (Goodman, Daugherty), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: case strategy and work flows  Telecon Trustee, L. Rooney re: business strategy Review payroll with L. Rooney Emails Foley (G. Goodman) re: missing funds tracing Telecon SFM GC (Nijawan), Trustee, L. Rooney re: litigation background and insurance matters Telecon Trustee, L. Rooney re: employee contractors and case strategy Telecon Foley (Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow), and others re: social media and Discord Review payroll for contractors, telecon L. Rooney re: same Telecon with C. Guilmin, L. Rooney re: smart contracts and Bybit report	1.20 153.40  1.20 0.50 1.50 0.10 3.30  0.50 0.90 0.50 0.90 0.60 1.10 1.50 0.80 0.70 0.20 1.30 0.50 0.50 0.50 0.50 0.70	\$1,190.00 \$1,020.00 \$109,195.00 \$840.00 \$350.00 \$1,132.50 \$75.50 \$2,398.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$576.00 \$1,056.00 \$1,440.00 \$672.00 \$192.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$672.00
10/09/2024 Safemoon 10/09/2024 Safemoon 10/09/2024 Safemoon  Michael Garbe 04/16/2024 Safemoon 04/23/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 12/20/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 01/03/2024 Safemoon 01/03/2024 Safemoon 01/07/2024 Safemoon 01/07/2024 Safemoon 01/10/2024 Safemoon 01/10/2024 Safemoon 01/10/2024 Safemoon 01/10/2024 Safemoon 01/10/2024 Safemoon 01/10/2024 Safemoon 01/12/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Analysis of sfm price/volume changes Totals Amounts for User Lee Rooney  Meeting with Lee to discuss approach to preparation of initial MOR. Receive and review MOR as prepared by Lee, send Lee review comments. Receive and review Safemoon April 2024 MOR from Lee, call with Lee to discuss preparation details and suggested changes to MOR details. Call with Lee to discuss issue related to preparation of MOR. Totals Amounts for User Michael Garbe  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman) re: workflows Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), C. Guilmin, and L. Rooney re: crypto assets and locations Research token liquidation plan, telecon L. Rooney re:same Research token wallets, telecon L. Rooney re:same Telecon M3 Partners, Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: transition issues Telecon tax accountant re: employee witholding, telecons L. Rooney re: calculation of same Telecon Foley (Goodman, Daugherty), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: case strategy and work flows  Telecon Trustee, L. Rooney re: business strategy Review payroll with L. Rooney Emails Foley (G. Goodman) re: missing funds tracing Telecon SFM GC (Nijawan), Trustee, L. Rooney re: litigation background and insurance matters Telecon Trustee, L. Rooney re: employee contractors and case strategy Telecon Foley (Goodman), Trustee (E., Ostrow), and others re: social media and Discord Review payroll for contractors, telecon L. Rooney re: same	1.20 153.40  1.20 0.50 1.50 0.10 3.30  0.50 0.90 0.50 0.90 0.60 1.10 1.50 0.80 0.70 0.20 1.30 0.50 0.50 0.50	\$1,190.00 \$1,020.00 \$109,195.00 \$840.00 \$350.00 \$1,132.50 \$75.50 \$2,398.00 \$480.00 \$864.00 \$480.00 \$1,056.00 \$1,056.00 \$1,440.00 \$672.00 \$192.00 \$1,248.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00
10/09/2024 Safemoon 10/09/2024 Safemoon 10/09/2024 Safemoon  Michael Garbe 04/16/2024 Safemoon 04/23/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 12/20/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 01/03/2024 Safemoon 01/03/2024 Safemoon 01/04/2024 Safemoon 01/07/2024 Safemoon 01/10/2024 Safemoon 01/10/2024 Safemoon 01/10/2024 Safemoon 01/10/2024 Safemoon 01/12/2024 Safemoon 01/12/2024 Safemoon 01/12/2024 Safemoon 01/12/2024 Safemoon 01/16/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Analysis of sfm price/volume changes Totals Amounts for User Lee Rooney  Meeting with Lee to discuss approach to preparation of initial MOR. Receive and review MOR as prepared by Lee, send Lee review comments. Receive and review Safemoon April 2024 MOR from Lee, call with Lee to discuss preparation details and suggested changes to MOR details. Call with Lee to discuss issue related to preparation of MOR. Totals Amounts for User Michael Garbe  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman) re: workflows Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), C. Guilmin, and L. Rooney re: crypto assets and locations Research token liquidation plan, telecon L. Rooney re:same Research token wallets, telecon L. Rooney re:same Telecon M3 Partners, Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: transition issues Telecon tax accountant re: employee witholding, telecons L. Rooney re: calculation of same Telecon Foley (Goodman, Daugherty), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: case strategy and work flows  Telecon Trustee, L. Rooney re: business strategy Review payroll with L. Rooney Emails Foley (G. Goodman) re: missing funds tracing Telecon SFM GC (Nijawan), Trustee, L. Rooney re: litigation background and insurance matters Telecon Trustee, L. Rooney re: employee contractors and case strategy Telecon Foley (Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow), and others re: social media and Discord Review payroll for contractors, telecon L. Rooney re: same Telecon with C. Guilmin, L. Rooney re: smart contracts and Bybit report	1.20 153.40  1.20 0.50 1.50 0.10 3.30  0.50 0.90 0.50 0.90 0.60 1.10 1.50 0.80 0.70 0.20 1.30 0.50 0.50 0.50 0.50 0.70	\$1,190.00 \$1,020.00 \$109,195.00 \$840.00 \$350.00 \$1,132.50 \$75.50 \$2,398.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$576.00 \$1,056.00 \$1,440.00 \$672.00 \$192.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$672.00
10/09/2024 Safemoon 10/09/2024 Safemoon 10/09/2024 Safemoon  Michael Garbe 04/16/2024 Safemoon 04/23/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 12/20/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 01/03/2024 Safemoon 01/03/2024 Safemoon 01/05/2024 Safemoon 01/10/2024 Safemoon 01/10/2024 Safemoon 01/10/2024 Safemoon 01/12/2024 Safemoon 01/12/2024 Safemoon 01/12/2024 Safemoon 01/12/2024 Safemoon 01/16/2024 Safemoon 01/16/2024 Safemoon 01/16/2024 Safemoon 01/16/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Analysis of sfm price/volume changes Totals Amounts for User Lee Rooney  Meeting with Lee to discuss approach to preparation of initial MOR. Receive and review MOR as prepared by Lee, send Lee review comments. Receive and review Safemoon April 2024 MOR from Lee, call with Lee to discuss preparation details and suggested changes to MOR details. Call with Lee to discuss issue related to preparation of MOR. Totals Amounts for User Michael Garbe  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman) re: workflows Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), C. Guilmin, and L. Rooney re: crypto assets and locations Research token liquidation plan, telecon L. Rooney re:same Research token wallets, telecon L. Rooney re:same Telecon M3 Partners, Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: transition issues Telecon tax accountant re: employee witholding, telecons L. Rooney re: calculation of same Telecon Foley (Goodman, Daugherty), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: case strategy and work flows  Telecon Trustee, L. Rooney re: business strategy Review payroll with L. Rooney Emails Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee, L. Rooney re: litigation background and insurance matters Telecon Trustee, L. Rooney re: employee contractors and case strategy Telecon Foley (Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow), and others re: social media and Discord Review payroll for contractors, telecon L. Rooney re: same Telecon with C. Guilmin, L. Rooney re: smart contracts and Bybit report Telecon Foley (Goodman, Daugherty), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: case strategy and work flows	1.20 153.40  1.20 0.50 1.50 0.10 3.30  0.50 0.90 0.50 0.90 0.60 1.10 1.50 0.80 0.70 0.20 1.30 0.50 0.50 0.50 0.50 0.50	\$1,190.00 \$1,020.00 \$109,195.00 \$840.00 \$350.00 \$1,132.50 \$75.50 \$2,398.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$576.00 \$1,056.00 \$1,440.00 \$672.00 \$192.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00
10/09/2024 Safemoon 10/09/2024 Safemoon 10/09/2024 Safemoon  Michael Garbe 04/16/2024 Safemoon 04/23/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 12/20/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 01/03/2024 Safemoon 01/03/2024 Safemoon 01/05/2024 Safemoon 01/10/2024 Safemoon 01/10/2024 Safemoon 01/12/2024 Safemoon 01/12/2024 Safemoon 01/12/2024 Safemoon 01/12/2024 Safemoon 01/16/2024 Safemoon 01/16/2024 Safemoon 01/16/2024 Safemoon 01/16/2024 Safemoon 01/16/2024 Safemoon 01/18/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Analysis of sfm price/volume changes  Totals Amounts for User Lee Rooney  Meeting with Lee to discuss approach to preparation of initial MOR.  Receive and review MOR as prepared by Lee, send Lee review comments.  Receive and review Safemoon April 2024 MOR from Lee, call with Lee to discuss preparation details and suggested changes to MOR details.  Call with Lee to discuss issue related to preparation of MOR.  Totals Amounts for User Michael Garbe  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman) re: workflows  Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), C. Guilmin, and L. Rooney re: crypto assets and locations  Research token liquidation plan, telecon L. Rooney re:same  Research token wallets, telecon L. Rooney re:same  Telecon M3 Partners, Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: transition issues  Telecon tax accountant re: employee witholding, telecons L. Rooney re: calculation of same  Telecon Foley (Goodman, Daugherty), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: case strategy and work flows  Telecon Trustee, L. Rooney re: business strategy  Review payroll with L. Rooney  Emails Foley (G. Goodman) re: missing funds tracing  Telecon SFM GC (Nijawan), Trustee, L. Rooney re: litigation background and insurance matters  Telecon Trustee, L. Rooney re: employee contractors and case strategy  Telecon Foley (Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow), and others re: social media and Discord  Review payroll for contractors, telecon L. Rooney re: same  Telecon with C. Guilmin, L. Rooney re: smart contracts and Bybit report  Telecon Foley (Goodman), Daugherty), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: case strategy and work flows  Review push notificartion to wallet holders  Telecon L. Rooney, M. Friedler re: crypto tracing analysis interviews and scope of work.  Telecon P. Daugherty, L. Rooney, M. Friedler re: crypto tracing analysis interviews and scope of	1.20 153.40  1.20 0.50 1.50 0.10 3.30  0.50 0.90 0.50 0.90 0.60 1.10 1.50 0.80 0.70 0.20 1.30 0.50 0.50 0.50 0.50 0.50 0.50 0.70 0.50	\$1,190.00 \$1,020.00 \$109,195.00 \$840.00 \$350.00 \$1,132.50 \$75.50 \$2,398.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$576.00 \$1,056.00 \$1,440.00 \$672.00 \$192.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00
10/09/2024 Safemoon 10/09/2024 Safemoon 10/09/2024 Safemoon  Michael Garbe 04/16/2024 Safemoon 09/23/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 01/03/2024 Safemoon 01/05/2024 Safemoon 01/05/2024 Safemoon 01/07/2024 Safemoon 01/10/2024 Safemoon 01/10/2024 Safemoon 01/12/2024 Safemoon 01/12/2024 Safemoon 01/18/2024 Safemoon 01/18/2024 Safemoon 01/19/2024 Safemoon 01/19/2024 Safemoon 01/19/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Analysis of sfm price/volume changes  Totals Amounts for User Lee Rooney  Meeting with Lee to discuss approach to preparation of initial MOR.  Receive and review MOR as prepared by Lee, send Lee review comments.  Receive and review Safemoon April 2024 MOR from Lee, call with Lee to discuss preparation details and suggested changes to MOR details.  Call with Lee to discuss issue related to preparation of MOR.  Totals Amounts for User Michael Garbe  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman) re: workflows  Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), C. Guilmin, and L. Rooney re: crypto assets and locations  Research token liquidation plan, telecon L. Rooney re:same  Research token wallets, telecon L. Rooney re:same  Telecon M3 Partners, Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: transition issues  Telecon tax accountant re: employee witholding, telecons L. Rooney re: calculation of same  Telecon Foley (Goodman, Daugherty), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: case strategy and work flows  Telecon Trustee, L. Rooney re: business strategy  Review payroll with L. Rooney  Emails Foley (G. Goodman) re: missing funds tracing  Telecon Frustee, L. Rooney re: employee contractors and case strategy  Telecon Foley (Goodman), Trustee (E., Ostrow), and others re: social media and Discord  Review payroll for contractors, telecon L. Rooney re: same  Telecon Foley (Goodman, Daugherty), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: case strategy and work flows  Telecon Foley (Goodman, Daugherty), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: case strategy and work flows  Review payroll for contractors, telecon L. Rooney re: same  Telecon Foley (Goodman, Daugherty), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: case strategy and work flows	1.20 153.40  1.20 0.50 1.50 0.10 3.30  0.50 0.90 0.50 0.90 0.60 1.10 1.50 0.80 0.70 0.20 1.30 0.50 0.50 0.50 0.50 0.50 0.50 0.50 0	\$1,190.00 \$1,020.00 \$109,195.00 \$840.00 \$350.00 \$1,132.50 \$75.50 \$2,398.00 \$480.00 \$864.00 \$480.00 \$1,056.00 \$1,056.00 \$1,440.00 \$672.00 \$192.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$356.00
10/09/2024 Safemoon 10/09/2024 Safemoon 10/09/2024 Safemoon  Michael Garbe 04/16/2024 Safemoon 09/23/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 01/03/2024 Safemoon 01/05/2024 Safemoon 01/05/2024 Safemoon 01/10/2024 Safemoon 01/10/2024 Safemoon 01/12/2024 Safemoon 01/12/2024 Safemoon 01/18/2024 Safemoon 01/19/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Analysis of sfm price/volume changes  Totals Amounts for User Lee Rooney  Meeting with Lee to discuss approach to preparation of initial MOR. Receive and review MOR as prepared by Lee, send Lee review comments. Receive and review Safemoon April 2024 MOR from Lee, call with Lee to discuss preparation details and suggested changes to MOR details. Call with Lee to discuss issue related to preparation of MOR.  Totals Amounts for User Michael Garbe  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman) re: workflows Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), C. Guilmin, and L. Rooney re: crypto assets and locations Research token liquidation plan, telecon L. Rooney re:same Research token wallets, telecon L. Rooney re:same Telecon M3 Partners, Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: transition issues Telecon tax accountant re: employee witholding, telecons L. Rooney re: case strategy and work flows  Telecon Foley (Goodman, Daugherty), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: case strategy and work flows  Telecon Trustee, L. Rooney re: business strategy Review payroll with L. Rooney Emails Foley (G. Goodman) re: missing funds tracing Telecon SFM GC (Nijawan), Trustee, L. Rooney re: litigation background and insurance matters Telecon Trustee, L. Rooney re: employee contractors and case strategy Telecon Foley (Goodman), Trustee (E., Ostrow), and others re: social media and Discord Review payroll for contractors, telecon L. Rooney re: same Telecon with C. Guilmin, L. Rooney re: smart contracts and Bybit report Telecon Foley (Goodman, Daugherty), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: case strategy and work flows Review push notificartion to wallet holders Telecon L. Rooney, M. Friedler re: crypto tracing analysis interviews and scope of work. Telecon P. Daugherty, L. Rooney, M. Friedler re: crypto tracing analysis interviews and scope of work. Telecon L. Rooney and others re: crypto wallets	1.20 153.40  1.20 0.50 1.50 0.10 3.30  0.50 0.90 0.50 0.90 0.60 1.10 1.50  0.80 0.70 0.20 1.30 0.50 0.50 0.50 0.50 0.50 0.50 0.50 0	\$1,190.00 \$1,020.00 \$109,195.00 \$840.00 \$350.00 \$1,132.50 \$75.50 \$2,398.00 \$480.00 \$864.00 \$480.00 \$1,056.00 \$1,440.00 \$672.00 \$1,248.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$576.00 \$1,248.00 \$480.00
10/09/2024 Safemoon 10/09/2024 Safemoon 10/09/2024 Safemoon  Michael Garbe 04/16/2024 Safemoon 09/23/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/22/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 12/26/2023 Safemoon 01/03/2024 Safemoon 01/05/2024 Safemoon 01/05/2024 Safemoon 01/07/2024 Safemoon 01/10/2024 Safemoon 01/10/2024 Safemoon 01/12/2024 Safemoon 01/12/2024 Safemoon 01/18/2024 Safemoon 01/18/2024 Safemoon 01/19/2024 Safemoon 01/19/2024 Safemoon 01/19/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Analysis of sfm price/volume changes  Totals Amounts for User Lee Rooney  Meeting with Lee to discuss approach to preparation of initial MOR.  Receive and review MOR as prepared by Lee, send Lee review comments.  Receive and review Safemoon April 2024 MOR from Lee, call with Lee to discuss preparation details and suggested changes to MOR details.  Call with Lee to discuss issue related to preparation of MOR.  Totals Amounts for User Michael Garbe  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman) re: workflows  Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), C. Guilmin, and L. Rooney re: crypto assets and locations  Research token liquidation plan, telecon L. Rooney re:same  Research token wallets, telecon L. Rooney re:same  Telecon M3 Partners, Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: transition issues  Telecon tax accountant re: employee witholding, telecons L. Rooney re: calculation of same  Telecon Foley (Goodman, Daugherty), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: case strategy and work flows  Telecon Trustee, L. Rooney re: business strategy  Review payroll with L. Rooney  Emails Foley (G. Goodman) re: missing funds tracing  Telecon Frustee, L. Rooney re: employee contractors and case strategy  Telecon Foley (Goodman), Trustee (E., Ostrow), and others re: social media and Discord  Review payroll for contractors, telecon L. Rooney re: same  Telecon Foley (Goodman, Daugherty), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: case strategy and work flows  Telecon Foley (Goodman, Daugherty), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: case strategy and work flows  Review payroll for contractors, telecon L. Rooney re: same  Telecon Foley (Goodman, Daugherty), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: case strategy and work flows	1.20 153.40  1.20 0.50 1.50 0.10 3.30  0.50 0.90 0.50 0.90 0.60 1.10 1.50 0.80 0.70 0.20 1.30 0.50 0.50 0.50 0.50 0.50 0.50 0.50 0	\$1,190.00 \$1,020.00 \$109,195.00 \$840.00 \$350.00 \$1,132.50 \$75.50 \$2,398.00 \$480.00 \$864.00 \$480.00 \$1,056.00 \$1,056.00 \$1,440.00 \$672.00 \$192.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$356.00

## Case 23-25749 Doc 242 Filed 12/06/24 Entered 12/06/24 10:36:02 Desc Main Document Page 26 of 34

01/22/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon L. Rooney , M. Friedler re: crypto wallets	0.60	\$534.00
01/30/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: asset transfers and wallet set up and options	1.00	\$960.00
01/30/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon crypto consultant re: asset transfers and wallet options	0.60	\$576.00
01/31/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Particpate in consolidation of crypto assets to Trustee controlled wallet	2.30	\$2,208.00
02/06/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Participate on liquidity pool unpairing strategy telecon, M. Stevens, L. Rooney, Trustee	2.30	\$2,208.00
02/07/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon L. Rooney re: submission of Form 940 and 941	0.70	\$672.00
02/08/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon L. Rooney, D. Oliver re: review of infrastructure	0.50	\$480.00
02/09/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon T. Halkowski, L. Rooney re: wallets and DEXs	1.00	\$960.00
02/16/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee re: bar date and notice issues	0.50	\$480.00
02/22/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon L. Rooney re: infrastructure plans	0.60	\$576.00
02/23/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley, Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney and others re: IP filing deadlines and value	1.50	\$1,440.00
02/23/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Email exchage Foley (G. Goodman) re: motion to continue operations, review same	0.50	\$480.00
02/29/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon L. Rooney re: admin accounts	0.20	\$192.00
03/01/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Email exchange Foley, Trustee (E. Ostrow) re: Lynne Spraggs claims	0.50	\$480.00
03/04/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Squidgrow Joe correspondence issues, telecons L. Rooney re: same	0.50	\$480.00
03/06/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), L. Rooney re: AWS issues	0.30	\$288.00
03/08/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Analysis of crypto assets and inventory of same, telecons L. Rooney re: same	1.00	\$960.00
03/12/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecons L. Rooney re: AWS issues	0.40	\$384.00
03/20/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon L. Rooney, C. Guilman re: token claims	1.80	\$1,728.00
03/26/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Research and analysis of liquidity pools	1.50	\$1,440.00
03/26/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), Foley (G. Goodman), L. Rooney re: liquidity pools	1.20	\$1,152.00
03/28/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon L. Rooney re: liquidity pool description for declaration	0.60	\$576.00
03/28/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review and revise draft of liquidity pool description for declaration, telecons L. Rooney re: same	0.50	\$445.00
03/28/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review and provide comments to draft declaration in support of motion to sell cryptoassets	0.50	\$445.00
04/19/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review Spraggs motion for payment	0.40	\$384.00
04/23/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review draft MOR, telecon L. Rooney re: same	0.90	\$864.00
04/24/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review and revise monthly operating report, telecons L. Rooney re: same	1.50	\$1,335.00
04/29/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Email exchange Foley, L. Rooney re: Spraggs motion for payment	0.40	\$384.00
04/30/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review and revise analysis of Spragg service value	0.80	\$768.00
05/29/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecons Foley (G. Goodman), L. Rooney re: proposed Spraggs settlement	0.60	\$576.00
08/27/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon J. Petrower re: subpoena, telecon Foley (G. Goodman) re: same	0.70	\$672.00
08/29/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Emails Foley (G. Goodman) re: AWS issues	0.30	\$288.00
09/03/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow) re: document subpoena issues	0.50	\$480.00
09/03/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee, L. Rooney re: AWS issues	0.80	\$768.00
09/04/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow) re: document subpoena issues	0.00	\$576.00
	Chapter / Hastee	refective of the determinant, induced in our feet additional state of the state of	0.60	\$370.00
09/04/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review AWS settlement proposal	0.60	\$384.00
09/04/2024 Safemoon 09/05/2024 Safemoon	•			
	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review AWS settlement proposal	0.40	\$384.00
09/05/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Review AWS settlement proposal  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), government representartives re: document subpoena issues	0.40 0.70	\$384.00 \$672.00
09/05/2024 Safemoon 09/23/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Review AWS settlement proposal  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), government representartives re: document subpoena issues Review draft second MOR, telecon L. Rooney re: same	0.40 0.70 0.80	\$384.00 \$672.00 \$768.00
09/05/2024 Safemoon 09/23/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Review AWS settlement proposal  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), government representartives re: document subpoena issues Review draft second MOR, telecon L. Rooney re: same  Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: review of MOR	0.40 0.70 0.80 0.30	\$384.00 \$672.00 \$768.00 \$288.00
09/05/2024 Safemoon 09/23/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review AWS settlement proposal  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), government representartives re: document subpoena issues Review draft second MOR, telecon L. Rooney re: same  Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon L. Rooney re: review of MOR	0.40 0.70 0.80 0.30 0.40	\$384.00 \$672.00 \$768.00 \$288.00 \$384.00
09/05/2024 Safemoon 09/23/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 10/07/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review AWS settlement proposal  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), government representartives re: document subpoena issues Review draft second MOR, telecon L. Rooney re: same  Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon Les Borsai re: outstanding payments	0.40 0.70 0.80 0.30 0.40	\$384.00 \$672.00 \$768.00 \$288.00 \$384.00 \$384.00
09/05/2024 Safemoon 09/23/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 10/07/2024 Safemoon 10/08/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review AWS settlement proposal  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), government representartives re: document subpoena issues Review draft second MOR, telecon L. Rooney re: same  Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon Les Borsai re: outstanding payments  Draft invoices for APA payments due and owing	0.40 0.70 0.80 0.30 0.40 0.40	\$384.00 \$672.00 \$768.00 \$288.00 \$384.00 \$384.00 \$480.00
09/05/2024 Safemoon 09/23/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 10/07/2024 Safemoon 10/08/2024 Safemoon 10/15/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review AWS settlement proposal  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), government representartives re: document subpoena issues Review draft second MOR, telecon L. Rooney re: same  Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon Les Borsai re: outstanding payments  Draft invoices for APA payments due and owing  Prepare for mediation including review of class claims and related analysis	0.40 0.70 0.80 0.30 0.40 0.40 0.50 2.80	\$384.00 \$672.00 \$768.00 \$288.00 \$384.00 \$384.00 \$480.00 \$2,688.00
09/05/2024 Safemoon 09/23/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 10/07/2024 Safemoon 10/08/2024 Safemoon 10/15/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review AWS settlement proposal  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), government representartives re: document subpoena issues Review draft second MOR, telecon L. Rooney re: same  Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon Les Borsai re: outstanding payments  Draft invoices for APA payments due and owing  Prepare for mediation including review of class claims and related analysis  Particpate in mediation with class claim representaives, Foley, Trustee	0.40 0.70 0.80 0.30 0.40 0.40 0.50 2.80 2.60	\$384.00 \$672.00 \$768.00 \$288.00 \$384.00 \$384.00 \$480.00 \$2,688.00 \$2,496.00
09/05/2024 Safemoon 09/23/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 10/07/2024 Safemoon 10/08/2024 Safemoon 10/15/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review AWS settlement proposal  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), government representartives re: document subpoena issues Review draft second MOR, telecon L. Rooney re: same  Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon Les Borsai re: outstanding payments  Draft invoices for APA payments due and owing  Prepare for mediation including review of class claims and related analysis  Particpate in mediation with class claim representaives, Foley, Trustee	0.40 0.70 0.80 0.30 0.40 0.40 0.50 2.80 2.60	\$384.00 \$672.00 \$768.00 \$288.00 \$384.00 \$384.00 \$480.00 \$2,688.00 \$2,496.00
09/05/2024 Safemoon 09/23/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 10/07/2024 Safemoon 10/08/2024 Safemoon 10/15/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review AWS settlement proposal  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), government representartives re: document subpoena issues Review draft second MOR, telecon L. Rooney re: same  Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon Les Borsai re: outstanding payments  Draft invoices for APA payments due and owing  Prepare for mediation including review of class claims and related analysis  Particpate in mediation with class claim representaives, Foley, Trustee  Totals Amounts for User Peter Hurwitz	0.40 0.70 0.80 0.30 0.40 0.50 2.80 2.60 52.20	\$384.00 \$672.00 \$768.00 \$288.00 \$384.00 \$384.00 \$480.00 \$2,688.00 \$2,496.00 \$49,811.00
09/05/2024 Safemoon 09/23/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 10/07/2024 Safemoon 10/08/2024 Safemoon 10/15/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon Peter Mikhailenok 02/02/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review AWS settlement proposal  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), government representartives re: document subpoena issues Review draft second MOR, telecon L. Rooney re: same  Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon Les Borsai re: outstanding payments  Draft invoices for APA payments due and owing  Prepare for mediation including review of class claims and related analysis  Particpate in mediation with class claim representaives, Foley, Trustee  Totals Amounts for User Peter Hurwitz  2hr initial project research + 3 hours calls (E.Ostrow, T. Halkowski, M. Stevens, C. Guilmin)	0.40 0.70 0.80 0.30 0.40 0.50 2.80 2.60 52.20	\$384.00 \$672.00 \$768.00 \$288.00 \$384.00 \$384.00 \$480.00 \$2,688.00 \$2,496.00 \$49,811.00
09/05/2024 Safemoon 09/23/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 10/07/2024 Safemoon 10/08/2024 Safemoon 10/15/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon Peter Mikhailenok 02/02/2024 Safemoon 02/05/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review AWS settlement proposal  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), government representartives re: document subpoena issues Review draft second MOR, telecon L. Rooney re: same  Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon Les Borsai re: outstanding payments  Draft invoices for APA payments due and owing  Prepare for mediation including review of class claims and related analysis  Particpate in mediation with class claim representaives, Foley, Trustee  Totals Amounts for User Peter Hurwitz  2hr initial project research + 3 hours calls (E.Ostrow, T. Halkowski, M. Stevens, C. Guilmin) 2+2hr call. 2hr Patent reading, call w/Ostrow/Spraggs + Marketing call Rooney/Hurwitz/Breeze	0.40 0.70 0.80 0.30 0.40 0.50 2.80 2.60 52.20	\$384.00 \$672.00 \$768.00 \$288.00 \$384.00 \$384.00 \$480.00 \$2,688.00 \$2,496.00 \$49,811.00
09/05/2024 Safemoon 09/23/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 10/07/2024 Safemoon 10/08/2024 Safemoon 10/15/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon  Peter Mikhailenok 02/02/2024 Safemoon 02/05/2024 Safemoon 02/08/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review AWS settlement proposal  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), government representartives re: document subpoena issues Review draft second MOR, telecon L. Rooney re: same  Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon Les Borsai re: outstanding payments  Draft invoices for APA payments due and owing  Prepare for mediation including review of class claims and related analysis  Particpate in mediation with class claim representaives, Foley, Trustee  Totals Amounts for User Peter Hurwitz  2hr initial project research + 3 hours calls (E.Ostrow, T. Halkowski, M. Stevens, C. Guilmin) 2+2hr call. 2hr Patent reading, call w/Ostrow/Spraggs + Marketing call Rooney/Hurwitz/Breeze  List of crypto VCs	0.40 0.70 0.80 0.30 0.40 0.50 2.80 2.60 52.20 5.50 4.00 1.50	\$384.00 \$672.00 \$768.00 \$288.00 \$384.00 \$384.00 \$480.00 \$2,688.00 \$2,496.00 \$49,811.00 \$3,575.00 \$2,600.00 \$975.00
09/05/2024 Safemoon 09/23/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 10/07/2024 Safemoon 10/08/2024 Safemoon 10/15/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 02/02/2024 Safemoon 02/02/2024 Safemoon 02/05/2024 Safemoon 02/08/2024 Safemoon 02/08/2024 Safemoon 02/09/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review AWS settlement proposal  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), government representartives re: document subpoena issues Review draft second MOR, telecon L. Rooney re: same  Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon Les Borsai re: outstanding payments  Draft invoices for APA payments due and owing  Prepare for mediation including review of class claims and related analysis  Particpate in mediation with class claim representaives, Foley, Trustee  Totals Amounts for User Peter Hurwitz  2hr initial project research + 3 hours calls (E.Ostrow, T. Halkowski, M. Stevens, C. Guilmin) 2+2hr call. 2hr Patent reading, call w/Ostrow/Spraggs + Marketing call Rooney/Hurwitz/Breeze List of crypto VCs	0.40 0.70 0.80 0.30 0.40 0.50 2.80 2.60 52.20 5.50 4.00 1.50	\$384.00 \$672.00 \$768.00 \$288.00 \$384.00 \$384.00 \$480.00 \$2,688.00 \$2,496.00 \$49,811.00 \$3,575.00 \$2,600.00 \$975.00
09/05/2024 Safemoon 09/23/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 10/07/2024 Safemoon 10/08/2024 Safemoon 10/15/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 02/02/2024 Safemoon 02/02/2024 Safemoon 02/05/2024 Safemoon 02/08/2024 Safemoon 02/08/2024 Safemoon 02/09/2024 Safemoon 02/09/2024 Safemoon 02/09/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review AWS settlement proposal  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), government representartives re: document subpoena issues Review draft second MOR, telecon L. Rooney re: same  Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon Les Borsai re: outstanding payments  Draft invoices for APA payments due and owing  Prepare for mediation including review of class claims and related analysis  Particpate in mediation with class claim representaives, Foley, Trustee  Totals Amounts for User Peter Hurwitz  2hr initial project research + 3 hours calls (E.Ostrow, T. Halkowski, M. Stevens, C. Guilmin) 2+2hr call. 2hr Patent reading, call w/Ostrow/Spraggs + Marketing call Rooney/Hurwitz/Breeze List of crypto VCs List of crypto VCs SafeMoon products teaser presentation proposal	0.40 0.70 0.80 0.30 0.40 0.50 2.80 2.60 52.20 5.50 4.00 1.50 1.00	\$384.00 \$672.00 \$768.00 \$288.00 \$384.00 \$384.00 \$480.00 \$2,688.00 \$2,496.00 \$49,811.00 \$3,575.00 \$2,600.00 \$975.00 \$975.00 \$650.00
09/05/2024 Safemoon 09/23/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 10/07/2024 Safemoon 10/08/2024 Safemoon 10/15/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 02/02/2024 Safemoon 02/02/2024 Safemoon 02/05/2024 Safemoon 02/08/2024 Safemoon 02/08/2024 Safemoon 02/09/2024 Safemoon 02/09/2024 Safemoon 02/09/2024 Safemoon 02/10/2024 Safemoon 02/10/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review AWS settlement proposal  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), government representartives re: document subpoena issues Review draft second MOR, telecon L. Rooney re: same  Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon Les Borsai re: outstanding payments  Draft invoices for APA payments due and owing  Prepare for mediation including review of class claims and related analysis  Particpate in mediation with class claim representaives, Foley, Trustee  Totals Amounts for User Peter Hurwitz  2hr initial project research + 3 hours calls (E.Ostrow, T. Halkowski, M. Stevens, C. Guilmin) 2+2hr call. 2hr Patent reading, call w/Ostrow/Spraggs + Marketing call Rooney/Hurwitz/Breeze List of crypto VCs List of crypto VCs SafeMoon products teaser presentation proposal  1hr call + 2 hrs products teaser presentation final	0.40 0.70 0.80 0.30 0.40 0.50 2.80 2.60 52.20 5.50 4.00 1.50 1.00 3.00	\$384.00 \$672.00 \$768.00 \$288.00 \$384.00 \$480.00 \$2,688.00 \$2,496.00 \$49,811.00 \$3,575.00 \$2,600.00 \$975.00 \$975.00 \$650.00 \$1,950.00
09/05/2024 Safemoon 09/23/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 10/07/2024 Safemoon 10/08/2024 Safemoon 10/15/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 02/02/2024 Safemoon 02/05/2024 Safemoon 02/08/2024 Safemoon 02/08/2024 Safemoon 02/09/2024 Safemoon 02/09/2024 Safemoon 02/09/2024 Safemoon 02/10/2024 Safemoon 02/11/2024 Safemoon 02/13/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review AWS settlement proposal  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), government representartives re: document subpoena issues Review draft second MOR, telecon L. Rooney re: same  Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon Les Borsai re: outstanding payments  Draft invoices for APA payments due and owing  Prepare for mediation including review of class claims and related analysis  Particpate in mediation with class claim representaives, Foley, Trustee  Totals Amounts for User Peter Hurwitz  2hr initial project research + 3 hours calls (E.Ostrow, T. Halkowski, M. Stevens, C. Guilmin) 2+2hr call. 2hr Patent reading, call w/Ostrow/Spraggs + Marketing call Rooney/Hurwitz/Breeze List of crypto VCs List of crypto VCs SafeMoon products teaser presentation proposal 1hr call + 2 hrs products teaser presentation final Rooney + D.Oliver/Mikhailenok Tech Call Amazon Server downsizing	0.40 0.70 0.80 0.30 0.40 0.40 0.50 2.80 2.60 52.20  5.50 4.00 1.50 1.00 3.00 1.00	\$384.00 \$672.00 \$768.00 \$288.00 \$384.00 \$480.00 \$2,688.00 \$2,496.00 \$49,811.00 \$3,575.00 \$2,600.00 \$975.00 \$975.00 \$650.00 \$650.00
09/05/2024 Safemoon 09/23/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 10/07/2024 Safemoon 10/08/2024 Safemoon 10/15/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 02/02/2024 Safemoon 02/05/2024 Safemoon 02/08/2024 Safemoon 02/08/2024 Safemoon 02/08/2024 Safemoon 02/09/2024 Safemoon 02/10/2024 Safemoon 02/11/2024 Safemoon 02/13/2024 Safemoon 02/13/2024 Safemoon 02/14/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review AWS settlement proposal  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), government representartives re: document subpoena issues Review draft second MOR, telecon L. Rooney re: same  Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon Les Borsai re: outstanding payments  Draft invoices for APA payments due and owing  Prepare for mediation including review of class claims and related analysis  Particpate in mediation with class claim representaives, Foley, Trustee  Totals Amounts for User Peter Hurwitz  2hr initial project research + 3 hours calls (E.Ostrow, T. Halkowski, M. Stevens, C. Guilmin) 2+2hr call. 2hr Patent reading, call w/Ostrow/Spraggs + Marketing call Rooney/Hurwitz/Breeze List of crypto VCs List of crypto VCs SafeMoon products teaser presentation proposal  1hr call + 2 hrs products teaser presentation final  Rooney + D.Oliver/Mikhailenok Tech Call Amazon Server downsizing List of memecoin projects + contact details	0.40 0.70 0.80 0.30 0.40 0.40 0.50 2.80 2.60 52.20  5.50 4.00 1.50 1.00 3.00 1.00 2.00	\$384.00 \$672.00 \$768.00 \$288.00 \$384.00 \$480.00 \$2,688.00 \$2,496.00 \$49,811.00 \$3,575.00 \$2,600.00 \$975.00 \$975.00 \$650.00 \$1,950.00 \$1,300.00
09/05/2024 Safemoon 09/23/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 10/07/2024 Safemoon 10/08/2024 Safemoon 10/15/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 02/02/2024 Safemoon 02/05/2024 Safemoon 02/08/2024 Safemoon 02/08/2024 Safemoon 02/09/2024 Safemoon 02/10/2024 Safemoon 02/12/2024 Safemoon 02/12/2024 Safemoon 02/13/2024 Safemoon 02/13/2024 Safemoon 02/14/2024 Safemoon 02/19/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review AWS settlement proposal  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), government representartives re: document subpoena issues Review draft second MOR, telecon L. Rooney re: same  Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon Les Borsai re: outstanding payments  Draft invoices for APA payments due and owing  Prepare for mediation including review of class claims and related analysis  Particpate in mediation with class claim representaives, Foley, Trustee  Totals Amounts for User Peter Hurwitz  2hr initial project research + 3 hours calls (E.Ostrow, T. Halkowski, M. Stevens, C. Guilmin) 2+2hr call. 2hr Patent reading, call w/Ostrow/Spraggs + Marketing call Rooney/Hurwitz/Breeze  List of crypto VCs  SafeMoon products teaser presentation proposal  1hr call + 2 hrs products teaser presentation final  Rooney + D.Oliver/Mikhailenok Tech Call Amazon Server downsizing  List of memecoin projects + contact details  Call With SquidGrow/Joe. Rooney/Hurwitz/Breeze	0.40 0.70 0.80 0.30 0.40 0.40 0.50 2.80 2.60 52.20  5.50 4.00 1.50 1.00 3.00 1.00 2.00 0.50	\$384.00 \$672.00 \$768.00 \$288.00 \$384.00 \$384.00 \$2,688.00 \$2,496.00 \$49,811.00 \$3,575.00 \$2,600.00 \$975.00 \$650.00 \$1,950.00 \$650.00 \$1,300.00 \$325.00
09/05/2024 Safemoon 09/23/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 10/07/2024 Safemoon 10/08/2024 Safemoon 10/15/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 02/02/2024 Safemoon 02/05/2024 Safemoon 02/08/2024 Safemoon 02/08/2024 Safemoon 02/09/2024 Safemoon 02/10/2024 Safemoon 02/12/2024 Safemoon 02/13/2024 Safemoon 02/13/2024 Safemoon 02/14/2024 Safemoon 02/19/2024 Safemoon 02/19/2024 Safemoon 02/19/2024 Safemoon 02/19/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review AWS settlement proposal  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), government representartives re: document subpoena issues Review draft second MOR, telecon L. Rooney re: same  Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon Les Borsai re: outstanding payments  Draft invoices for APA payments due and owing  Prepare for mediation including review of class claims and related analysis  Particpate in mediation with class claim representaives, Foley, Trustee  Totals Amounts for User Peter Hurwitz  2hr initial project research + 3 hours calls (E.Ostrow, T. Halkowski, M. Stevens, C. Guilmin) 2+2hr call. 2hr Patent reading, call w/Ostrow/Spraggs + Marketing call Rooney/Hurwitz/Breeze List of crypto VCs  SafeMoon products teaser presentation proposal  1hr call + 2 hrs products teaser presentation final  Rooney + D.Oliver/Mikhailenok Tech Call Amazon Server downsizing List of memecoin projects + contact details  Call With SquidGrow/Joe. Rooney/Hurwitz/Breeze  Varios direct consultation calls w/Rooney	0.40 0.70 0.80 0.30 0.40 0.40 0.50 2.80 2.60 52.20  5.50 4.00 1.50 1.00 3.00 1.00 2.00 0.50 1.00	\$384.00 \$672.00 \$768.00 \$288.00 \$384.00 \$384.00 \$480.00 \$2,688.00 \$2,496.00 \$49,811.00 \$3,575.00 \$975.00 \$975.00 \$650.00 \$1,950.00 \$1,300.00 \$325.00 \$650.00
09/05/2024 Safemoon 09/23/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 10/07/2024 Safemoon 10/08/2024 Safemoon 10/15/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 02/02/2024 Safemoon 02/05/2024 Safemoon 02/08/2024 Safemoon 02/08/2024 Safemoon 02/09/2024 Safemoon 02/10/2024 Safemoon 02/12/2024 Safemoon 02/12/2024 Safemoon 02/13/2024 Safemoon 02/14/2024 Safemoon 02/19/2024 Safemoon 02/19/2024 Safemoon 02/19/2024 Safemoon 02/19/2024 Safemoon 02/20/2024 Safemoon 02/20/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review AWS settlement proposal  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), government representartives re: document subpoena issues Review draft second MOR, telecon L. Rooney re: same  Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon Les Borsai re: outstanding payments  Draft invoices for APA payments due and owing  Prepare for mediation including review of class claims and related analysis  Particpate in mediation with class claim representaives, Foley, Trustee  Totals Amounts for User Peter Hurwitz  2hr initial project research + 3 hours calls (E.Ostrow, T. Halkowski, M. Stevens, C. Guilmin) 2+2hr call. 2hr Patent reading, call w/Ostrow/Spraggs + Marketing call Rooney/Hurwitz/Breeze List of crypto VCs  SafeMoon products teaser presentation proposal  1hr call + 2 hrs products teaser presentation final  Rooney + D.Oliver/Mikhailenok Tech Call Amazon Server downsizing List of memecoin projects + contact details  Call With SquidGrow/Joe. Rooney/Hurwitz/Breeze  Varios direct consultation calls w/Rooney  Rooney/Hurwitz/D.Oliver/Mikhailenok Tech Call Passing admin rights to the Trustee x 2 calls	0.40 0.70 0.80 0.30 0.40 0.40 0.50 2.80 2.60 52.20  5.50 4.00 1.50 1.00 3.00 1.00 2.00 0.50 1.00 2.00	\$384.00 \$672.00 \$768.00 \$288.00 \$384.00 \$384.00 \$480.00 \$2,688.00 \$2,496.00 \$49,811.00 \$3,575.00 \$975.00 \$975.00 \$650.00 \$1,950.00 \$1,300.00 \$325.00 \$650.00 \$1,300.00
09/05/2024 Safemoon 09/23/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 10/07/2024 Safemoon 10/08/2024 Safemoon 10/15/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 02/02/2024 Safemoon 02/05/2024 Safemoon 02/08/2024 Safemoon 02/08/2024 Safemoon 02/08/2024 Safemoon 02/10/2024 Safemoon 02/12/2024 Safemoon 02/12/2024 Safemoon 02/13/2024 Safemoon 02/14/2024 Safemoon 02/19/2024 Safemoon 02/19/2024 Safemoon 02/20/2024 Safemoon 02/20/2024 Safemoon 02/20/2024 Safemoon 02/22/2024 Safemoon 02/22/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review AWS settlement proposal  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), government representartives re: document subpoena issues Review draft second MOR, telecon L. Rooney re: same  Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon Les Borsai re: outstanding payments  Draft invoices for APA payments due and owing  Prepare for mediation including review of class claims and related analysis  Particpate in mediation with class claim representaives, Foley, Trustee  Totals Amounts for User Peter Hurwitz  2hr initial project research + 3 hours calls (E.Ostrow, T. Halkowski, M. Stevens, C. Guilmin) 2+2hr call. 2hr Patent reading, call w/Ostrow/Spraggs + Marketing call Rooney/Hurwitz/Breeze List of crypto VCs  SafeMoon products teaser presentation proposal 1hr call + 2 hrs products teaser presentation final  Rooney + D.Oliver/Mikhailenok Tech Call Amazon Server downsizing List of memecoin projects + contact details  Call With SquidGrow/Joe. Rooney/Hurwitz/Breeze  Varios direct consultation calls w/Rooney  Rooney/Hurwitz/D.Oliver/Mikhailenok Tech Call Passing admin rights to the Trustee x 2 calls  Rooney/D.Oliver/Ostrow/Mikhailenok Passing admin rights to the Trustee	0.40 0.70 0.80 0.30 0.40 0.40 0.50 2.80 2.60 52.20  5.50 4.00 1.50 1.00 3.00 1.00 2.00 0.50 1.00 2.00 2.00	\$384.00 \$672.00 \$768.00 \$288.00 \$384.00 \$384.00 \$480.00 \$2,688.00 \$2,496.00 \$49,811.00 \$3,575.00 \$975.00 \$650.00 \$1,950.00 \$650.00 \$1,300.00 \$325.00 \$650.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00
09/05/2024 Safemoon 09/23/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 10/07/2024 Safemoon 10/08/2024 Safemoon 10/15/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 02/02/2024 Safemoon 02/05/2024 Safemoon 02/08/2024 Safemoon 02/08/2024 Safemoon 02/10/2024 Safemoon 02/12/2024 Safemoon 02/12/2024 Safemoon 02/12/2024 Safemoon 02/12/2024 Safemoon 02/12/2024 Safemoon 02/19/2024 Safemoon 02/19/2024 Safemoon 02/20/2024 Safemoon 02/20/2024 Safemoon 02/20/2024 Safemoon 02/22/2024 Safemoon 02/27/2024 Safemoon 02/27/2024 Safemoon 02/27/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review AWS settlement proposal  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), government representartives re: document subpoena issues Review draft second MOR, telecon L. Rooney re: same  Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon Les Borsai re: outstanding payments  Draft invoices for APA payments due and owing  Prepare for mediation including review of class claims and related analysis  Particpate in mediation with class claim representaives, Foley, Trustee  Totals Amounts for User Peter Hurwitz  2hr initial project research +3 hours calls (E.Ostrow, T. Halkowski, M. Stevens, C. Guilmin)  2+2hr call. 2hr Patent reading, call w/Ostrow/Spraggs + Marketing call Rooney/Hurwitz/Breeze  List of crypto VCs  SafeMoon products teaser presentation proposal  1hr call + 2 hrs products teaser presentation final  Rooney + D.Oliver/Mikhailenok Tech Call Amazon Server downsizing  List of memecoin projects + contact details  Call With SquidGrow/Joe. Rooney/Hurwitz/Breeze  Varios direct consultation calls w/Rooney  Rooney/Hurwitz/D.Oliver/Mikhailenok Tech Call Passing admin rights to the Trustee x 2 calls  Rooney/D.Oliver/Ostrow/Mikhailenok Passing admin rights to the Trustee  Rooney/Saguirre/Mikhailenok. Gsuite access, AWS, Downsizing, Okta delete  List of crypto VCs / Call with L.Rooney/Google 2fa reset/AWS login+analysis	0.40 0.70 0.80 0.30 0.40 0.40 0.50 2.80 2.60 52.20  5.50 4.00 1.50 1.00 3.00 1.00 2.00 0.50 1.00 2.00 0.50	\$384.00 \$672.00 \$768.00 \$288.00 \$384.00 \$384.00 \$480.00 \$2,688.00 \$2,496.00 \$49,811.00 \$3,575.00 \$975.00 \$650.00 \$1,950.00 \$650.00 \$1,300.00 \$325.00 \$1,300.00 \$325.00 \$325.00 \$325.00
09/05/2024 Safemoon 09/23/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 10/07/2024 Safemoon 10/08/2024 Safemoon 10/15/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 02/02/2024 Safemoon 02/05/2024 Safemoon 02/08/2024 Safemoon 02/08/2024 Safemoon 02/10/2024 Safemoon 02/12/2024 Safemoon 02/20/2024 Safemoon 02/20/2024 Safemoon 02/22/2024 Safemoon 02/27/2024 Safemoon 02/28/2024 Safemoon 02/28/2024 Safemoon 02/28/2024 Safemoon 02/29/2024 Safemoon 02/29/2024 Safemoon 02/29/2024 Safemoon 02/29/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review AWS settlement proposal  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), government representartives re: document subpoena issues Review draft second MOR, telecon L. Rooney re: same  Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon Les Borsai re: outstanding payments  Draft invoices for APA payments due and owing  Prepare for mediation including review of class claims and related analysis  Particpate in mediation with class claim representaives, Foley, Trustee  Totals Amounts for User Peter Hurwitz  2hr initial project research +3 hours calls (E.Ostrow, T. Halkowski, M. Stevens, C. Guilmin)  2+2hr call. 2hr Patent reading, call w/Ostrow/Spraggs + Marketing call Rooney/Hurwitz/Breeze  List of crypto VCs  SafeMoon products teaser presentation proposal  1hr call + 2 hrs products teaser presentation final  Rooney + D.Oliver/Mikhailenok Tech Call Amazon Server downsizing  List of memecoin projects + contact details  Call With SquidGrow/Joe. Rooney/Hurwitz/Breeze  Varios direct consultation calls w/Rooney  Rooney/Hurwitz/D.Oliver/Mikhailenok Tech Call Passing admin rights to the Trustee x 2 calls  Rooney/D.Oliver/Ostrow/Mikhailenok Passing admin rights to the Trustee  Rooney/Saguirre/Mikhailenok. Gsuite access, AWS, Downsizing, Okta delete  List of crypto VCs / Call with L.Rooney/Google 2 fa reset/AWS login+analysis  Gsuite admin rights reassignment/tech call for AWS bill reduction	0.40 0.70 0.80 0.30 0.40 0.40 0.50 2.80 2.60 52.20  5.50 4.00 1.50 1.00 3.00 1.00 2.00 0.50 1.00 2.00 0.50 5.00 2.00	\$384.00 \$672.00 \$768.00 \$288.00 \$384.00 \$384.00 \$480.00 \$2,688.00 \$2,496.00 \$49,811.00 \$3,575.00 \$975.00 \$650.00 \$1,300.00 \$325.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00 \$325.00 \$325.00 \$3,250.00 \$3,250.00 \$1,300.00
09/05/2024 Safemoon 09/23/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 10/07/2024 Safemoon 10/08/2024 Safemoon 10/15/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 02/02/2024 Safemoon 02/05/2024 Safemoon 02/08/2024 Safemoon 02/08/2024 Safemoon 02/10/2024 Safemoon 02/12/2024 Safemoon 02/22/2024 Safemoon 02/22/2024 Safemoon 02/22/2024 Safemoon 02/28/2024 Safemoon 02/28/2024 Safemoon 02/29/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review AWS settlement proposal  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), government representartives re: document subpoena issues Review draft second MOR, telecon L. Rooney re: same  Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon Les Borsai re: outstanding payments  Draft invoices for APA payments due and owing  Prepare for mediation including review of class claims and related analysis  Particpate in mediation with class claim representaives, Foley, Trustee  Totals Amounts for User Peter Hurwitz  2hr initial project research + 3 hours calls (E.Ostrow, T. Halkowski, M. Stevens, C. Guilmin) 2+2hr call. 2hr Patent reading, call w/Ostrow/Spraggs + Marketing call Rooney/Hurwitz/Breeze List of crypto VCs List of crypto VCs SafeMoon products teaser presentation proposal 1hr call + 2 hrs products teaser presentation final  Rooney + D.Oliver/Mikhailenok Tech Call Amazon Server downsizing List of memecoin projects + contact details  Call With SquidGrow/Joe. Rooney/Hurwitz/Breeze  Varios direct consultation calls w/Rooney  Rooney/Hurwitz/D.Oliver/Mikhailenok Tech Call Passing admin rights to the Trustee x 2 calls  Rooney/D.Oliver/Ostrow/Mikhailenok Passing admin rights to the Trustee  Rooney/Saguirre/Mikhailenok. Gsuite access, AWS, Downsizing, Okta delete List of crypto VCs / Call with L.Rooney/Google 2fa reset/AWS login+analysis  Gsuite admin rights reassignment/tech call for AWS bill reduction Call with dev team. Identifying AWS services to downgrade	0.40 0.70 0.80 0.30 0.40 0.40 0.50 2.80 2.60 52.20  5.50 4.00 1.50 1.00 3.00 1.00 2.00 0.50 1.00 2.00 0.50 5.00 2.00 2.00 2.00	\$384.00 \$672.00 \$768.00 \$288.00 \$384.00 \$384.00 \$480.00 \$2,688.00 \$2,496.00 \$49,811.00 \$3,575.00 \$975.00 \$650.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00 \$325.00 \$325.00 \$325.00 \$3,250.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00
09/05/2024 Safemoon 09/23/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 10/07/2024 Safemoon 10/08/2024 Safemoon 10/15/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 02/02/2024 Safemoon 02/05/2024 Safemoon 02/08/2024 Safemoon 02/08/2024 Safemoon 02/10/2024 Safemoon 02/12/2024 Safemoon 02/22/2024 Safemoon 02/22/2024 Safemoon 02/22/2024 Safemoon 02/28/2024 Safemoon 02/28/2024 Safemoon 02/29/2024 Safemoon 02/29/2024 Safemoon 03/01/2024 Safemoon 03/01/2024 Safemoon 03/02/2024 Safemoon 03/02/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review AWS settlement proposal  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), government representartives re: document subpoena issues Review draft second MOR, telecon L. Rooney re: same  Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon Les Borsai re: outstanding payments  Draft invoices for APA payments due and owing  Prepare for mediation including review of class claims and related analysis  Particpate in mediation with class claim representaives, Foley, Trustee  Totals Amounts for User Peter Hurwitz  2hr initial project research +3 hours calls (E.Ostrow, T. Halkowski, M. Stevens, C. Guilmin) 2+2hr call. 2hr Patent reading, call w/Ostrow/Spraggs + Marketing call Rooney/Hurwitz/Breeze List of crypto VCs  SafeMoon products teaser presentation proposal  1hr call + 2 hrs products teaser presentation final  Rooney + D.Oliver/Mikhailenok Tech Call Amazon Server downsizing List of memecoin projects + contact details  Call With SquidGrow/Joe. Rooney/Hurwitz/Breeze  Varios direct consultation calls w/Rooney  Rooney/Hurwitz/D.Oliver/Mikhailenok Tech Call Passing admin rights to the Trustee x 2 calls  Rooney/D.Oliver/Ostrow/Mikhailenok Passing admin rights to the Trustee  Rooney/Saguirre/Mikhailenok. Gsuite access, AWS, Downsizing, Okta delete List of crypto VCs / Call with L.Rooney/Google 2 fa reset/AWS login+analysis  Gsuite admin rights reassignment/tech call for AWS bill reduction  Call with dev team. Identifying AWS services to downgrade  Gsuite archivation/AWS report formation, Analyzing patents, Call Rooney/Ostrow/Johnson	0.40 0.70 0.80 0.30 0.40 0.40 0.50 2.80 2.60 52.20  5.50 4.00 1.50 1.00 3.00 1.00 2.00 0.50 1.00 2.00 0.50 5.00 2.00 2.00 3.00 2.00 3.00	\$384.00 \$672.00 \$768.00 \$288.00 \$384.00 \$384.00 \$480.00 \$2,688.00 \$2,496.00 \$49,811.00 \$3,575.00 \$975.00 \$650.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00 \$325.00 \$325.00 \$3,250.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00
09/05/2024 Safemoon 09/23/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 10/07/2024 Safemoon 10/08/2024 Safemoon 10/15/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 02/02/2024 Safemoon 02/05/2024 Safemoon 02/08/2024 Safemoon 02/08/2024 Safemoon 02/10/2024 Safemoon 02/10/2024 Safemoon 02/12/2024 Safemoon 02/12/2024 Safemoon 02/12/2024 Safemoon 02/12/2024 Safemoon 02/12/2024 Safemoon 02/12/2024 Safemoon 02/20/2024 Safemoon 02/22/2024 Safemoon 02/22/2024 Safemoon 02/28/2024 Safemoon 02/28/2024 Safemoon 02/29/2024 Safemoon 03/01/2024 Safemoon 03/01/2024 Safemoon 03/01/2024 Safemoon 03/03/2024 Safemoon 03/05/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review AWS settlement proposal  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), government representartives re: document subpoena issues Review draft second MOR, telecon L. Rooney re: same  Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon Les Borsai re: outstanding payments  Draft invoices for APA payments due and owing  Prepare for mediation including review of class claims and related analysis  Participate in mediation with class claim representaives, Foley, Trustee  Totals Amounts for User Peter Hurwitz  2hr initial project research + 3 hours calls (E.Ostrow, T. Halkowski, M. Stevens, C. Guilmin)  2+2hr call. 2hr Patent reading, call w/Ostrow/Spraggs + Marketing call Rooney/Hurwitz/Breeze  List of crypto VCs  List of crypto VCs  SafeMoon products teaser presentation proposal  1hr call + 2 hrs products teaser presentation final  Rooney + D.Oliver/Mikhailenok Tech Call Amazon Server downsizing  List of memecoin projects + contact details  Call With SquidGrow/Joe. Rooney/Hurwitz/Breeze  Varios direct consultation calls w/Rooney  Rooney/Hurwitz/D.Oliver/Mikhailenok Tech Call Passing admin rights to the Trustee x 2 calls  Rooney/D.Oliver/Ostrow/Mikhailenok Passing admin rights to the Trustee  Rooney/Saguirre/Mikhailenok. Gsuite access, AWS, Downsizing, Okta delete  List of crypto VCs / Call with L. Rooney/Google 2 fa reset/AWS login+analysis  Gsuite admin rights reassignment/tech call for AWS bill reduction  Call with dev team. Identifying AWS services to downgrade  Gsuite archivation/AWS report formation, Analyzing patents, Call Rooney/Ostrow/Johnson  Tech task for SafeMoon Dev (AWS), List of IP buyers	0.40 0.70 0.80 0.30 0.40 0.40 0.50 2.80 2.60 52.20  5.50 4.00 1.50 1.00 3.00 1.00 2.00 0.50 1.00 2.00 0.50 5.00 2.00 2.00 3.00 2.00 3.00 3.00 3.00 3	\$384.00 \$672.00 \$768.00 \$288.00 \$384.00 \$384.00 \$49.80 \$2,688.00 \$2,496.00 \$49,811.00 \$3,575.00 \$975.00 \$650.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00 \$325.00 \$3,250.00 \$1,300.00
09/05/2024 Safemoon 09/23/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 10/07/2024 Safemoon 10/08/2024 Safemoon 10/15/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 02/02/2024 Safemoon 02/05/2024 Safemoon 02/08/2024 Safemoon 02/08/2024 Safemoon 02/10/2024 Safemoon 02/12/2024 Safemoon 02/22/2024 Safemoon 02/22/2024 Safemoon 02/22/2024 Safemoon 02/28/2024 Safemoon 02/28/2024 Safemoon 02/29/2024 Safemoon 02/29/2024 Safemoon 03/01/2024 Safemoon 03/01/2024 Safemoon 03/02/2024 Safemoon 03/02/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review AWS settlement proposal  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), government representartives re: document subpoena issues Review draft second MOR, telecon L. Rooney re: same  Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon Les Borsai re: outstanding payments  Draft invoices for APA payments due and owing  Prepare for mediation including review of class claims and related analysis  Particpate in mediation with class claim representaives, Foley, Trustee  Totals Amounts for User Peter Hurwitz  2hr initial project research +3 hours calls (E.Ostrow, T. Halkowski, M. Stevens, C. Guilmin) 2+2hr call. 2hr Patent reading, call w/Ostrow/Spraggs + Marketing call Rooney/Hurwitz/Breeze List of crypto VCs  SafeMoon products teaser presentation proposal  1hr call + 2 hrs products teaser presentation final  Rooney + D.Oliver/Mikhailenok Tech Call Amazon Server downsizing List of memecoin projects + contact details  Call With SquidGrow/Joe. Rooney/Hurwitz/Breeze  Varios direct consultation calls w/Rooney  Rooney/Hurwitz/D.Oliver/Mikhailenok Tech Call Passing admin rights to the Trustee x 2 calls  Rooney/D.Oliver/Ostrow/Mikhailenok Passing admin rights to the Trustee  Rooney/Saguirre/Mikhailenok. Gsuite access, AWS, Downsizing, Okta delete List of crypto VCs / Call with L.Rooney/Google 2 fa reset/AWS login+analysis  Gsuite admin rights reassignment/tech call for AWS bill reduction  Call with dev team. Identifying AWS services to downgrade  Gsuite archivation/AWS report formation, Analyzing patents, Call Rooney/Ostrow/Johnson	0.40 0.70 0.80 0.30 0.40 0.40 0.50 2.80 2.60 52.20  5.50 4.00 1.50 1.00 3.00 1.00 2.00 0.50 1.00 2.00 0.50 5.00 2.00 2.00 3.00 2.00 3.00	\$384.00 \$672.00 \$768.00 \$288.00 \$384.00 \$384.00 \$480.00 \$2,688.00 \$2,496.00 \$49,811.00 \$3,575.00 \$975.00 \$650.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00 \$325.00 \$325.00 \$3,250.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00
09/05/2024 Safemoon 09/23/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 10/07/2024 Safemoon 10/08/2024 Safemoon 10/15/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 02/02/2024 Safemoon 02/05/2024 Safemoon 02/08/2024 Safemoon 02/08/2024 Safemoon 02/10/2024 Safemoon 02/10/2024 Safemoon 02/12/2024 Safemoon 02/12/2024 Safemoon 02/12/2024 Safemoon 02/12/2024 Safemoon 02/12/2024 Safemoon 02/12/2024 Safemoon 02/20/2024 Safemoon 02/22/2024 Safemoon 02/22/2024 Safemoon 02/28/2024 Safemoon 02/28/2024 Safemoon 02/29/2024 Safemoon 03/01/2024 Safemoon 03/01/2024 Safemoon 03/01/2024 Safemoon 03/03/2024 Safemoon 03/05/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review AWS settlement proposal  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), government representartives re: document subpoena issues Review draft second MOR, telecon L. Rooney re: same  Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon Les Borsai re: outstanding payments  Draft invoices for APA payments due and owing  Prepare for mediation including review of class claims and related analysis  Participate in mediation with class claim representaives, Foley, Trustee  Totals Amounts for User Peter Hurwitz  2hr initial project research + 3 hours calls (E.Ostrow, T. Halkowski, M. Stevens, C. Guilmin)  2+2hr call. 2hr Patent reading, call w/Ostrow/Spraggs + Marketing call Rooney/Hurwitz/Breeze  List of crypto VCs  List of crypto VCs  SafeMoon products teaser presentation proposal  1hr call + 2 hrs products teaser presentation final  Rooney + D.Oliver/Mikhailenok Tech Call Amazon Server downsizing  List of memecoin projects + contact details  Call With SquidGrow/Joe. Rooney/Hurwitz/Breeze  Varios direct consultation calls w/Rooney  Rooney/Hurwitz/D.Oliver/Mikhailenok Tech Call Passing admin rights to the Trustee x 2 calls  Rooney/D.Oliver/Ostrow/Mikhailenok Passing admin rights to the Trustee  Rooney/Saguirre/Mikhailenok. Gsuite access, AWS, Downsizing, Okta delete  List of crypto VCs / Call with L. Rooney/Google 2 fa reset/AWS login+analysis  Gsuite admin rights reassignment/tech call for AWS bill reduction  Call with dev team. Identifying AWS services to downgrade  Gsuite archivation/AWS report formation, Analyzing patents, Call Rooney/Ostrow/Johnson  Tech task for SafeMoon Dev (AWS), List of IP buyers	0.40 0.70 0.80 0.30 0.40 0.40 0.50 2.80 2.60 52.20  5.50 4.00 1.50 1.00 3.00 1.00 2.00 0.50 1.00 2.00 0.50 5.00 2.00 2.00 3.00 2.00 3.00 3.00 3.00 3	\$384.00 \$672.00 \$768.00 \$288.00 \$384.00 \$384.00 \$49.80 \$2,688.00 \$2,496.00 \$49,811.00 \$3,575.00 \$975.00 \$650.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00 \$325.00 \$3,250.00 \$1,300.00
09/05/2024 Safemoon 09/23/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 10/07/2024 Safemoon 10/08/2024 Safemoon 10/15/2024 Safemoon 10/15/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 02/02/2024 Safemoon 02/05/2024 Safemoon 02/08/2024 Safemoon 02/09/2024 Safemoon 02/10/2024 Safemoon 02/12/2024 Safemoon 02/13/2024 Safemoon 02/14/2024 Safemoon 02/14/2024 Safemoon 02/21/2024 Safemoon 02/20/2024 Safemoon 02/20/2024 Safemoon 02/20/2024 Safemoon 02/27/2024 Safemoon 02/28/2024 Safemoon 02/29/2024 Safemoon 03/01/2024 Safemoon 03/01/2024 Safemoon 03/05/2024 Safemoon 03/05/2024 Safemoon 03/05/2024 Safemoon 03/05/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review AWS settlement proposal  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), government representartives re: document subpoena issues Review draft second MOR, telecon L. Rooney re: same  Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon Les Borsai re: outstanding payments  Draft invoices for APA payments due and owing  Prepare for mediation including review of class claims and related analysis  Particpate in mediation with class claim representaives, Foley, Trustee  Totals Amounts for User Peter Hurwitz  2hr initial project research + 3 hours calls (E.Ostrow, T. Halkowski, M. Stevens, C. Guilmin)  2+2hr call. 2hr Patent reading, call w/Ostrow/Spraggs + Marketing call Rooney/Hurwitz/Breeze  List of crypto VCs  List of crypto VCs  SafeMoon products teaser presentation proposal  1hr call + 2 hrs products teaser presentation final  Rooney + D.Oliver/Mikhailenok Tech Call Amazon Server downsizing  List of memecoin projects + contact details  Call With SquidGrow/Joe. Rooney/Hurwitz/Breeze  Varios direct consultation calls w/Rooney  Rooney/Hurwitz/D.Oliver/Mikhailenok Tech Call Passing admin rights to the Trustee x 2 calls  Rooney/D.Oliver/Ostrow/Mikhailenok Passing admin rights to the Trustee  Rooney/Saguirre/Mikhailenok. Gsuite access, AWS, Downsizing, Okta delete  List of crypto VCs / Call with L.Rooney/Google 2fa reset/AWS login+analysis  Gsuite admin rights reassignment/tech call for AWS bill reduction  Call with dev team. Identifying AWS services to downgrade  Gsuite archivation/AWS report formation, Analyzing patents, Call Rooney/Ostrow/Johnson  Tech task for SafeMoon Dev (AWS), List of IP buyers  Call with Chris about AWS, AWS Billing	0.40 0.70 0.80 0.30 0.40 0.40 0.50 2.80 2.60 52.20  5.50 4.00 1.50 1.00 2.00 0.50 1.00 2.00 0.50 5.00 2.00 2.00 3.00 3.00 3.00 1.50 3.00 3.00 3.00 3.00 3.00 3.00 3.00 3	\$384.00 \$672.00 \$768.00 \$288.00 \$384.00 \$384.00 \$480.00 \$2,688.00 \$2,496.00 \$49,811.00 \$3,575.00 \$975.00 \$975.00 \$650.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,300.00 \$325.00 \$3,250.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,950.00 \$1,950.00 \$1,950.00
09/05/2024 Safemoon 09/23/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 09/24/2024 Safemoon 10/07/2024 Safemoon 10/08/2024 Safemoon 10/15/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 10/16/2024 Safemoon 02/02/2024 Safemoon 02/05/2024 Safemoon 02/08/2024 Safemoon 02/09/2024 Safemoon 02/10/2024 Safemoon 02/12/2024 Safemoon 02/12/2024 Safemoon 02/14/2024 Safemoon 02/14/2024 Safemoon 02/21/2024 Safemoon 02/22/2024 Safemoon 02/22/2024 Safemoon 02/27/2024 Safemoon 02/28/2024 Safemoon 02/28/2024 Safemoon 03/01/2024 Safemoon 03/01/2024 Safemoon 03/01/2024 Safemoon 03/01/2024 Safemoon 03/01/2024 Safemoon 03/05/2024 Safemoon 03/05/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review AWS settlement proposal  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), government representartives re: document subpoena issues Review draft second MOR, telecon L. Rooney re: same  Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon L. Rooney re: review of MOR  Telecon Les Borsai re: outstanding payments  Draft invoices for APA payments due and owing  Prepare for mediation including review of class claims and related analysis  Particpate in mediation with class claim representaives, Foley, Trustee  Totals Amounts for User Peter Hurwitz  2hr initial project research + 3 hours calls (E.Ostrow, T. Halkowski, M. Stevens, C. Guilmin)  2+2hr call. 2hr Patent reading, call w/Ostrow/Spraggs + Marketing call Rooney/Hurwitz/Breeze  List of crypto VCs  List of crypto VCs  SafeMoon products teaser presentation proposal  1hr call + 2 hrs products teaser presentation final  Rooney + D.Oliver/Mikhailenok Tech Call Amazon Server downsizing  List of memecoin projects + contact details  Call With SquidGrow/Joe. Rooney/Hurwitz/Breeze  Varios direct consultation calls w/Rooney  Rooney/Hurwitz/D.Oliver/Mikhailenok Passing admin rights to the Trustee x 2 calls  Rooney/D.Oliver/Ostrow/Mikhailenok Passing admin rights to the Trustee  Rooney/Saguirre/Mikhailenok. Gsuite access, AWS, Downsizing, Okta delete  List of crypto VCs / Call with L. Rooney/Google 2fa reset/AWS login+analysis  Gsuite admin rights reassignment/tech call for AWS bill reduction  Call with dev team. Identifying AWS services to downgrade  Gsuite archivation/AWS report formation, Analyzing patents, Call Rooney/Ostrow/Johnson  Tech task for SafeMoon Dev (AWS), List of IP buyers  Call with Chris about AWS, AWS Billing	0.40 0.70 0.80 0.30 0.40 0.40 0.50 2.80 2.60 52.20  5.50 4.00 1.50 1.00 2.00 0.50 1.00 2.00 0.50 5.00 2.00 2.00 2.00 3.00 3.00 3.00 3.00 3	\$384.00 \$672.00 \$768.00 \$288.00 \$384.00 \$384.00 \$49.600 \$2,688.00 \$2,496.00 \$49,811.00 \$3,575.00 \$975.00 \$650.00 \$1,950.00 \$650.00 \$1,300.00 \$325.00 \$3,250.00 \$1,300.00 \$3,250.00 \$1,300.00 \$3,250.00 \$1,300.00 \$1,950.00 \$1,950.00

## Case 23-25749 Doc 242 Filed 12/06/24 Entered 12/06/24 10:36:02 Desc Main Document Page 27 of 34

03/12/2024 Safemoon				
04/25/2024 Cafamaan	Chapter 7 Trustee	Server security patents summary	2.00	\$1,300.00
04/25/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	AWS review	2.00	\$1,300.00
04/28/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Smart contract writeup editing	1.00	\$650.00
04/09/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Call w/Lee on pricing the crypto assets	0.50	\$325.00
04/16/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Call with Christophe, Github/Socials access passwords and emails recovery	2.00	\$1,300.00
04/19/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Safemoon domain lookup and access	1.00	\$650.00
04/22/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Software transfer calls, safemoon.com transfer instructions, call with buyers	3.50	\$2,275.00
04/23/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Domain transfer, call w/buyers	2.00	\$1,300.00
04/24/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Tech call with Joshua from WDA, update AWS company info on all servers, call w/ WDA + SFEMOON do	3.50	\$2,275.00
04/26/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Call w/Truong, Huy about AWS	0.50	\$325.00
04/29/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Recovering access to socials through 1Password	1.00	\$650.00
04/30/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Start of software transfer. Call with tech team Lee, Michael, Chris, Todd	1.00	\$650.00
05/01/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Random support on transfer process	0.50	\$325.00
05/02/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Restoring safemoon.ltd Gmail acocunt after lapsed payment for the domain	1.50	\$975.00
05/03/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	AWS safemoon.com renewal/transfer + Call w/Peter/Lee/Joshua	2.50	\$1,625.00
05/04/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	safemoon.com update at AWS with Joshua's (Wave) card	1.00	\$650.00
05/05/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	helping with e-mail/okta access	1.00	\$650.00
06/06/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Figma recovery with John's gemail	1.00	\$650.00
07/01/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	G-Suite Backup	2.00	\$1,300.00
07/09/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	G-Suite Backup test	1.00	\$650.00
07/11/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	G-Suite backed up, tested, accounts deleted	1.00	\$650.00
07/23/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Set up to download backed up accounts from Google Cloud	2.00	\$1,300.00
08/01/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Amazon billing report	1.00	\$650.00
08/05/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Gsuite billing report  Tech call about verification of SAF holdings	1.00	\$650.00
08/14/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Ç	1.00	\$650.00
		Totals Amounts for User Peter Mikhailenok  Totals Amounts for Activity Type Business Analysis	87.50 297.40	\$56,875.00
Case Administration		Totals Amounts for Activity Type Business Analysis	297.40	\$219,069.00
Lee Rooney				
01/02/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review of status report with telecon with E. Ostrow	0.40	\$280.00
01/03/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with A. Woodle, and Gusto re: Debtor's payroll service provider	2.30	\$1,610.00
01/08/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review of compliance bow, customer service records	0.30	\$210.00
01/08/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review of Bitmart files	0.30	\$210.00
01/08/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	REview of 2022 Legal Files	2.00	\$1,400.00
01/26/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Payroll calculations and submission	0.80	\$560.00
01/26/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Tax form preparations	2.40	\$1,680.00
02/07/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Verification of tax form submission with telecon with P. Hurwitz, and A. Kimm	0.70	\$490.00
02/14/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Tax-related emails	0.40	\$280.00
02/27/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with P. Mikhailenok re: admin status for applications	0.80	\$560.00
02/28/2024 Safemoon 04/03/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with P. Mikhailenok and J. Isaguirre Okta telecons	0.50	40=0.00
		Onta terecons		
	·	Totals Amounts for User Lee Rooney	0.60 <b>11.50</b>	\$420.00
Matthew Dundon	· 	Totals Amounts for User Lee Rooney	0.60	\$350.00 \$420.00 <b>\$8,050.00</b>
Matthew Dundon 04/03/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Totals Amounts for User Lee Rooney  Escrow account discussion.	0.60	\$420.00
		Escrow account discussion. Escrow account drafting.	0.60 <b>11.50</b> 0.70 0.50	\$420.00 <b>\$8,050.00</b> \$623.00 \$445.00
	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Escrow account discussion. Escrow account drafting. Totals Amounts for User Matthew Dundon	0.60 11.50 0.70 0.50 1.20	\$420.00 \$8,050.00 \$623.00 \$445.00 \$1,068.00
04/03/2024 Safemoon 04/04/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Escrow account discussion. Escrow account drafting.	0.60 <b>11.50</b> 0.70 0.50	\$420.00 <b>\$8,050.00</b>
04/03/2024 Safemoon 04/04/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Escrow account discussion. Escrow account drafting. Totals Amounts for User Matthew Dundon	0.60 11.50 0.70 0.50 1.20	\$420.00 \$8,050.00 \$623.00 \$445.00 \$1,068.00
04/03/2024 Safemoon 04/04/2024 Safemoon Claims Analysis	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Escrow account discussion. Escrow account drafting. Totals Amounts for User Matthew Dundon otals Amounts for Activity Type Case Administration	0.60 11.50 0.70 0.50 1.20 12.70	\$420.00 \$8,050.00 \$623.00 \$445.00 \$1,068.00 \$9,118.00
04/03/2024 Safemoon 04/04/2024 Safemoon Claims Analysis .ee Rooney 03/20/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee T	Escrow account discussion. Escrow account drafting. Totals Amounts for User Matthew Dundon otals Amounts for Activity Type Case Administration  Review of founder communications, statements re: status of the tokens	0.60 11.50 0.70 0.50 1.20 12.70	\$420.00 \$8,050.00 \$623.00 \$445.00 \$1,068.00 \$9,118.00
04/03/2024 Safemoon 04/04/2024 Safemoon Claims Analysis Lee Rooney 03/20/2024 Safemoon 07/23/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee  T  Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Escrow account discussion. Escrow account drafting. Totals Amounts for User Matthew Dundon otals Amounts for Activity Type Case Administration  Review of founder communications, statements re: status of the tokens Claims review	0.60 11.50  0.70 0.50 1.20 12.70	\$420.00 \$8,050.00 \$623.00 \$445.00 \$1,068.00 \$9,118.00 \$980.00 \$510.00
04/03/2024 Safemoon 04/04/2024 Safemoon Claims Analysis Lee Rooney 03/20/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee T	Escrow account discussion. Escrow account drafting. Totals Amounts for User Matthew Dundon otals Amounts for Activity Type Case Administration  Review of founder communications, statements re: status of the tokens	0.60 11.50 0.70 0.50 1.20 12.70	\$420.00 \$8,050.00 \$623.00 \$445.00 \$1,068.00 \$9,118.00 \$980.00 \$510.00 \$850.00
04/03/2024 Safemoon 04/04/2024 Safemoon Claims Analysis Lee Rooney 03/20/2024 Safemoon 07/23/2024 Safemoon 08/13/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee  T  Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Escrow account discussion. Escrow account drafting. Totals Amounts for User Matthew Dundon otals Amounts for Activity Type Case Administration  Review of founder communications, statements re: status of the tokens Claims review Telecon with E. Ostrow, G. Goodman, and P. Hurwitz re: claims, valuation	0.60 11.50  0.70 0.50 1.20 12.70  1.40 0.60 1.00	\$420.00 \$8,050.00 \$623.00 \$445.00 \$1,068.00 \$9,118.00 \$980.00 \$510.00 \$850.00 \$680.00
04/03/2024 Safemoon 04/04/2024 Safemoon Claims Analysis Lee Rooney 03/20/2024 Safemoon 07/23/2024 Safemoon 08/13/2024 Safemoon 09/04/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee  T  Chapter 7 Trustee	Escrow account discussion. Escrow account drafting. Totals Amounts for User Matthew Dundon otals Amounts for Activity Type Case Administration  Review of founder communications, statements re: status of the tokens Claims review Telecon with E. Ostrow, G. Goodman, and P. Hurwitz re: claims, valuation Telecon with E. Ostrow, G. goodman, and P. Hurwitz re: claims	0.60 11.50  0.70 0.50 1.20 12.70  1.40 0.60 1.00 0.80	\$420.00 \$8,050.00 \$623.00 \$445.00 \$1,068.00 \$9,118.00 \$510.00 \$850.00 \$680.00 \$1,190.00
04/03/2024 Safemoon 04/04/2024 Safemoon Claims Analysis Lee Rooney 03/20/2024 Safemoon 07/23/2024 Safemoon 08/13/2024 Safemoon 09/04/2024 Safemoon 10/01/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee  T  Chapter 7 Trustee	Escrow account discussion. Escrow account drafting. Totals Amounts for User Matthew Dundon otals Amounts for Activity Type Case Administration  Review of founder communications, statements re: status of the tokens Claims review Telecon with E. Ostrow, G. Goodman, and P. Hurwitz re: claims, valuation Telecon with E. Ostrow, G. goodman, and P. Hurwitz re: claims Review of claims to prepare claims report	0.60 11.50  0.70 0.50 1.20 12.70  1.40 0.60 1.00 0.80 1.40	\$420.00 \$8,050.00 \$445.00 \$1,068.00 \$9,118.00 \$510.00 \$850.00 \$680.00 \$1,190.00 \$1,275.00
04/03/2024 Safemoon 04/04/2024 Safemoon 04/04/2024 Safemoon Claims Analysis Gee Rooney 03/20/2024 Safemoon 07/23/2024 Safemoon 08/13/2024 Safemoon 09/04/2024 Safemoon 10/01/2024 Safemoon 10/18/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee  T  Chapter 7 Trustee	Escrow account discussion. Escrow account drafting. Totals Amounts for User Matthew Dundon otals Amounts for Activity Type Case Administration  Review of founder communications, statements re: status of the tokens Claims review Telecon with E. Ostrow, G. Goodman, and P. Hurwitz re: claims, valuation Telecon with E. Ostrow, G. goodman, and P. Hurwitz re: claims Review of claims to prepare claims report Telecon with C. Guilmin re: token prices and valuation of claims	0.60 11.50  0.70 0.50 1.20 12.70  1.40 0.60 1.00 0.80 1.40 1.50	\$420.00 \$8,050.00 \$445.00 \$1,068.00 \$9,118.00 \$510.00 \$850.00 \$680.00 \$1,190.00 \$1,275.00
04/03/2024 Safemoon 04/04/2024 Safemoon 04/04/2024 Safemoon Claims Analysis Lee Rooney 03/20/2024 Safemoon 07/23/2024 Safemoon 08/13/2024 Safemoon 09/04/2024 Safemoon 10/01/2024 Safemoon 10/18/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee  T  Chapter 7 Trustee	Escrow account discussion. Escrow account drafting. Totals Amounts for User Matthew Dundon otals Amounts for Activity Type Case Administration  Review of founder communications, statements re: status of the tokens Claims review Telecon with E. Ostrow, G. Goodman, and P. Hurwitz re: claims, valuation Telecon with E. Ostrow, G. goodman, and P. Hurwitz re: claims Review of claims to prepare claims report Telecon with C. Guilmin re: token prices and valuation of claims	0.60 11.50  0.70 0.50 1.20 12.70  1.40 0.60 1.00 0.80 1.40 1.50	\$420.00 \$8,050.00 \$445.00 \$1,068.00 \$9,118.00 \$980.00 \$510.00 \$850.00 \$680.00 \$1,190.00 \$5,485.00
04/03/2024 Safemoon 04/04/2024 Safemoon 04/04/2024 Safemoon 04/04/2024 Safemoon 03/20/2024 Safemoon 07/23/2024 Safemoon 08/13/2024 Safemoon 09/04/2024 Safemoon 10/01/2024 Safemoon 10/18/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee  T  Chapter 7 Trustee	Escrow account discussion. Escrow account drafting. Totals Amounts for User Matthew Dundon otals Amounts for Activity Type Case Administration  Review of founder communications, statements re: status of the tokens Claims review Telecon with E. Ostrow, G. Goodman, and P. Hurwitz re: claims, valuation Telecon with E. Ostrow, G. goodman, and P. Hurwitz re: claims Review of claims to prepare claims report Telecon with C. Guilmin re: token prices and valuation of claims Totals Amounts for User Lee Rooney  Telecon L. Rooney, A. Woodle re: review of employee claims Telecon D. Ortega, L. Rooney and others re: admin status	0.60 11.50  0.70 0.50 1.20 12.70  1.40 0.60 1.00 0.80 1.40 1.50 6.70	\$420.00 \$8,050.00 \$445.00 \$1,068.00 \$9,118.00 \$510.00 \$850.00 \$1,190.00 \$1,275.00 \$5,485.00 \$1,536.00 \$864.00
04/03/2024 Safemoon 04/04/2024 Safemoon 04/04/2024 Safemoon 04/04/2024 Safemoon 03/20/2024 Safemoon 07/23/2024 Safemoon 08/13/2024 Safemoon 09/04/2024 Safemoon 10/01/2024 Safemoon 10/18/2024 Safemoon 02/22/2024 Safemoon 02/22/2024 Safemoon 03/21/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee  T  Chapter 7 Trustee	Escrow account discussion. Escrow account drafting. Totals Amounts for User Matthew Dundon otals Amounts for Activity Type Case Administration  Review of founder communications, statements re: status of the tokens Claims review Telecon with E. Ostrow, G. Goodman, and P. Hurwitz re: claims, valuation Telecon with E. Ostrow, G. goodman, and P. Hurwitz re: claims Review of claims to prepare claims report Telecon with C. Guilmin re: token prices and valuation of claims Totals Amounts for User Lee Rooney  Telecon L. Rooney, A. Woodle re: review of employee claims Telecon D. Ortega, L. Rooney and others re: admin status Telecon L. Rooney re: token holder claims	0.60 11.50  0.70 0.50 1.20 12.70  1.40 0.60 1.00 0.80 1.40 1.50 6.70  1.60 0.90 1.10	\$420.00 \$8,050.00 \$445.00 \$1,068.00 \$9,118.00 \$510.00 \$510.00 \$680.00 \$1,190.00 \$1,275.00 \$5,485.00 \$1,536.00 \$1,056.00
04/03/2024 Safemoon 04/04/2024 Safemoon 04/04/2024 Safemoon 04/04/2024 Safemoon 03/20/2024 Safemoon 07/23/2024 Safemoon 08/13/2024 Safemoon 09/04/2024 Safemoon 10/01/2024 Safemoon 10/18/2024 Safemoon 02/22/2024 Safemoon 02/22/2024 Safemoon 03/21/2024 Safemoon 05/06/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee  Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Escrow account discussion. Escrow account drafting. Totals Amounts for User Matthew Dundon otals Amounts for Activity Type Case Administration  Review of founder communications, statements re: status of the tokens Claims review Telecon with E. Ostrow, G. Goodman, and P. Hurwitz re: claims, valuation Telecon with E. Ostrow, G. goodman, and P. Hurwitz re: claims Review of claims to prepare claims report Telecon with C. Guilmin re: token prices and valuation of claims Totals Amounts for User Lee Rooney  Telecon L. Rooney, A. Woodle re: review of employee claims Telecon D. Ortega, L. Rooney and others re: admin status Telecon L. Rooney re: token holder claims Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: claims analysis	0.60 11.50  0.70 0.50 1.20 12.70  1.40 0.60 1.00 0.80 1.40 1.50 6.70  1.60 0.90 1.10 0.80	\$420.00 \$8,050.00 \$445.00 \$1,068.00 \$9,118.00 \$510.00 \$850.00 \$1,190.00 \$1,275.00 \$5,485.00 \$1,536.00 \$1,056.00 \$768.00
04/03/2024 Safemoon 04/04/2024 Safemoon 04/04/2024 Safemoon 04/04/2024 Safemoon 02/20/2024 Safemoon 07/23/2024 Safemoon 08/13/2024 Safemoon 09/04/2024 Safemoon 10/01/2024 Safemoon 10/18/2024 Safemoon 02/22/2024 Safemoon 02/22/2024 Safemoon 03/21/2024 Safemoon 05/06/2024 Safemoon 08/13/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee  Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Escrow account discussion. Escrow account drafting. Totals Amounts for User Matthew Dundon otals Amounts for Activity Type Case Administration  Review of founder communications, statements re: status of the tokens Claims review Telecon with E. Ostrow, G. Goodman, and P. Hurwitz re: claims, valuation Telecon with E. Ostrow, G. goodman, and P. Hurwitz re: claims Review of claims to prepare claims report Telecon with C. Guilmin re: token prices and valuation of claims Totals Amounts for User Lee Rooney  Telecon L. Rooney, A. Woodle re: review of employee claims Telecon D. Ortega, L. Rooney and others re: admin status Telecon L. Rooney re: token holder claims Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: claims analysis Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), Foley (G. Goodman), L. Rooney re: claims valuation	0.60 11.50  0.70 0.50 1.20 12.70  1.40 0.60 1.00 0.80 1.40 1.50 6.70  1.60 0.90 1.10 0.80 1.00	\$420.00 \$8,050.00 \$445.00 \$1,068.00 \$9,118.00 \$510.00 \$850.00 \$1,190.00 \$1,275.00 \$5,485.00 \$1,056.00 \$768.00 \$960.00
04/03/2024 Safemoon 04/04/2024 Safemoon 04/04/2024 Safemoon 04/04/2024 Safemoon 04/04/2024 Safemoon 07/23/2024 Safemoon 08/13/2024 Safemoon 09/04/2024 Safemoon 10/01/2024 Safemoon 10/18/2024 Safemoon 02/07/2024 Safemoon 02/22/2024 Safemoon 03/21/2024 Safemoon 05/06/2024 Safemoon 05/06/2024 Safemoon 08/13/2024 Safemoon 09/04/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee  Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Escrow account discussion. Escrow account drafting. Totals Amounts for User Matthew Dundon otals Amounts for Activity Type Case Administration  Review of founder communications, statements re: status of the tokens Claims review Telecon with E. Ostrow, G. Goodman, and P. Hurwitz re: claims, valuation Telecon with E. Ostrow, G. goodman, and P. Hurwitz re: claims Review of claims to prepare claims report Telecon with C. Guilmin re: token prices and valuation of claims Totals Amounts for User Lee Rooney  Telecon D. Ortega, L. Rooney and others re: admin status Telecon D. Ortega, L. Rooney and others re: admin status Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: claims analysis Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), Foley (G. Goodman), L. Rooney re: claims valuation Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: claims analysis	0.60 11.50  0.70 0.50 1.20 12.70  1.40 0.60 1.00 0.80 1.40 1.50 6.70  1.60 0.90 1.10 0.80 1.00 0.80	\$420.00 \$8,050.00 \$445.00 \$1,068.00 \$9,118.00 \$510.00 \$680.00 \$1,190.00 \$1,275.00 \$5,485.00 \$1,056.00 \$768.00 \$768.00
04/03/2024 Safemoon 04/04/2024 Safemoon 04/04/2024 Safemoon 04/04/2024 Safemoon 04/04/2024 Safemoon 07/23/2024 Safemoon 08/13/2024 Safemoon 09/04/2024 Safemoon 10/01/2024 Safemoon 10/18/2024 Safemoon 02/22/2024 Safemoon 02/22/2024 Safemoon 03/21/2024 Safemoon 05/06/2024 Safemoon 08/13/2024 Safemoon 09/04/2024 Safemoon 10/08/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Escrow account discussion. Escrow account drafting. Totals Amounts for User Matthew Dundon otals Amounts for Activity Type Case Administration  Review of founder communications, statements re: status of the tokens Claims review Telecon with E. Ostrow, G. Goodman, and P. Hurwitz re: claims, valuation Telecon with E. Ostrow, G. goodman, and P. Hurwitz re: claims Review of claims to prepare claims report Telecon with C. Guilmin re: token prices and valuation of claims Totals Amounts for User Lee Rooney  Telecon L. Rooney, A. Woodle re: review of employee claims Telecon D. Ortega, L. Rooney and others re: admin status Telecon E. Rooney re: token holder claims Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: claims analysis Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: claims valuation Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: claims analysis Telecon Foley, E Ostrow, L. Rooney re: distriibution mechanics	0.60 11.50  0.70 0.50 1.20 12.70  1.40 0.60 1.00 0.80 1.40 1.50 6.70  1.60 0.90 1.10 0.80 1.00 0.80 1.00 0.80	\$420.00 \$8,050.00 \$445.00 \$1,068.00 \$9,118.00 \$510.00 \$680.00 \$1,190.00 \$1,275.00 \$5,485.00 \$1,056.00 \$768.00 \$768.00 \$960.00
04/03/2024 Safemoon 04/04/2024 Safemoon 04/04/2024 Safemoon 04/04/2024 Safemoon 03/20/2024 Safemoon 07/23/2024 Safemoon 08/13/2024 Safemoon 09/04/2024 Safemoon 10/01/2024 Safemoon 10/18/2024 Safemoon 02/22/2024 Safemoon 02/22/2024 Safemoon 03/21/2024 Safemoon 05/06/2024 Safemoon 08/13/2024 Safemoon 09/04/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee  Chapter 7 Trustee	Escrow account discussion. Escrow account drafting. Totals Amounts for User Matthew Dundon otals Amounts for Activity Type Case Administration  Review of founder communications, statements re: status of the tokens Claims review Telecon with E. Ostrow, G. Goodman, and P. Hurwitz re: claims, valuation Telecon with E. Ostrow, G. goodman, and P. Hurwitz re: claims Review of claims to prepare claims report Telecon with C. Guilmin re: token prices and valuation of claims Totals Amounts for User Lee Rooney  Telecon D. Ortega, L. Rooney and others re: admin status Telecon D. Ortega, L. Rooney and others re: admin status Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: claims analysis Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), Foley (G. Goodman), L. Rooney re: claims valuation Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: claims analysis	0.60 11.50  0.70 0.50 1.20 12.70  1.40 0.60 1.00 0.80 1.40 1.50 6.70  1.60 0.90 1.10 0.80 1.00 0.80	\$420.00 \$8,050.00 \$623.00 \$445.00 \$1,068.00

Lee Rooney				
12/20/2023 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Intro telecon with E. Ostrow, G. Goodman, and others	1.00	\$700.00
12/21/2023 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Call with E. Ostrow, case management	0.40	\$280.00
12/21/2023 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with P. Hurwitz, case management	0.70	\$490.00
12/21/2023 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with M Friedler re: crypto market/sales	0.60	\$420.00
12/22/2023 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with P. Hurwitz and S. Schroeder re: crypto wallets / LP pools	1.20	\$840.00
12/22/2023 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with E. Ostrow, G. Goodman, and others	0.70	\$490.00
12/22/2023 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	FB transfer call with C. Guilmin, P. Hurwitz, and others	0.70	\$490.00
12/26/2023 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with P. Hurwitz and E. Ostrow re: wallets / Estate liquidity	0.60	\$420.00
01/02/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with E. Ostrow re: business discussion, W-2	0.30	\$210.00
01/02/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with P. Hurwitz re: case financials	0.30	\$210.00
	•			
01/02/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with E. Ostrow, P. Hurwitz, and D. Nijhawan re: operations of Debtor	1.40	\$980.00
01/03/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with E. Ostrow, M. Williams, and others	1.00	\$700.00
01/03/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with T. Halkowski, E. Ostrow, and others	0.80	\$560.00
01/03/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Attended the status hearing	0.30	\$210.00
01/03/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with G. Goodman, E. Ostrow, and others re: case strategy	1.00	\$700.00
01/03/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with G. Soto, E. Ostrow, and P. Hurwitz re: case financials	1.20	\$840.00
01/04/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with C. Guiliman re: Debtor products	2.00	\$1,400.00
01/04/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with D. Oliver, E. Ostrow, and P. Hurwitz re: Debtor infrastructure	1.00	\$700.00
01/05/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow and P. Hurwitz re: case management	0.50	\$350.00
01/05/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with C. Guilmin	2.10	\$1,470.00
01/05/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with M. Stevens, E. Ostrow, and P. Hurwitzre: case financials	1.30	\$910.00
01/05/2024 Safemoon	·		1.50	\$1,050.00
	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with M. Santangelo, E. Ostrow, and P. Hurwitz		
01/07/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Email exchange with D. Nijhawan re: marketing	0.20	\$140.00
01/07/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with P. Hurwitz re: crypto theft	0.80	\$560.00
01/07/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with E. Ostrow, P. Hurwitz, and C. Guilmin re: crypto security	1.80	\$1,260.00
01/08/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Participated in the employee all-hands in call with E. Ostrow, G. Goodman, and others.	1.20	\$840.00
01/08/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with P. Hurwitz and E. Ostrow re: tax withholding/ wages	0.80	\$560.00
01/09/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with A. Woodle	0.60	\$420.00
01/09/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with Gusto and A. Woodle	1.30	\$910.00
01/11/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with company contractors re: workstreams	0.50	\$350.00
01/11/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with M. Markoe, E. Ostrow and others re: developer contractors	0.50	\$350.00
01/11/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. OStrow, G. Goodman, and others re: wallet push, and smart contracts	0.50	\$350.00
01/12/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow re: payroll	0.50	\$350.00
01/12/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with Gusto and A. Woodle re: access to payroll processor	1.30	\$910.00
01/12/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with D. Nijhawan, E. Ostrow, and P. Hurwitz re: programming protocols	0.90	\$630.00
01/12/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with E. Ostrow re: company operations	0.30	\$210.00
01/16/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow, G. Goodman, and others re: weekly call to discuss security measures and	0.80	\$560.00
01/16/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow re: call	0.10	\$70.00
01/16/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with E. Ostrow re: banking issues	0.30	\$210.00
, ,		Telecon with E. Ostrow re: case administration	0.20	\$140.00
01/16/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee			
01/19/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with P. Hurwitz, M. Friedler, and P. Daughtery re: need for crypto tracing needs and mandate	0.90	\$630.00
01/19/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with Inca, P. Daughtery, and others re: cyber security, cold storage vs. hosted wallet	1.10	\$770.00
01/19/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with E. Ostrow re: cyber security and Inca call	0.40	\$280.00
01/22/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with SafeMoon employees	0.70	\$490.00
01/22/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with E. Ostrow re: product discussion	0.20	\$140.00
01/23/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with E. Ostrow, G. Goodman, and others re: case management	0.80	\$560.00
01/23/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with C. Guilmin re: Debtor assets locations / categories	1.00	\$700.00
01/23/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with M Williamson re: Locked accounts and review of asset summary	0.90	\$630.00
01/24/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with P. Hurwitz and M. Williamson re: SFM Media Group and products	0.80	\$560.00
01/25/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with E. Ostrow and developers re: products	2.10	\$1,470.00
01/25/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon E. Ostrow	0.10	\$70.00
01/25/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow and P. Hurwitz re: all hands call	0.50	\$350.00
01/26/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with D. Oliver re: continuing vendor needs	1.00	\$700.00
01/26/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow re: cold storage setup	1.40	\$980.00
01/26/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with A. Woodle re: required tax form submissions	0.50	\$350.00
01/29/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with G. Goodman, P. Daughtery, and P. Hurwitz re: case progress	0.50	\$350.00
01/30/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with E. Ostrow re: tax issues and asset transfer	0.60	\$420.00
	·			
01/30/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with P. Hurwitz re: LP transfer / contractor requirements	0.80	\$560.00
01/30/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with Robert Hunter, P. Hurwitz re: tax professional	0.60	\$420.00
02/01/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Participated in the Professionals' call	1.00	\$700.00
02/02/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with C. Guilmin re: LP process	0.80	\$560.00
02/02/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with M. Stevens, C. Breeze, and others re: company products	1.00	\$700.00
02/02/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with T. Halkowski, E. Ostrow, and others re: company products	0.80	\$560.00
	Cl	Telecom with E. Ostrow re: case management	0.60	\$420.00
02/05/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	refection with E. Ostrow re. case management	0.00	3420.00
02/05/2024 Safemoon 02/05/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with C. Breeze, P. Hurwitz, and others re: sales process	0.50	
		-		\$350.00 \$700.00

## Case 23-25749 Doc 242 Filed 12/06/24 Entered 12/06/24 10:36:02 Desc Main Document Page 29 of 34

02/05/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with G. Goodman, E. Ostrow, and others	1.00	\$700.00
02/06/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Participated in the weekly employee call wtih E. Ostrow, G. Goodman, and others	0.40	\$280.00
02/06/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with E. Ostrow re: call, sales process, employee issues	0.30	\$210.00
02/06/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Email correspondence with D. Nijhawan re: employee claims	0.50	\$350.00
02/07/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow re: case management	0.50	\$350.00
02/09/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow re: case management	0.30	\$210.00
02/14/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Participated in the weekly meeting	0.50	\$350.00
02/14/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow re: case management	0.50	\$350.00
02/15/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. OStrow, G. Goodman and others	1.10	\$770.00
02/16/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with T. Halkowski and E. Ostrow re: crypto tracing	0.80	\$560.00
02/19/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Participated in the professionals call with E. Ostrow and G. Goodman	0.60	\$420.00
02/19/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with Operation Phoenix	0.40	\$280.00
02/20/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with M. Williams and E. Ostrow	0.80	\$560.00
02/22/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with D. Ortega, P. Hurwitz and others re: admin status	0.90	\$630.00
02/22/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow re: case management	0.50	\$350.00
02/23/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow re: case management	0.40	\$280.00
02/23/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with W. Johnson and E. Ostrow re: patents	0.60	\$420.00
02/27/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with P. Hurwitz re: contractor, sales process	0.80	\$560.00
02/27/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecons with E. Ostrow re: case administration	0.90	\$630.00
02/27/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with D.O., Peter M., and E. Ostrow	1.40	\$980.00
02/29/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with C. Guilimin re: AWS, Gsuite access	1.40	\$980.00
02/29/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with P. Hurwitz re: admin accounts	0.20	\$140.00
02/29/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with G. Goodman, E. Ostrow, and P. Hurwitz Telecon with D. Nijhawan and P. Hurwitz re: IP/trademark infringment	0.80 0.70	\$560.00 \$490.00
03/01/2024 Safemoon 03/01/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with T. Halkowski re: crypto tracing exercise	0.40	\$280.00
03/01/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with M. Williams re: google workspace	0.30	\$210.00
03/01/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with R. Peter re: gsuite administrative access	0.80	\$560.00
03/01/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with C. Guilmin re: twitter messaging	1.40	\$980.00
03/04/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with W. Johnson and E. Ostrow	0.60	\$420.00
03/04/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow re: case admin	0.50	\$350.00
03/04/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with G. Goodman, E. Ostrow, and others	0.40 0.20	\$280.00
03/05/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Email exchange with D. Nijhawan re: JK emails		\$140.00
03/05/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow, J. Karony, P. Hurwitz and others re: case admin	0.60	\$420.00
03/05/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with P. Mikhailenok, M. Stevens, and others re: AWS downgrade	0.70	\$490.00
03/05/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with T. Halkowski and E. Ostrow re: tracing and case related issues	0.60	\$420.00
03/06/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow re: AWS usage	0.50	\$350.00
03/07/2024 Safemoon 03/07/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Orbital Shield analysis Telecon with E. Ostrow and P. Mikhailenok re: AWS	0.50 0.50	\$350.00 \$350.00
03/08/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow re: LP	0.40	\$280.00
03/08/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow and C. Guilmin re: wallets	1.50 0.40	\$1,050.00 \$280.00
03/11/2024 Safemoon 03/11/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Participated in the weekly meeting with E. Ostrow, G. Goodman, and others  Review of developer wishlist with recommendations with telecon with C. Guilmin	0.40	\$630.00
03/12/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	AWS pricing analysis with telecon with R. Peter	1.30	\$910.00
				•
03/21/2024 Safemoon 03/26/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with R. Peter re: token project launches/value Telecon with E. Ostrow, M. Stevens, and C. Guilmin re: wallet tx	0.40 0.50	\$280.00 \$350.00
03/26/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with G. Goodman, E. Ostrow, and others re: crypto assets	0.20	\$140.00
03/27/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow, G. Goodman, and the SEC re: LP	0.80	\$560.00
03/27/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with C. Guilmin to discuss LP	0.60	\$420.00
03/28/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow, G. Goodman, and others	0.40	\$280.00
04/02/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with C. Guilmin re: requested wallet movements, treasury tokens, NFT	1.30	\$910.00
04/10/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with P. Daugherty, E. Ostrow, P. Hurwitz and others re: crypto transfer	0.50	\$350.00
04/15/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow, G. Goodman, and others	0.70	\$490.00
04/17/2024 Safemoon 04/18/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow, G. Goodman, P. Hurwitz and others Telecon with E. Ostrow and C. Guilmin re: asset transfer	1.30 1.30	\$910.00 \$910.00
04/19/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow and C. Guirmin e. asset transfer	2.10	\$1,470.00
04/24/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow and G. Goodman re: asset transfer	0.60	\$420.00
05/13/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow, G. Goodman, and P. Hurwitz	0.40	\$280.00
07/23/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. OStrow and P. Hurwitz	0.10	\$85.00
08/08/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	AWS communications	0.40	\$340.00
08/12/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow re: Spraggs settlement objection issue	0.60	\$510.00
08/13/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with M. Stephens and C. Guilmin re: Spraggs issue	0.80	\$680.00
08/14/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with R. Peter, M. Stephens, C. Guilmin, and Vu re: dApp	0.80	\$680.00
09/05/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with J. Petrower, E. Ostrow, and others re: financials	0.80	\$680.00
09/17/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow, G. Goodman, and P. Hurwitz re: case status	0.50	\$425.00
10/01/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. OStrow, G. Goodman, and P. Hurwitz	0.50	\$425.00
10/09/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with class action counsel	1.20	\$1,020.00
10/16/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Analysis of crypto prices related to securities litigation  Totals Amounts for User Lee Rooney	2.50 <b>101.90</b>	\$2,125.00 <b>\$72,560.00</b>
Peter Hurwitz		·· ·· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·		. ,
12/20/2023 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: workflows	1.00	\$960.00
12/21/2023 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: workflows	0.70	\$672.00
12/22/2023 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon L. Rooney, consultant re: crypto wallets and liquidity pools	1.20	\$1,152.00
		, , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , ,		
12/22/2023 Safemoon		T-1	0.00	
, ,	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), E. Ostrow, L. Rooney re: work flows	0.70	\$672.00
12/22/2023 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon C. Guilman, L. Rooney re: work flows  Telecon C. Guilman, L. Rooney re: wallet transfers	0.70	\$672.00 \$672.00

## Case 23-25749 Doc 242 Filed 12/06/24 Entered 12/06/24 10:36:02 Desc Main Document Page 30 of 34

12/22/2023 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: wallet transfers and estate liquidity analysis	0.60	\$576.00
12/26/2023 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: wallet transfers and estate liquidity analysis	0.60	\$576.00
01/02/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon L. Rooney re: estate financial analysis	0.30	\$288.00
01/02/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Trustee, D. Nijawan, L. Rooney re: operations diligence	1.40	\$1,344.00
01/03/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley, Trustee, L. Rooney re: various issues	1.00	\$960.00
01/03/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), G. Soto, L. Rooney re: financial diligence	1.20	\$1,152.00
01/04/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), D. Oliver, L. Rooney re: operational infrastructure	1.00	\$960.00
01/04/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: various issues and workflow	0.50	\$480.00
01/05/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), M. Stevens, L. Rooney re: financial diligence	1.30	\$1,248.00
01/05/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), M. Santangelo, L. Rooney re: diligence	1.50	\$1,440.00
01/07/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon L. Rooney re: crypto theft tracing	0.80	\$768.00
01/07/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), C. Guilman, L. Rooney re: crypto wallet security of estate assets	1.80	\$1,728.00
01/08/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (Goodman, Daugherty), Trustee (E. Ostrow), re: recovery of assets and related matters	0.80	\$768.00
01/08/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), Foley, C. Guilman and other employees, L. Rooney re: crypto wallet	1.20	\$1,152.00
01/08/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: withholding obligations for wages paid	0.80	\$768.00
01/11/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (Goodman, Daugherty), Trustee (E. Ostrow), re: recovery of assets and related matters	0.80	\$768.00
01/11/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Employees, Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee, L. Rooney re: various case issues	1.10	\$1,056.00
01/11/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), D. Nijawan, L. Rooney re: programming protocols	0.90	\$864.00
01/16/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Employees, Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee, L. Rooney re: various case issues	1.50	\$1,440.00
01/16/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), Employees, L. Rooney re: security measures	0.80	\$768.00
01/19/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (Daugherty), Trustee (E. Ostrow), INCA, L. Rooney re: recovery of assets and related	0.80	\$768.00
01/19/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (Daugherty), L. Rooney re: INCA and recovery of assets and related matters	1.10	\$1,056.00
01/22/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (Goodman, Daugherty), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: various case issues	0.80	\$768.00
01/22/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Periodic telecon E. Ostrow, Foley, L. Rooney, and employees	0.80	\$712.00
01/22/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon E. Ostrow, Foley, L. Rooney re: product analysis	0.20	\$178.00
01/23/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), Foley, L. Rooney re: progress update on workflows	0.80	\$768.00
01/24/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon M. Williamson, L. Rooney re: SFM media group and product offerings	0.80	\$768.00
01/25/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	All hands telecon, L. Rooney re: case update	0.50	\$480.00
01/29/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (Goodman, Daugherty), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: preparation for SEC telecon	0.50	\$480.00
01/30/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon L. Rooney re: contractor staffing needs of LP transfers	0.80	\$768.00
01/30/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon R. Hunter, L. Rooney re: staffing needs for tax fillings	0.60	\$576.00
02/01/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (Goodman, Daugherty), E. Ostrow, L. Rooney re: recovery of assets and related matters	2.00	\$1,920.00
02/05/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (Goodman, Daugherty), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: various case issues	0.80	\$768.00
02/05/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), Lynne Spraggs, L. Rooney re: claims	1.00	\$960.00
02/05/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Periodic professionals telecon with Foley, Dundon and the Trustee	1.00	\$890.00
02/06/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), employees, Foley (G. Goodman), L. Rooney re: progress update	0.40	\$384.00
02/08/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (Goodman, Daugherty), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: various case issues	1.00	\$960.00
02/14/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (Goodman, Daugherty), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: various case issues	0.70	\$672.00
02/15/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (Goodman, Daugherty), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: various case issues	0.80	\$768.00 \$480.00
02/19/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (Goodman, Daugherty), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: various case issues	0.50	·
02/21/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (Goodman, Daugherty), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: various case issues	0.60	\$576.00
02/29/2024 Safemoon 03/01/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: admin accounts and access	0.80	\$768.00
	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon D. Nijhawan, L. Rooney re: IP/trademark infringment	0.70	\$672.00
03/04/2024 Safemoon 03/05/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: various case issues Telecon J. Karony, Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney and others re: various case issues	0.40 0.60	\$384.00 \$576.00
03/11/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: various case issues	0.40	\$384.00
03/18/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: various case issues	0.50	\$480.00
03/28/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Partiicpate on professionals telecon	0.50	\$445.00
05/06/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: various case issues	0.50	\$480.00
05/13/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: various case issues	0.50	\$480.00
05/13/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley, Trustee, L. Rooney re: various case issues	0.40	\$384.00
07/02/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow) re: next steps	0.60	\$576.00
07/16/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: various issues	0.60	\$576.00
07/23/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Trustee, L. Rooney re: various case issues	0.10	\$96.00
07/30/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: various issues	0.30	\$288.00
08/13/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: work flows	1.00	\$960.00
09/06/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: class claim issues	0.80	\$768.00
09/10/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: various issues	0.50	\$480.00
09/17/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: various issues	0.50	\$480.00
10/01/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: various issues	0.50	\$480.00
10/01/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: various issues	0.50	\$480.00
10/24/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow) re: various issues	0.50	\$480.00
	Totals Amounts for 6 11	Totals Amounts for User Peter Hurwitz	51.90	\$49,649.00
	iotals Amounts for Act	ivity Type Committee Member/Professional Meetings & Communications	153.80	\$122,209.00

## Case 23-25749 Doc 242 Filed 12/06/24 Entered 12/06/24 10:36:02 Desc Main Document Page 31 of 34

12/26/2023 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Preparation of retention application	2.10	\$1,470.00
		Totals Amounts for User Lee Rooney	2.10	\$1,470.00
Peter Hurwitz 12/27/2023 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review and revise retention application	1.50	\$1,440.00
12/27/2023 SaleIIIO0II	Chapter / hustee	Totals Amounts for User Peter Hurwitz	1.50	\$1,440.00
	Totals /	Amounts for Activity Type Retention and Fee Applications	3.60	\$2,910.00
Sales Process				
Alexander Zahringer				
02/01/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Reformatting CIM	0.60	\$210.00
		Totals Amounts for User Alexander Zahringer	0.60	\$210.00
Harry Tucker 03/11/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Discuss sales process with Lee Rooney	0.30	\$195.00
03/12/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Research potential buyers contact info	6.50	\$4,225.00
03/13/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Research of potential buyers contact information.	1.00	\$650.00
03/14/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Research potential buyers	1.00	\$650.00
03/15/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Research potential buyers	4.30	\$2,795.00
03/16/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Sent out teaser to over 100 potential buyers	3.00	\$1,950.00
03/18/2024 Safemoon 03/19/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Researched and emailed potential bidders email reachout to potential bidders	1.50 3.00	\$975.00 \$1,950.00
03/22/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Reachout to potential buyers	3.30	\$2,145.00
03/26/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Identified and reached out to potential buyers	3.00	\$1,950.00
		Totals Amounts for User Harry Tucker	26.90	\$17,485.00
ee Rooney				
01/22/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with E. Ostrow and P. Hurwitz re: sale process	0.40	\$280.00
01/22/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with D. Nijhawan, A. Woodle, and others re: sale process	0.30	\$210.00
02/01/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Internal call with C. Breeze re: sales process	0.50	\$350.00
02/02/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow re: marketing	0.20	\$140.00
02/07/2024 Safemoon 02/08/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with D. Nijhawan and P. Hurwitz re: marketing process  Marketing call with P. Hurwitz and Shibtoshi	0.70 0.70	\$490.00 \$490.00
02/08/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with P. Hurwitz and Block Busters marketing call	0.80	\$560.00
02/12/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with P. Hurwitz, P. Mikhailenok, and C. Breeze re: sales process	1.10	\$770.00
02/12/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with P. Hurwitz and E. Ostrow re: sales process	0.40	\$280.00
02/19/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow, P. Hurwitz re: marketing process	0.50	\$350.00
02/20/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with NEAR Foundation with P. Hurwitz	0.60	\$420.00
02/20/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow re: marketing process	0.50	\$350.00
02/22/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with C. Guilimin re: valuation of SFM	0.70	\$490.00
02/22/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Creation of valuation model	2.30	\$1,610.00
02/27/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Communications with potential bidding parties with P. Hurwitz	1.40	\$980.00
02/27/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Internal Telecon re: sales reach out	0.50	\$350.00
02/28/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with D. Paluszek re: sales process	0.80	\$560.00
03/01/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with D. Paluszek re: marketing process reachout	0.80	\$560.00
03/01/2024 Safemoon 03/04/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Marketing list / reach out Telecon with D. Paluszek and review of marketing list/outreach	2.90 2.70	\$2,030.00 \$1,890.00
03/05/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with Squidgrow, P. Hurwitz re: sale process and trademark infringement	0.30	\$210.00
03/06/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Marketing process	1.90	\$1,330.00
03/06/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with P. Hurwitz re: service usage and sale process	0.40	\$280.00
03/07/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Write-up for wallet description with edits	1.90	\$1,330.00
03/08/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review of Sale / Bid procedures	1.50	\$1,050.00
03/11/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Sale Process / marketing list	1.60	\$1,120.00
03/11/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review of one-page teaser for IP, sending to marketing list	0.50	\$350.00
03/11/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review of edited marketing teaser	0.70	\$490.00
03/15/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Editing of marketing teaser with telecon with R. Peter	0.40	\$280.00
03/21/2024 Safemoon 03/22/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with D. Nichols re: data room creation Data room preparation	0.40 1.20	\$280.00 \$840.00
03/25/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with P. Hurwitz and E. Ostrow re: marketing process	0.60	\$420.00
03/26/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Sales call with D. Kleiner, P. Hurwitz, and others, with post call	0.40	\$280.00
03/27/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Email with team to set up call	0.60	\$420.00
03/27/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Sales process outreach/tracking	1.50	\$1,050.00
03/28/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with T. Halkowski, C. Guilmin, P. Hurwitz and others in preparation of sales call with Wave	0.50	\$350.00
03/28/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with P. Hurwitz re: sales process narrative	0.70	\$490.00
03/28/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with D. Siemer, P. Hurwitz, and others re: sales process, introduction to team	1.40	\$980.00
03/29/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with P. Hurwitz and SGJ re: sales process	0.50	\$350.00
03/29/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Sales process outreach	1.70	\$1,190.00
04/01/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow re: auction/operations  Communications with parties	0.30	\$210.00
04/02/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Communications with parties  Final correspondence with WD religion by might with takens	0.80	\$560.00
04/02/2024 Safemoon 04/02/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Email correspondence with WD re: burn/mint, with tokens Attended the hearing re: sale of assets	1.60 0.30	\$1,120.00 \$210.00
5./52/2524 Jaiemoun	chapter / mustee	Accessed the hearing recount of assets		
04/02/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow, G. Goodman and others	0.50	\$350.00

## Case 23-25749 Doc 242 Filed 12/06/24 Entered 12/06/24 10:36:02 Desc Main Document Page 32 of 34

04/04/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with D. Nijhawan re: orbital shield	0.60	\$420.00
04/04/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with P. Hurwitz re: auction process strategy, participant review	1.40	\$980.00
04/04/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with SGJ, P. Hurwitz re: auction process	0.60	\$420.00
04/04/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review of APA, bid procedures	1.30	\$910.00
04/04/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow and G. Goodman re: bids	0.40	\$280.00
04/04/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Bid communications, SGJ	1.10	\$770.00
04/05/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with M. Stevens and E. Ostrow re: Estate assets	0.70	\$490.00
04/05/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with P. Hurwitz re: bid review, strategy, potential bid to end auction	1.20	\$840.00
04/05/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with P. Hurwitz re: bid review/strategy	0.70	\$490.00
04/05/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow re: auction bid deadline, update about negotiations	0.70	\$490.00
04/05/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow re: crypto sale process/strategy	0.60	\$420.00
04/05/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	APA review/drafting	2.10	\$1,470.00
04/06/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with P. Hurwitz re: progress with potential bidder	0.80	\$560.00
04/08/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with P. Hurwitz, E. Ostrow, and others re: sale process/auction	0.50	\$350.00
04/08/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review of V1 token issue, ability to bifurfate from other assets with C. Guilmin	1.90	\$1,330.00
04/08/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with SGJ re: auction process	0.50	\$350.00
04/08/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Outreach to crypto dealers/brokers	1.90	\$1,330.00
04/09/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Updating crypto asset list with valuations	2.40	\$1,680.00
04/09/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with P. Daughtery, E. Ostrow, and others re: token sale process	0.60	\$420.00
04/09/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecons with C. Guilmin and R. Peter re: crypto asset sale	1.10	\$770.00
04/10/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with P. Hurwitz and potential bidder Dr. Adel	0.90	\$630.00
04/10/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Crypto asset analysis in anticipation of sale	2.70	\$1,890.00
04/10/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with Potential auction participants	0.60	\$420.00
04/10/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with S. Kelly with Evergrow re: wallets	0.80	\$560.00
04/10/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with M. Stephens, M. Williams, C. Guilmin, and others re: wallet	1.60	\$1,120.00
04/10/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with C. Guilmin re: crypto trading	1.60	\$1,120.00
04/10/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow, G. Goodman, and others	0.70	\$490.00
04/11/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Calls with potential crypto asset bidder	1.90	\$1,330.00
04/12/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow and P. Hurwitz re: sales process	0.40	\$280.00
04/12/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with P. Hurwitz re: sale process	0.80	\$560.00
04/12/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with SGJ re: sales process	0.30	\$210.00
04/14/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	APA review	1.30	\$910.00
04/15/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with P. Hurwitz re: APAs with N. Wave	0.90	\$630.00
04/15/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with N. Wave re: sale process	0.40	\$280.00
04/18/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Meeting with Wintermute re: crypto sales	1.10	\$770.00
04/18/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with P. Hurwitz and Wintermute re: price negotiation	0.60	\$420.00
04/18/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with Flowdesk re: portfolio sale	0.70	\$490.00
04/18/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Outreach trading firms, telecon with H. Tucker	2.30	\$1,610.00
04/22/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review of assets in internal lists, data room, APAs with analysis of transfer process	1.80	\$1,260.00
04/22/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with Buyers	0.40	\$280.00
04/23/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with E. Ostrow, NW, and others re: transfer of assets plan	0.80	\$560.00
04/24/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with R. Peter and E. Ostrow re: AWS transfer process / ownership	0.90	\$630.00
04/24/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with SFM contractors and VGX foundation re: asset transfer	2.20	\$1,540.00
07/16/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with R. Peter re: google seats	0.30	\$255.00
		Totals Amounts for User Lee Rooney	89.40	\$62,625.00
Matthew Dundon				
04/17/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Support for P. Hurwitz on sale process declaration.	0.50	\$445.00
0.72.7202.000.000.		Totals Amounts for User Matthew Dundon	0.50	\$445.00
Peter Hurwitz				
01/16/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (Goodman), Trustee (E, . Ostrow), and others re: sales process update	0.50	\$480.00
01/17/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review and revise product line descriptions for marketing process	1.00	\$960.00
01/21/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review inventory of cleared tokens provided by Foley (P. Daugherty)	0.40	\$384.00
01/22/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecom with D. Nijhawan, A. Woodle, L. Rooney and others re: sale process	1.00	\$960.00
01/22/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon E. Ostrow, Foley, L. Rooney re: sales process	0.40	\$356.00
01/23/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (P. Daugherty), L. Rooney, crypto trading firm re: possible purchase of crypto assets	0.40	\$384.00
01/25/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (P. Daugherty, G. Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: possible sale of crypto	0.50	\$480.00
01/29/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	assets Telecon Foley (P. Daugherty, G. Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: possible sale of crypto	0.50	\$480.00
01/25/2024 Salemoon	Chapter / Hustee	assets	0.30	\$480.00
02/01/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Prepare and supplement market outreach strategy	2.00	\$1,920.00
02/05/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon C. Breeze L. Rooney re: sales process strategy	0.50	\$480.00
02/05/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon C. Breeze, L. Rooney re: marketing process and product analysis	1.00	\$890.00
02/07/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review and edit sales teaser	1.40	\$1,344.00
02/07/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon L. Rooney to review and edit sales teaser	0.60	\$576.00
02/07/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon D. Nijawan, L. Rooney re: marketing process	0.70	\$672.00
02/08/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Blockbusters, L. Rooney re: marketing and possible interest	0.80	\$768.00
02/08/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Marketing telecon L. Rooney, Shibtoshi	0.70	\$672.00
02/12/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon C. Breeze, P. Mikhailenok, L. Rooney re: sales and marketing process	1.10	\$1,056.00
02/12/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: sales process update	0.40	\$384.00
02/14/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review draft memo to SEC re: possible sale of crypto assets	0.50	\$480.00
02/14/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review and revisions to marketing deck	1.10	\$1,056.00
02/19/2024 Safemoon				
	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review and edit marketing email	0.50	\$480.00
02/19/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Review and edit marketing email  Telecon Trustee, L. Rooney re: marketing update	0.50 0.50	\$480.00 \$480.00

## Case 23-25749 Doc 242 Filed 12/06/24 Entered 12/06/24 10:36:02 Desc Main Document Page 33 of 34

02/20/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon L. Rooneyand potential buyer NEASR foundation re: sales process	0.60	\$576.00
02/22/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Update to Foley (Goodman, Daugherty), Trustee (E. Ostrow) re: Bitmart discussions and related	0.50	\$480.00
02/22/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review draft correspondence to Bitmart, email exchange Foley, Trustee (E. Ostrow) re: same	0.40	\$384.00
02/26/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (Goodman, Daugherty), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: sale and empolyee issues	0.50	\$480.00
02/26/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley, Trustee, L. Rooney re: possible sale of crypto assets	0.50	\$480.00
02/27/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon L. Rooney and others re: sales process strategy discussion	0.80	\$768.00
02/27/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Potential buyer reachout w/ L. Rooney re: participation in sales process	1.10	\$1,056.00
03/05/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley, Trustee, L. Rooney re: sale asset issues	0.40	\$384.00
03/05/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review draft crypto sale motion	0.50	\$480.00
03/05/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon potential buyer 9Squid Grow Joe), L. Rooney re: sales process and trademark issues	0.30	\$288.00
03/11/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review updated teaser, comments to L. Rooney re: same	0.50	\$480.00
03/11/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), Foley (G. Goodman) re: general update and sale process	0.50	\$445.00
03/21/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Prepare for and attend hearing on bid procedures	1.00	\$960.00
03/25/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley, Trustee, L. Rooney re: crypto sale issues	0.50	\$480.00
03/25/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review proposed APA	1.40	\$1,344.00
03/25/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: marketing process update	0.60	\$576.00
03/26/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review reservation of rights filed by SEC, email exchange Foley re: same	0.80	\$768.00
03/26/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley, Trustee, L. Rooney re: liquidity pools, SEC objections, related issues	1.20	\$1,152.00
03/26/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon potential buyer, L. Rooney	0.40	\$384.00
03/27/2024 Safemoon 03/28/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow) re: SEC DOE issues	1.00	\$960.00 \$384.00
	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: asset sale process	0.40	•
03/28/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon L. Rooney re: preparation and script for potential buyer  Telecon Trustee (DE. Ostrow) re: update on telecon with potentiial purchaser	0.70 0.30	\$672.00 \$267.00
03/28/2024 Safemoon	•			
03/28/2024 Safemoon 03/28/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with potential purchaser, L. Rooney, management Prepare for telecon with potential purchaser, L. Rooney, management	1.50 0.50	\$1,335.00 \$445.00
	Chapter 7 Trustee	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	0.50	
03/29/2024 Safemoon	Chapter / Trustee	Telecon L. Rooney, Squid Grow Joe (potential buyer)	0.50	\$480.00
03/31/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review and provide comments to draft APA	1.20	\$1,152.00
04/01/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review draft sale order, provides comments re: same	0.50	\$480.00
	•			
04/02/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review bid letter, email exchange Foley re: same	0.40	\$384.00
04/02/2024 Safemoon 04/02/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Prepare for and attend crypto sale motion hearing Telecon Foley (Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: operating asset auction	0.70 0.40	\$672.00 \$384.00
04/03/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: operating asset auction  Telecon Foley (Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: operating asset auction	0.50	\$480.00
- 1, - 1, - 1 - 1 - 1 - 1 - 1 - 1 - 1		strategy		7.00.00
04/04/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review and analyze APA from proposed buyer	1.00	\$960.00
04/04/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley, Trustee (Ostrow), Rooney re: auction process and strategy	1.40	\$1,344.00
04/04/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Follow up emails elecon Foley, Trustee (Ostrow) re: auction process	0.50	\$480.00
04/04/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Squid Grow Joe, L. Rooney re: auction process	0.60 0.70	\$576.00 \$672.00
04/05/2024 Safemoon 04/05/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecons buyers counsel (MWE), re: sale issues and proposals Telecons Foley (Daugherty, Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: token sale issues	1.70	\$1,632.00
04/05/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon L. Rooney re: bid reviews and strategy for auction	1.20	\$1,152.00
04/05/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon L. Rooney re: bid review seeking to pre-empt auction	0.70	\$672.00
04/06/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon L. Rooney re: bid progress	0.80	\$768.00
04/08/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Review and analyze APA schedules, telecons Foley, Trustee, L. Rooney re: same	1.20	\$1,152.00
04/08/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon potential bidder (Squid Grow Joe), L. Rooney	0.50	\$480.00
04/09/2024 Safemoon 04/10/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecons Foley (P. Daugherty, G. Goodman), Trustee, L. Rooney re: token sale process  Email exchange Foley (G. Goodman) re: crypto bid analysis	1.90 0.20	\$1,824.00 \$192.00
04/10/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: crypto bid analysis	0.80	\$768.00
04/10/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecons various trading firms, Foley (G. Goodman, P. Daugherty), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re:	4.00	\$3,840.00
		crypto sales		
04/10/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley, Trustee, L. Rooney re: crypto transfer process	0.50	\$480.00
04/10/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon potential bidder (Dr. Adler), L. Rooney re: auction process and potential bid	0.90	\$864.00
04/10/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon potential auction participants, L. Rooney re: auction process and potential bids	0.60	\$576.00
04/11/2024 Safemoon 04/11/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: crypto bid issues Telecons potential crypto bidders, L. Rooney re: bid structure, pricing	0.80	\$768.00 \$1,824.00
04/11/2024 Jaicillooll		referents potential of ypto bidders, it mooney reform structure, pricing		
04/12/2024 Safemoon	•	Telecon Foley (G. Goodman) Trustee (F. Ostrow)   Rooney regauction and hids	1.90 0.50	
04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/12/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: auction and bids Telecon Foley (G. Goodman). Buyers representatives. L. Rooney re: APA issues	0.50	\$480.00
04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/12/2024 Safemoon	•	Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: auction and bids Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Buyers representatives, L. Rooney re: APA issues Telecon Squid Grow Joe, L. Rooney re: bid structure, pricing		
04/12/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Buyers representatives, L. Rooney re: APA issues	0.50 0.80	\$480.00 \$768.00
04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/12/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Buyers representatives, L. Rooney re: APA issues Telecon Squid Grow Joe, L. Rooney re: bid structure, pricing	0.50 0.80 0.30	\$480.00 \$768.00 \$288.00
04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Buyers representatives, L. Rooney re: APA issues Telecon Squid Grow Joe, L. Rooney re: bid structure, pricing Telecon L. Rooney re: sale process strategy Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Buyers representatives, L. Rooney re: operating assets and transition issues	0.50 0.80 0.30 0.80 1.80	\$480.00 \$768.00 \$288.00 \$768.00 \$1,728.00
04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Buyers representatives, L. Rooney re: APA issues  Telecon Squid Grow Joe, L. Rooney re: bid structure, pricing  Telecon L. Rooney re: sale process strategy  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Buyers representatives, L. Rooney re: operating assets and transition issues  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (Ostrow), L. Rooney re: updated APAs	0.50 0.80 0.30 0.80 1.80	\$480.00 \$768.00 \$288.00 \$768.00 \$1,728.00 \$1,536.00
04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Buyers representatives, L. Rooney re: APA issues  Telecon Squid Grow Joe, L. Rooney re: bid structure, pricing  Telecon L. Rooney re: sale process strategy  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Buyers representatives, L. Rooney re: operating assets and transition issues  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (Ostrow), L. Rooney re: updated APAs  Emails Foley (G. Goodman) re: token issues	0.50 0.80 0.30 0.80 1.80	\$480.00 \$768.00 \$288.00 \$768.00 \$1,728.00 \$1,536.00 \$192.00
04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Buyers representatives, L. Rooney re: APA issues  Telecon Squid Grow Joe, L. Rooney re: bid structure, pricing  Telecon L. Rooney re: sale process strategy  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Buyers representatives, L. Rooney re: operating assets and transition issues  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (Ostrow), L. Rooney re: updated APAs	0.50 0.80 0.30 0.80 1.80	\$480.00 \$768.00 \$288.00 \$768.00 \$1,728.00 \$1,536.00
04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Buyers representatives, L. Rooney re: APA issues  Telecon Squid Grow Joe, L. Rooney re: bid structure, pricing  Telecon L. Rooney re: sale process strategy  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Buyers representatives, L. Rooney re: operating assets and transition issues  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (Ostrow), L. Rooney re: updated APAs  Emails Foley (G. Goodman) re: token issues  Telecon L. Rooney re: bidder APA issues and structure	0.50 0.80 0.30 0.80 1.80 1.60 0.20 0.90	\$480.00 \$768.00 \$288.00 \$768.00 \$1,728.00 \$1,536.00 \$192.00 \$864.00
04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Buyers representatives, L. Rooney re: APA issues  Telecon Squid Grow Joe, L. Rooney re: bid structure, pricing  Telecon L. Rooney re: sale process strategy  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Buyers representatives, L. Rooney re: operating assets and transition issues  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (Ostrow), L. Rooney re: updated APAs  Emails Foley (G. Goodman) re: token issues  Telecon L. Rooney re: bidder APA issues and structure  Telecon Bidder managment (L. Borsai and others), L. Rooney re: bid issues and structure	0.50 0.80 0.30 0.80 1.80 1.60 0.20 0.90 0.40	\$480.00 \$768.00 \$288.00 \$768.00 \$1,728.00 \$1,536.00 \$192.00 \$864.00 \$384.00
04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/16/2024 Safemoon 04/16/2024 Safemoon 04/16/2024 Safemoon 04/17/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Buyers representatives, L. Rooney re: APA issues  Telecon Squid Grow Joe, L. Rooney re: bid structure, pricing  Telecon L. Rooney re: sale process strategy  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Buyers representatives, L. Rooney re: operating assets and transition issues  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (Ostrow), L. Rooney re: updated APAs  Emails Foley (G. Goodman) re: token issues  Telecon L. Rooney re: bidder APA issues and structure  Telecon Bidder managment (L. Borsai and others), L. Rooney re: bid issues and structure  Review successful bidder notice  Review and comments to proposed Hurwitz declaration, telecons Foley re: same  Review and comments to proposed sale order	0.50 0.80 0.30 0.80 1.80 1.60 0.20 0.90 0.40 0.30 1.60 0.30	\$480.00 \$768.00 \$288.00 \$768.00 \$1,728.00 \$1,536.00 \$192.00 \$864.00 \$384.00 \$288.00 \$1,536.00 \$288.00
04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/16/2024 Safemoon 04/16/2024 Safemoon 04/16/2024 Safemoon 04/17/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Buyers representatives, L. Rooney re: APA issues  Telecon Squid Grow Joe, L. Rooney re: bid structure, pricing  Telecon L. Rooney re: sale process strategy  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Buyers representatives, L. Rooney re: operating assets and transition issues  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (Ostrow), L. Rooney re: updated APAs  Emails Foley (G. Goodman) re: token issues  Telecon L. Rooney re: bidder APA issues and structure  Telecon Bidder managment (L. Borsai and others), L. Rooney re: bid issues and structure  Review successful bidder notice  Review and comments to proposed Hurwitz declaration, telecons Foley re: same  Review and comments to proposed Hurwitz declaration	0.50 0.80 0.30 0.80 1.80 1.60 0.20 0.90 0.40 0.30 1.60 0.30 0.50	\$480.00 \$768.00 \$288.00 \$768.00 \$1,728.00 \$1,536.00 \$192.00 \$864.00 \$384.00 \$288.00 \$1,536.00 \$288.00 \$480.00
04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/16/2024 Safemoon 04/16/2024 Safemoon 04/17/2024 Safemoon 04/17/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Buyers representatives, L. Rooney re: APA issues  Telecon Squid Grow Joe, L. Rooney re: bid structure, pricing  Telecon L. Rooney re: sale process strategy  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Buyers representatives, L. Rooney re: operating assets and transition issues  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (Ostrow), L. Rooney re: updated APAs  Emails Foley (G. Goodman) re: token issues  Telecon L. Rooney re: bidder APA issues and structure  Telecon Bidder managment (L. Borsai and others), L. Rooney re: bid issues and structure  Review successful bidder notice  Review and comments to proposed Hurwitz declaration, telecons Foley re: same  Review and comments to proposed sale order  Review and comments to revised Hurwitz declaration  Telecons Foley, Trustee, L. Rooney re: crypto sale issues and strategy	0.50 0.80 0.30 0.80 1.80 1.60 0.20 0.90 0.40 0.30 1.60 0.30 0.50 1.20	\$480.00 \$768.00 \$288.00 \$768.00 \$1,728.00 \$1,536.00 \$192.00 \$864.00 \$384.00 \$288.00 \$1,536.00 \$288.00 \$480.00 \$1,152.00
04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/16/2024 Safemoon 04/17/2024 Safemoon 04/17/2024 Safemoon 04/17/2024 Safemoon 04/17/2024 Safemoon 04/17/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Buyers representatives, L. Rooney re: APA issues  Telecon Squid Grow Joe, L. Rooney re: bid structure, pricing  Telecon L. Rooney re: sale process strategy  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Buyers representatives, L. Rooney re: operating assets and transition issues  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (Ostrow), L. Rooney re: updated APAs  Emails Foley (G. Goodman) re: token issues  Telecon L. Rooney re: bidder APA issues and structure  Telecon Bidder managment (L. Borsai and others), L. Rooney re: bid issues and structure  Review successful bidder notice  Review and comments to proposed Hurwitz declaration, telecons Foley re: same  Review and comments to proposed sale order  Review and comments to revised Hurwitz declaration  Telecons Foley, Trustee, L. Rooney re: crypto sale issues and strategy  Telecon M. Dundon re: sale process declaration	0.50 0.80 0.30 0.80 1.80 1.60 0.20 0.90 0.40 0.30 1.60 0.30 0.50 1.20 0.50	\$480.00 \$768.00 \$288.00 \$768.00 \$1,728.00 \$1,536.00 \$192.00 \$864.00 \$384.00 \$288.00 \$1,536.00 \$288.00 \$480.00 \$1,152.00 \$480.00
04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/16/2024 Safemoon 04/16/2024 Safemoon 04/17/2024 Safemoon 04/17/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Buyers representatives, L. Rooney re: APA issues  Telecon Squid Grow Joe, L. Rooney re: bid structure, pricing  Telecon L. Rooney re: sale process strategy  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Buyers representatives, L. Rooney re: operating assets and transition issues  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (Ostrow), L. Rooney re: updated APAs  Emails Foley (G. Goodman) re: token issues  Telecon L. Rooney re: bidder APA issues and structure  Telecon Bidder managment (L. Borsai and others), L. Rooney re: bid issues and structure  Review successful bidder notice  Review and comments to proposed Hurwitz declaration, telecons Foley re: same  Review and comments to proposed sale order  Review and comments to revised Hurwitz declaration  Telecons Foley, Trustee, L. Rooney re: crypto sale issues and strategy	0.50 0.80 0.30 0.80 1.80 1.60 0.20 0.90 0.40 0.30 1.60 0.30 0.50 1.20	\$480.00 \$768.00 \$288.00 \$768.00 \$1,728.00 \$1,536.00 \$192.00 \$864.00 \$384.00 \$288.00 \$1,536.00 \$288.00 \$480.00 \$1,152.00
04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/16/2024 Safemoon 04/17/2024 Safemoon 04/17/2024 Safemoon 04/17/2024 Safemoon 04/17/2024 Safemoon 04/17/2024 Safemoon 04/17/2024 Safemoon 04/17/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Buyers representatives, L. Rooney re: APA issues  Telecon Squid Grow Joe, L. Rooney re: bid structure, pricing  Telecon L. Rooney re: sale process strategy  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Buyers representatives, L. Rooney re: operating assets and transition issues  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (Ostrow), L. Rooney re: updated APAs  Emails Foley (G. Goodman) re: token issues  Telecon L. Rooney re: bidder APA issues and structure  Telecon Bidder managment (L. Borsai and others), L. Rooney re: bid issues and structure  Review successful bidder notice  Review and comments to proposed Hurwitz declaration, telecons Foley re: same  Review and comments to proposed sale order  Review and comments to revised Hurwitz declaration  Telecons Foley, Trustee, L. Rooney re: crypto sale issues and strategy  Telecon M. Dundon re: sale process declaration  Telecon Foley, Trustee, L. Rooney re: sales process transfers	0.50 0.80 0.30 0.80 1.80 1.60 0.20 0.90 0.40 0.30 1.60 0.30 0.50 1.20 0.50 1.30	\$480.00 \$768.00 \$288.00 \$768.00 \$1,728.00 \$1,536.00 \$192.00 \$864.00 \$384.00 \$288.00 \$1,536.00 \$288.00 \$480.00 \$1,152.00 \$480.00 \$1,248.00
04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/16/2024 Safemoon 04/16/2024 Safemoon 04/17/2024 Safemoon 04/17/2024 Safemoon 04/17/2024 Safemoon 04/17/2024 Safemoon 04/17/2024 Safemoon 04/17/2024 Safemoon 04/17/2024 Safemoon 04/17/2024 Safemoon 04/17/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Buyers representatives, L. Rooney re: APA issues  Telecon Squid Grow Joe, L. Rooney re: bid structure, pricing  Telecon L. Rooney re: sale process strategy  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Buyers representatives, L. Rooney re: operating assets and transition issues  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (Ostrow), L. Rooney re: updated APAs  Emails Foley (G. Goodman) re: token issues  Telecon L. Rooney re: bidder APA issues and structure  Telecon Bidder managment (L. Borsai and others), L. Rooney re: bid issues and structure  Review successful bidder notice  Review and comments to proposed Hurwitz declaration, telecons Foley re: same  Review and comments to proposed Hurwitz declaration  Telecons Foley, Trustee, L. Rooney re: crypto sale issues and strategy  Telecon M. Dundon re: sale process declaration  Telecon Foley, Trustee, L. Rooney re: sales process transfers  Prepare for and participate in auction process for crypto tokens	0.50 0.80 0.30 0.80 1.80 1.60 0.20 0.90 0.40 0.30 1.60 0.30 0.50 1.20 0.50 1.30 3.50	\$480.00 \$768.00 \$288.00 \$768.00 \$1,728.00 \$1,536.00 \$192.00 \$864.00 \$384.00 \$288.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$1,152.00 \$480.00 \$1,248.00 \$3,360.00
04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/16/2024 Safemoon 04/16/2024 Safemoon 04/17/2024 Safemoon 04/17/2024 Safemoon 04/17/2024 Safemoon 04/17/2024 Safemoon 04/17/2024 Safemoon 04/17/2024 Safemoon 04/18/2024 Safemoon 04/18/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Buyers representatives, L. Rooney re: APA issues  Telecon Squid Grow Joe, L. Rooney re: bid structure, pricing  Telecon L. Rooney re: sale process strategy  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Buyers representatives, L. Rooney re: operating assets and transition issues  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (Ostrow), L. Rooney re: updated APAs  Emails Foley (G. Goodman) re: token issues  Telecon L. Rooney re: bidder APA issues and structure  Telecon Bidder managment (L. Borsai and others), L. Rooney re: bid issues and structure  Review successful bidder notice  Review and comments to proposed Hurwitz declaration, telecons Foley re: same  Review and comments to proposed Hurwitz declaration  Telecons Foley, Trustee, L. Rooney re: crypto sale issues and strategy  Telecon M. Dundon re: sale process declaration  Telecon Foley, Trustee, L. Rooney re: sales process transfers  Prepare for and participate in auction process for crypto tokens  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: portfolio sale	0.50 0.80 0.30 0.80 1.80 1.60 0.20 0.90 0.40 0.30 1.60 0.30 0.50 1.20 0.50 1.30 3.50 0.60	\$480.00 \$768.00 \$288.00 \$768.00 \$1,728.00 \$1,536.00 \$192.00 \$864.00 \$288.00 \$288.00 \$480.00 \$480.00 \$1,152.00 \$480.00 \$1,152.00 \$3,360.00 \$576.00
04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/12/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/15/2024 Safemoon 04/16/2024 Safemoon 04/17/2024 Safemoon 04/17/2024 Safemoon 04/17/2024 Safemoon 04/17/2024 Safemoon 04/17/2024 Safemoon 04/17/2024 Safemoon 04/18/2024 Safemoon 04/18/2024 Safemoon 04/18/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Buyers representatives, L. Rooney re: APA issues  Telecon Squid Grow Joe, L. Rooney re: bid structure, pricing  Telecon L. Rooney re: sale process strategy  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Buyers representatives, L. Rooney re: operating assets and transition issues  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (Ostrow), L. Rooney re: updated APAs  Emails Foley (G. Goodman) re: token issues  Telecon L. Rooney re: bidder APA issues and structure  Telecon Bidder managment (L. Borsai and others), L. Rooney re: bid issues and structure  Review successful bidder notice  Review and comments to proposed Hurwitz declaration, telecons Foley re: same  Review and comments to proposed Hurwitz declaration  Telecons Foley, Trustee, L. Rooney re: crypto sale issues and strategy  Telecon M. Dundon re: sale process declaration  Telecon Foley, Trustee, L. Rooney re: sales process transfers  Prepare for and participate in auction process for crypto tokens  Telecon Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: portfolio sale  Telecon Wintermute, L. Rooney re: bid issues and price structure	0.50 0.80 0.30 0.80 1.80  1.60 0.20 0.90 0.40 0.30 1.60 0.30 1.20 0.50 1.30 3.50 0.60	\$480.00 \$768.00 \$288.00 \$768.00 \$1,728.00 \$1,728.00 \$192.00 \$864.00 \$288.00 \$1,536.00 \$288.00 \$480.00 \$1,152.00 \$480.00 \$1,248.00 \$3,360.00 \$576.00

## Case 23-25749 Doc 242 Filed 12/06/24 Entered 12/06/24 10:36:02 Desc Main Document Page 34 of 34

04/22/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Buyer representatives, L. Rooney re: portfolio sale	0.40	\$384.00
04/23/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Prepare for sale hearing, telecons Foley, Trustee re: same	1.40	\$1,344.00
04/23/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Attend sale hearing	0.40	\$384.00
04/23/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), employees, L. Rooney re: planning for transfer of assets to proposed Buyer	0.50	\$445.00
04/23/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon L. Rooney re: planning for transfer of assets to proposed Buyer, review APA to confirm issues relating to same	0.90	\$801.00
04/24/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecons Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: sale issues	1.30	\$1,248.00
04/24/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Employess, Foley (G. Goodman), Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: sale issues	0.60	\$576.00
04/24/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon with buyers representatives, employees, Peter M. and Lee Rooney re: transition of assets	1.50	\$1,335.00
04/24/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), employees, L. Rooney re: planning for transfer of assets to proposed Buyer	1.00	\$890.00
04/24/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), Foley (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: transfer of assets to proposed Buyer	0.60	\$534.00
04/24/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: Buyer deposits	0.30	\$267.00
05/03/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon L. Rooney re: asset transfers	0.40	\$384.00
05/03/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Buyers representatives, Peter M., L. Rooney re: asset transfers	0.40	\$384.00
05/06/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Trustee (E. Ostrow), L. Rooney re: APA issues	0.40	\$384.00
05/13/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon E. Ostrow, G. Goodman, L. Rooney re: update on sales process and open follow up issues	0.60	\$534.00
05/14/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Telecon Les Borsai re: AWS and SEC issues follow up	0.50	\$445.00
05/30/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Email exchange Foley (G. Goodman) re: AWS transition issues, telecon Les Borsai re: same	0.80	\$768.00
		Totals Amounts for User Peter Hurwitz	90.30	\$85,981.00
		Totals/illiounistor osci i cici mai miz	30.30	703,301.00
Colin Breeze		Total of the state	30.30	\$83,581.00
Colin Breeze 01/31/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Call with team to discuss strategy and timing for monetization of SafeMoon assets	0.70	\$455.00
	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee			· /
01/31/2024 Safemoon	•	Call with team to discuss strategy and timing for monetization of SafeMoon assets  Prep for and participation in conference call to identify tactical approaches to SafeMoon	0.70	\$455.00
01/31/2024 Safemoon 02/01/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Call with team to discuss strategy and timing for monetization of SafeMoon assets  Prep for and participation in conference call to identify tactical approaches to SafeMoon engagement	0.70 1.70	\$455.00 \$1,105.00
01/31/2024 Safemoon 02/01/2024 Safemoon 02/02/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Call with team to discuss strategy and timing for monetization of SafeMoon assets  Prep for and participation in conference call to identify tactical approaches to SafeMoon engagement  Research and participation in conference calls with SafeMoon team and BK Trustee	0.70 1.70 3.20	\$455.00 \$1,105.00 \$2,080.00
01/31/2024 Safemoon 02/01/2024 Safemoon 02/02/2024 Safemoon 02/04/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Call with team to discuss strategy and timing for monetization of SafeMoon assets  Prep for and participation in conference call to identify tactical approaches to SafeMoon engagement  Research and participation in conference calls with SafeMoon team and BK Trustee  Review and revise marketing plan; correspondence with DA team re same	0.70 1.70 3.20 0.60	\$455.00 \$1,105.00 \$2,080.00 \$390.00
01/31/2024 Safemoon 02/01/2024 Safemoon 02/02/2024 Safemoon 02/04/2024 Safemoon 02/05/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee Chapter 7 Trustee	Call with team to discuss strategy and timing for monetization of SafeMoon assets  Prep for and participation in conference call to identify tactical approaches to SafeMoon engagement  Research and participation in conference calls with SafeMoon team and BK Trustee  Review and revise marketing plan; correspondence with DA team re same  Conference call w/Spraggs; conference call with DA team re tactical directions; research  Review list of potential bidders provided by SafeMoon team; research re additional potential	0.70 1.70 3.20 0.60 2.40	\$455.00 \$1,105.00 \$2,080.00 \$390.00 \$1,560.00
01/31/2024 Safemoon 02/01/2024 Safemoon 02/02/2024 Safemoon 02/04/2024 Safemoon 02/05/2024 Safemoon 02/06/2024 Safemoon 02/07/2024 Safemoon 02/08/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Call with team to discuss strategy and timing for monetization of SafeMoon assets Prep for and participation in conference call to identify tactical approaches to SafeMoon engagement Research and participation in conference calls with SafeMoon team and BK Trustee Review and revise marketing plan; correspondence with DA team re same Conference call w/Spraggs; conference call with DA team re tactical directions; research Review list of potential bidders provided by SafeMoon team; research re additional potential bidders Draft additions to potential bidder list following research of blockchain/web3.0 specialist investor firms Finalize list of crypto investors (strategic/financial) and review with DA team	0.70 1.70 3.20 0.60 2.40 0.90 1.20	\$455.00 \$1,105.00 \$2,080.00 \$390.00 \$1,560.00 \$585.00 \$780.00
01/31/2024 Safemoon 02/01/2024 Safemoon 02/02/2024 Safemoon 02/04/2024 Safemoon 02/05/2024 Safemoon 02/06/2024 Safemoon 02/07/2024 Safemoon 02/08/2024 Safemoon 02/09/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Call with team to discuss strategy and timing for monetization of SafeMoon assets Prep for and participation in conference call to identify tactical approaches to SafeMoon engagement Research and participation in conference calls with SafeMoon team and BK Trustee Review and revise marketing plan; correspondence with DA team re same Conference call w/Spraggs; conference call with DA team re tactical directions; research Review list of potential bidders provided by SafeMoon team; research re additional potential bidders Draft additions to potential bidder list following research of blockchain/web3.0 specialist investor firms Finalize list of crypto investors (strategic/financial) and review with DA team Discuss list of strategic/financial investors with DA team; conference call re same	0.70 1.70 3.20 0.60 2.40 0.90 1.20 1.10	\$455.00 \$1,105.00 \$2,080.00 \$390.00 \$1,560.00 \$585.00 \$780.00 \$715.00 \$1,105.00
01/31/2024 Safemoon 02/01/2024 Safemoon 02/02/2024 Safemoon 02/04/2024 Safemoon 02/05/2024 Safemoon 02/06/2024 Safemoon 02/07/2024 Safemoon 02/08/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Call with team to discuss strategy and timing for monetization of SafeMoon assets Prep for and participation in conference call to identify tactical approaches to SafeMoon engagement Research and participation in conference calls with SafeMoon team and BK Trustee Review and revise marketing plan; correspondence with DA team re same Conference call w/Spraggs; conference call with DA team re tactical directions; research Review list of potential bidders provided by SafeMoon team; research re additional potential bidders Draft additions to potential bidder list following research of blockchain/web3.0 specialist investor firms Finalize list of crypto investors (strategic/financial) and review with DA team	0.70 1.70 3.20 0.60 2.40 0.90 1.20	\$455.00 \$1,105.00 \$2,080.00 \$390.00 \$1,560.00 \$585.00 \$780.00 \$715.00 \$1,105.00 \$585.00
01/31/2024 Safemoon 02/01/2024 Safemoon 02/02/2024 Safemoon 02/04/2024 Safemoon 02/05/2024 Safemoon 02/06/2024 Safemoon 02/07/2024 Safemoon 02/08/2024 Safemoon 02/09/2024 Safemoon 02/10/2024 Safemoon 02/10/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Call with team to discuss strategy and timing for monetization of SafeMoon assets Prep for and participation in conference call to identify tactical approaches to SafeMoon engagement Research and participation in conference calls with SafeMoon team and BK Trustee Review and revise marketing plan; correspondence with DA team re same Conference call w/Spraggs; conference call with DA team re tactical directions; research Review list of potential bidders provided by SafeMoon team; research re additional potential bidders Draft additions to potential bidder list following research of blockchain/web3.0 specialist investor firms Finalize list of crypto investors (strategic/financial) and review with DA team Discuss list of strategic/financial investors with DA team; conference call re same Review and comment on SafeMoon products teaser presentation; review SafeMoon expenses (AWS) Conference call to review product presentation and marketing assets	0.70 1.70 3.20 0.60 2.40 0.90 1.20 1.10 1.70 0.90 1.80	\$455.00 \$1,105.00 \$2,080.00 \$390.00 \$1,560.00 \$585.00 \$715.00 \$1,105.00 \$585.00 \$1,170.00
01/31/2024 Safemoon 02/01/2024 Safemoon 02/02/2024 Safemoon 02/04/2024 Safemoon 02/05/2024 Safemoon 02/06/2024 Safemoon 02/07/2024 Safemoon 02/08/2024 Safemoon 02/09/2024 Safemoon 02/10/2024 Safemoon 02/12/2024 Safemoon 02/12/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Call with team to discuss strategy and timing for monetization of SafeMoon assets Prep for and participation in conference call to identify tactical approaches to SafeMoon engagement Research and participation in conference calls with SafeMoon team and BK Trustee Review and revise marketing plan; correspondence with DA team re same Conference call w/Spraggs; conference call with DA team re tactical directions; research Review list of potential bidders provided by SafeMoon team; research re additional potential bidders Draft additions to potential bidder list following research of blockchain/web3.0 specialist investor firms Finalize list of crypto investors (strategic/financial) and review with DA team Discuss list of strategic/financial investors with DA team; conference call re same Review and comment on SafeMoon products teaser presentation; review SafeMoon expenses (AWS) Conference call to review product presentation and marketing assets Review memecoin projects and contact details with PM	0.70 1.70 3.20 0.60 2.40 0.90 1.20 1.10 1.70 0.90 1.80 0.80	\$455.00 \$1,105.00 \$2,080.00 \$390.00 \$1,560.00 \$585.00 \$715.00 \$1,105.00 \$585.00 \$1,107.00 \$585.00 \$1,107.00 \$585.00
01/31/2024 Safemoon 02/01/2024 Safemoon 02/02/2024 Safemoon 02/04/2024 Safemoon 02/05/2024 Safemoon 02/06/2024 Safemoon 02/07/2024 Safemoon 02/08/2024 Safemoon 02/10/2024 Safemoon 02/12/2024 Safemoon 02/12/2024 Safemoon 02/14/2024 Safemoon 02/19/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Call with team to discuss strategy and timing for monetization of SafeMoon assets Prep for and participation in conference call to identify tactical approaches to SafeMoon engagement Research and participation in conference calls with SafeMoon team and BK Trustee Review and revise marketing plan; correspondence with DA team re same Conference call w/Spraggs; conference call with DA team re tactical directions; research Review list of potential bidders provided by SafeMoon team; research re additional potential bidders Draft additions to potential bidder list following research of blockchain/web3.0 specialist investor firms Finalize list of crypto investors (strategic/financial) and review with DA team Discuss list of strategic/financial investors with DA team; conference call re same Review and comment on SafeMoon products teaser presentation; review SafeMoon expenses (AWS) Conference call to review product presentation and marketing assets Review memecoin projects and contact details with PM Conference call With SquidGrow/Joe and DA team; follow up with DA team	0.70 1.70 3.20 0.60 2.40 0.90 1.20 1.10 1.70 0.90 1.80 0.80	\$455.00 \$1,105.00 \$2,080.00 \$390.00 \$1,560.00 \$585.00 \$715.00 \$1,105.00 \$585.00 \$1,170.00 \$520.00 \$1,105.00
01/31/2024 Safemoon 02/01/2024 Safemoon 02/02/2024 Safemoon 02/04/2024 Safemoon 02/05/2024 Safemoon 02/06/2024 Safemoon 02/07/2024 Safemoon 02/09/2024 Safemoon 02/10/2024 Safemoon 02/12/2024 Safemoon 02/12/2024 Safemoon 02/14/2024 Safemoon 02/19/2024 Safemoon 02/19/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Call with team to discuss strategy and timing for monetization of SafeMoon assets Prep for and participation in conference call to identify tactical approaches to SafeMoon engagement Research and participation in conference calls with SafeMoon team and BK Trustee Review and revise marketing plan; correspondence with DA team re same Conference call w/Spraggs; conference call with DA team re tactical directions; research Review list of potential bidders provided by SafeMoon team; research re additional potential bidders Draft additions to potential bidder list following research of blockchain/web3.0 specialist investor firms Finalize list of crypto investors (strategic/financial) and review with DA team Discuss list of strategic/financial investors with DA team; conference call re same Review and comment on SafeMoon products teaser presentation; review SafeMoon expenses (AWS) Conference call to review product presentation and marketing assets Review memecoin projects and contact details with PM Conference call With SquidGrow/Joe and DA team; follow up with DA team Review and comment on marketing messaging	0.70 1.70 3.20 0.60 2.40 0.90 1.20 1.10 1.70 0.90 1.80 0.80	\$455.00 \$1,105.00 \$2,080.00 \$390.00 \$1,560.00 \$585.00 \$715.00 \$1,105.00 \$585.00 \$1,170.00 \$520.00 \$1,105.00 \$520.00
01/31/2024 Safemoon 02/01/2024 Safemoon 02/02/2024 Safemoon 02/04/2024 Safemoon 02/05/2024 Safemoon 02/06/2024 Safemoon 02/07/2024 Safemoon 02/08/2024 Safemoon 02/10/2024 Safemoon 02/12/2024 Safemoon 02/12/2024 Safemoon 02/14/2024 Safemoon 02/19/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Call with team to discuss strategy and timing for monetization of SafeMoon assets Prep for and participation in conference call to identify tactical approaches to SafeMoon engagement Research and participation in conference calls with SafeMoon team and BK Trustee Review and revise marketing plan; correspondence with DA team re same Conference call w/Spraggs; conference call with DA team re tactical directions; research Review list of potential bidders provided by SafeMoon team; research re additional potential bidders Draft additions to potential bidder list following research of blockchain/web3.0 specialist investor firms Finalize list of crypto investors (strategic/financial) and review with DA team Discuss list of strategic/financial investors with DA team; conference call re same Review and comment on SafeMoon products teaser presentation; review SafeMoon expenses (AWS) Conference call to review product presentation and marketing assets Review memecoin projects and contact details with PM Conference call With SquidGrow/Joe and DA team; follow up with DA team Review and comment on marketing messaging Confer with team re potential VC/strategic investors	0.70 1.70 3.20 0.60 2.40 0.90 1.20 1.10 1.70 0.90 1.80 0.80 1.70 0.80	\$455.00 \$1,105.00 \$2,080.00 \$390.00 \$1,560.00 \$585.00 \$715.00 \$1,105.00 \$585.00 \$1,170.00 \$520.00 \$520.00 \$650.00
01/31/2024 Safemoon 02/01/2024 Safemoon 02/02/2024 Safemoon 02/04/2024 Safemoon 02/05/2024 Safemoon 02/06/2024 Safemoon 02/07/2024 Safemoon 02/09/2024 Safemoon 02/10/2024 Safemoon 02/12/2024 Safemoon 02/12/2024 Safemoon 02/14/2024 Safemoon 02/19/2024 Safemoon 02/19/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Call with team to discuss strategy and timing for monetization of SafeMoon assets Prep for and participation in conference call to identify tactical approaches to SafeMoon engagement Research and participation in conference calls with SafeMoon team and BK Trustee Review and revise marketing plan; correspondence with DA team re same Conference call w/Spraggs; conference call with DA team re tactical directions; research Review list of potential bidders provided by SafeMoon team; research re additional potential bidders Draft additions to potential bidder list following research of blockchain/web3.0 specialist investor firms Finalize list of crypto investors (strategic/financial) and review with DA team Discuss list of strategic/financial investors with DA team; conference call re same Review and comment on SafeMoon products teaser presentation; review SafeMoon expenses (AWS) Conference call to review product presentation and marketing assets Review memecoin projects and contact details with PM Conference call With SquidGrow/Joe and DA team; follow up with DA team Review and comment on marketing messaging Confer with team re potential VC/strategic investors Totals Amounts for User Colin Breeze	0.70 1.70 3.20 0.60 2.40 0.90 1.20 1.10 1.70 0.90 1.80 0.80 1.70 0.80 1.00 20.50	\$455.00 \$1,105.00 \$2,080.00 \$390.00 \$1,560.00 \$585.00 \$715.00 \$1,105.00 \$585.00 \$1,170.00 \$520.00 \$520.00 \$550.00 \$13,325.00
01/31/2024 Safemoon 02/01/2024 Safemoon 02/02/2024 Safemoon 02/04/2024 Safemoon 02/05/2024 Safemoon 02/06/2024 Safemoon 02/07/2024 Safemoon 02/09/2024 Safemoon 02/10/2024 Safemoon 02/12/2024 Safemoon 02/12/2024 Safemoon 02/14/2024 Safemoon 02/19/2024 Safemoon 02/19/2024 Safemoon	Chapter 7 Trustee	Call with team to discuss strategy and timing for monetization of SafeMoon assets Prep for and participation in conference call to identify tactical approaches to SafeMoon engagement Research and participation in conference calls with SafeMoon team and BK Trustee Review and revise marketing plan; correspondence with DA team re same Conference call w/Spraggs; conference call with DA team re tactical directions; research Review list of potential bidders provided by SafeMoon team; research re additional potential bidders Draft additions to potential bidder list following research of blockchain/web3.0 specialist investor firms Finalize list of crypto investors (strategic/financial) and review with DA team Discuss list of strategic/financial investors with DA team; conference call re same Review and comment on SafeMoon products teaser presentation; review SafeMoon expenses (AWS) Conference call to review product presentation and marketing assets Review memecoin projects and contact details with PM Conference call With SquidGrow/Joe and DA team; follow up with DA team Review and comment on marketing messaging Confer with team re potential VC/strategic investors	0.70 1.70 3.20 0.60 2.40 0.90 1.20 1.10 1.70 0.90 1.80 0.80 1.70 0.80	\$455.00 \$1,105.00 \$2,080.00 \$390.00 \$1,560.00 \$585.00 \$715.00 \$1,105.00 \$585.00 \$1,170.00 \$520.00 \$520.00 \$650.00